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Abstract 
 

In this research a study is done on an additional service that has occurred within photography 
museums last decades: the activity of selling photography editions within the museum. This 
activity is an arts marketing strategy that expands the total museum experience at the museum 
for the visitors. Arts marketing strategies serve as a method for the museum to create a supply 
that can meet the consumers demand. So to research this activity, an analysis on both the 
supply side and the demand side is done. First, the supply side is researched to determine the 
strategies to add this service to the total museum experience. This is done by a qualitative 
study where semi-structured interviews were held with three photography museums 
performing the activity of a sales gallery: FOAM in Amsterdam, the Photographers’ Gallery 
in London and the House of Photography in Hamburg. Secondly, the demand for this activity 
is researched in two museums: FOAM and the House of Photography, to find out what the 
opinion is of the visitors about this addition of a sales gallery to the total museum experience. 
From both studies it can be concluded that museums perform this activity of a sales gallery to 
generate extra incomes for the museum and to extend the total museum experience for its 
visitors. Respondents of the surveys agree that this could be a successful addition to the total 
museum experience. To perform successfully, the sales gallery has to be developed as a well-
rounded service of which all marketing components need to be synergized to prevent that 
visitors do not understand the concept. Additionally, these components need to be adjusted to 
create different experiences, for example educational experiences and engaging experiences 
in order to get the visitors participating actively in collecting photography. 

 

 

Keywords: arts marketing, museum, sales gallery, strategy, cultural entrepreneurship, 
photography, total museum experience, supply, demand 
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1 Introduction 
 

 “Please buy that is why you’re here!”1 

 

Recent decades, photography has grown into a highly popular art form (Bollee, 2013). Since 
the invention of this medium in the 19th century its status as art developed and obtained a new 
role within the art museum (Stallabrass, 2010). It changed the content of the collections of art 
museums, which now include photographs and it has caused the rise of the museum 
specialized in photography. First photography appeared only as a department of the larger art 
museums (Dixon, 2001; Vogel, 2013). They organized photographic exhibitions that 
increased the public awareness for photography and the value for different periods and 
individual photographers. This improved the understanding of photography as an art form. 
Subsequently, the museum specialized in photography art emerged all over the world. For 
example the Photographers’ Gallery was founded in London in 1971 and the International 
Centre of Photography in New York in 1974. Soon others followed such as the Museum of 
Contemporary Photography in Chicago in 1984, the FoMu Antwerp in 1986, Photomuseum 
Winterthur in 1993, Huis Marseille in Amsterdam in 1999 and the House of Photography, 
Hamburg in 2005.  

The museum sector has experienced many issues to maintain their traditional roles of 
institutions that serve to collect, conserve, research and exhibit societies’ material culture 
while adjusting to new environmental changes. The invention of photography is an example 
of these changes. In this research a study is done on an additional service that has occurred 
within photography museums last decades: the activity of selling photography editions within 
the museum. This activity is part of the visitors’ experience the museum offers, which 
consists of a bundle of services that can be influenced by many additional services 
surrounding the item, such as a restaurant or a guided tour (Towse, 2010). This addition of a 
sales gallery to the visitors’ experience looks like a repositioning of the museum, as a new 
marketing strategy to expand the museums’ function with a new consumption activity and it 
signals a fading of the gallery and museum function.  

Museums are mechanisms for interpreting, conserving, displaying and researching heritage 
(Towse, 2003). From a cultural economic perspective museums can be viewed as multiple 
productive firms; they produce a mix of outputs that are valued by others. This can be 
explained by the demand and supply theory. The supply theory of a firm represents various 
factors such as labor, materials, capital and other inputs that are combined to produce various 
quantities of output. The demand theory analyses the choices of consumers considering the 
prices of goods and services, consumers’ incomes and their tastes and preferences. For a 
museum the challenge lies in taking into account its mission and its objectives, while using 

1 (Krijnen, as cited from Bollee, 2013. p. 9) 
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theoretical and practical tools of marketing to analyze the existing visitors and potential 
visitors in order to provide the best considered service as an organization and to attract an 
audience (Luksetich & Partridge, 1997). Museums adapt according to demand and supply 
side changes and because of new technological, information and communication possibilities 
(Johnson & Barry, 1998). This provides new opportunities for innovation and new operations 
in the museum sector (Towse, 2003).  

The use of arts marketing strategies has become more and more important for the museum 
sector (Rentschler, Radbourne, Carr & Rickard, 2002). Museums, for example, may choose 
to develop a strategic arts marketing orientation to find new sources of revenues. Arts 
marketing serves as a method for the museum to create a supply that can meet the consumers 
demand. A definition of arts marketing can be described as followed: “Arts marketing is an 
integrated management process which sees mutually satisfying exchange relationships with 
customers as the route to achieving organizational and artistic objectives.” (Hill, O’Sullivan 
& O’Sullivan, 2003, p. 1). Linking demand and supply can shed light on the changing nature 
of cultural organizations (Tufts & Milne, 1999). Hence an analysis of arts marketing 
activities of museums can be covered best by a supply study and a demand study, respecting 
Hill’s definition of arts marketing (Hill et al., 2003). Many studies already have been done on 
new marketing strategies for museums (Rentschler et al., 2002). However, empirical linkages 
between specific strategies and its performance are missing (Tufts & Milne, 1999). 
Additionally, a gap in academic literature exists in research that has been done specifically on 
photography museums and on the specific activity arts marketing strategy of a sales gallery.  

To get better insight in the arts marketing strategy of a sales gallery within the museum our 
study researches three organizations. Respecting the definition of arts marketing mentioned 
earlier, an analysis of this activity on both the supply side and the demand side is done. First, 
the supply side of three museums is researched to determine the strategies to add this service 
to the total museum experience. Secondly, the demand for this activity is researched in two 
museums, to find out what the opinion is of the visitors about this addition of a sales gallery 
to the total museum experience. The objective is to link the supply side with the demand side 
to get insight in whether some characteristics and aspects of this marketing strategy can be 
considered effective for the museums. Furthermore it will also be possible to compare both 
strategies and responds from the visitors. The research question can thus be formulated as:  
To what extent is a sales gallery within photography museums an effective arts marketing 
strategy in terms of the total museum experience viewed from a supply and demand 
perspective? 

To understand both the supply side and the demand side different strategies seem most 
appropriate, therefore a mixed methods approach is used. A qualitative research is done to get 
information on the arts marketing strategies of the sales galleries on the supply side. This 
research has been done in the form of semi-structured interviews. For the qualitative part the 
following research question is answered: What are the arts marketing strategies considering 
the total museum experience of photography museums to add this activity of a sales gallery to 
the museum? The second part of two out of three cases is a quantitative study. In this part the 
demand for this activity is researched. This is done with surveys, which are handed out to 
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existing visitors of the museums. The aim of the quantitative part is to answer the question: 
How do the visitors of photography museums perceive the arts marketing strategy activity of 
a sales gallery within the total museum experience? The information of both parts is used to 
answer the main question of the research from both supply and demand perspectives. An 
extensive explanation of the used research methods is explained in the methodology chapter 
(4). 

The photography museums that are studied in this research are FOAM in Amsterdam, the 
Photographers’ Gallery in London and the House of Photography in Hamburg. FOAM was 
founded in 2001 in Amsterdam; it has a reach of 200.000 visitors every year, which makes it 
the largest photography museum in Amsterdam and the Netherlands (Lamoree, 2013). Their 
subtitle and mission is comprised with the words: “All about photography”, which means that 
they want to engage people with photography in all kind of forms (FOAM, n.d.). Its budget is 
around €3.000.000, - every year of which 85% is generated out of own income; other 
incomes are from subsidies of the city of Amsterdam. It has its own collection that exists of 
approximately 500 photographs. The Photographers’ Gallery was founded in 1971 and was 
the first museum in the United Kingdom completely devoted to photography 
(www.thephotographersgallery.org.uk). It has over half a million visitors every year, which 
make them the largest museum for photography in London. Its main goal is to encourage and 
support a varied and distinctive engagement with photography. Its budget is around 
£4.000.000, -. It is subsidized by the Arts Council England with approximately £900.000, - 
every year (www.theartscouncil.org.uk; www.thephotographersgallery.org.uk). The rest has 
to be fundraised by other trusts and foundations or generated from own incomes. The 
Photographers Gallery does not have its own collection. Unfortunately the Photographers’ 
Gallery did not allow conducting a demand study; therefore in this case only the supply side 
is researched. The third museum is the House of Photography in Hamburg that opened in 
2005 (www.deichtorhallen.de). The House of Photography describes its purpose to present 
temporary exhibitions on photography, from historical positions of the 19th and 20th 
centuries to contemporary young photography and to show the aspects of the digital 
revolution of the media itself. Together with the Hall for Contemporary Art and the 
Falckenberg Collection in Harburg it is part of the overall organization the Deichtorhallen. 
The Deichtorhallen is a subsidiary organization of the Freien und Hansestadt Hamburg. It is 
subsidized by the government with €1.400.000, - every year and 70% of its incomes is 
generated by themselves (Rechnungshof Freie und Hansestadt Hamburg, 2013). It owns the 
Falckenberg collection, which includes more than 2.000 artworks. Additionally, it has two 
collections permanent on loan from the city of Hamburg: the Spiegel Archive and the F.C. 
Gundlach Collection. The Deichtorhallen attract around 200.000 visitors every year. All three 
museums perform the activity of selling photography editions within the museum.  

The first part of the research is a literature review considering the existing theories on this 
topic from a cultural economic viewpoint. This is divided in three chapters, chapter two will 
examine the theories about the roles and functions of museums from a cultural economic 
perspective and will focus especially on the development of the photography museum. The 
challenges museums face nowadays are described to get an overview of what the current 
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environment is in which the museums perform their activities. The third chapter explains the 
theory of supply and demand and gives a brief history and development of the concept of arts 
marketing applied to museums. Chapter four expounds the concept of the total museum 
experience. Then the empirical part of the thesis follows: in chapter five the research 
questions, methodology, sampling procedure, interview design and questionnaire design are 
described. In chapter six the results of the qualitative part are presented with the use of a 
coding system and commentary is given. In chapter seven the survey results are presented 
through charts and comments. Chapter eight provides a comparison of the qualitative and 
quantitative findings and conclusions are drawn. Limitations of the research are presented, 
and recommendations are given for two museums on what can be improved considering their 
strategies. 
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2 The Museum  
 

“… [O]ne can assert with confidence that the most fundamental change that has affected 
museums…is the now almost universal conviction that they exist in order to serve the public. 
The old-style museum felt itself to be under no such obligation (…) The museums’ prime 
responsibility was to its collections, not to its visitors.”2 

 

Nowadays museums are not cold, unfriendly, silence and quiet institutions anymore, they are 
growing more and more into popular leisure time attractions, where culture and commerce 
are combined (Johnson & Thomas, 1998). For long museums were not a priority area for 
economists and museums itself did not show any interest for commercial activities. Recent 
years however, a much greater interest into the economics of museums is evident and a clear 
role for economics is apparent in dealing with different economic features such as costs and 
efficiency of different outputs of the museum. Museums have developed into complex 
institutions that have much more to offer than just the art objects. New and developed 
services are provided which complement the function of the museum.  

In this chapter the context of the museum is described from an economic approach. First the 
traditional role of the museum is explained and which economic features it contains. The 
differences and similarities they have compared with commercial organizations are discussed 
as well. Then we focus on the development of the museum specialized in photography. At 
last, the developments and challenges are examined with which museums deal nowadays and 
this explains why an economic approach might be useful for these organizations.  

 

2.1 Museums from a cultural economic perspective 
 

Traditionally the museum is defined as a cultural organization which “serves to collect, 
conserve, research, interpret and exhibit societies’ material culture”. Museums therefore have 
multiple functions (Weil, 1990, p. 57-59). This makes museums complex institutions that 
offer a diversified output. This output, as Hutter describes, can be divided in three separate 
segments: the maintenance, documentation and expansion of the collection; the display 
services; and the distinct service offers and add-on products (1998). The multiple outputs of 
museums have several economic features (Towse, 2010). The output of museums has some 
public good features, for example the consumption of an artwork displayed is non-rivalry (up 
to a certain capacity) (Towse, 2010). And the output of a museum can create externalities. 
Externalities are the differences between social and private costs and benefits, and these 

2 (Hudson, 1998, p. 43) 
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cannot always be measured easily (Towse, 2010). As Johnson and Thomas describe, the most 
obvious output a museum offers is the visitor experience (1998). This visitor experience is 
not only the viewing and confrontation with artworks, moreover everything surrounding the 
visit such as the parking, the building and the shops are part of this too.  

For the production of the multiple outputs, different kinds of input are necessary (Hutter, 
1998). Overall they can be divided into capital input and labor input. The capital input is the 
collection of works of art, the building and various kinds of hardware. A museum requires 
many diversified staff, like the organizations’ directors, guards and restoration experts, hence 
the labor input is very high. An extensive part of costs of the museum is fixed because of the 
high capital and labor input (Towse, 2003). These costs are financed by the museums’ 
incomes, which are generated in three major forms: income generated from add-on goods, 
admission tickets for the display services, endowments and public funding (Hutter, 1998).  

Most museums are non–profit organizations; this entails that their main objective is to offer 
services and goods for non-commercial purposes (Towse, 2010). Furthermore the directors 
do not own the organization, or do not have economic interest that can be sold to other firms 
or individuals (Towse, 2003). If profits are made, they have to be re-invested in the 
organization in alignment with its mission. This causes that the organizations lack the 
possibility to raise financial resources as profit-making businesses can and that they do not 
have the maximization of profit as their objective (Feldstein, 1991). Consequently, 
performance measurement for museums cannot be covered by the profit-indicator (Mottner & 
Ford, 2005; Weil, 2002). The measurement of performance should be in terms of 
effectiveness, which reflects the overall strategy and objectives of the non-profit organization 
(Pearce, 1991). 

Normally museums have a mission to present artistic products or services, and additionally 
they have an educational, scientific, historical or aesthetic mission to serve the public (Kolb, 
2005; Kotler & Kotler, 2000). The artistic product or service is produced by an individual 
artist, and must therefore remain true to the vision of the artist. A museum can therefore not 
completely adjust the product for the marketplace. To manage this combination, the 
management must examine the nature of the missions’ strength and the markets’ strength and 
how these two relate to each other in theory and in practice (Ames, 1988). This is one of the 
major strategic challenges for museums, to balance the economic issues and constraints of the 
market with the importance of meeting the artistic and cultural mission (Hume, Sullivan, 
Mort & Winzar, 2007). 

To find this successful balance, the museums management must set goals. The activity of a 
sales gallery is an example of a strategic activity the museum performs in order to reach 
different goals. These goals have to reflect a combination of the mission: knowledge of the 
museums’ strengths and weaknesses, research regarding the visitors the museum seeks to 
serve and the competitive environment in which the museum exists (Kotler & Kotler, 2000). 
Goals ultimately have to reflect the interests and needs of consumers. The relation of a 
museum to its audience is an exchange relationship: visitors derive benefits from museums 
and at the same time incur certain costs (in time, convenience and expenses) by participating 
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in museums; and museums derive benefits from the public like revenue, donations and 
political support. Goals are interrelated, forming part of a larger pattern of activity, and, 
therefore, have to be determined as part of a broader strategic framework. Strategies occur in 
a given period of time and reveal how an organization can reach its goals (Kotler & Kotler, 
2000). Strategy is thus creating a set of activities that fit together and match with the mission 
of the organization. The success of a strategy depends on integrating these activities and on 
doing them well. This can be done for example with strategic positioning: choosing to 
perform activities differently or to perform different activities than its rivals (Porter, 1995). 
The essence of the strategic framework is, as Porter describes, the activities an organization 
chooses to perform (1995).  

Kotler and Kotler have described a set of three strategic categories for museums by which 
they can successfully reach their goals and objectives (2000). These three strategies are 
audience goals, product goals and organizational / competitive goals. The first will have an 
impact on the museums’ audience and applies to goals like audience growth, membership 
growth and donor growth. The second strategy is about the products it offers, this can be 
improved by offering more and improved programs, services and with the building itself. The 
third strategy is about the goals of the organization and its competitive goals. This strategy 
concerns being consumer centered, to increase own incomes, to generate collaborations and 
partnerships and by image building. The division of these three strategic goals is an analytical 
tool. This set of goals are all interrelated and influence each other, which brings us back to 
the statement of Porter that all activities must be integrated with each other to be successful. 

 

2.2 The photography museum 
 

In this research the focus is on photography museums. Photography is a relatively new 
medium that evolved out of technological innovations around the middle of the 19th century 
(Wellz, 1997). The medium developed rapidly and it diversified its application for multiple 
purposes such as science, medicine and documentation (Ward, Ward, Marien Warner, Moor 
& Moor, 2014). Ever since its invention the discussion exists on its relationship to the arts. 
One of the main differences compared with paintings and sculptures is that the photograph 
can be reproduced. It is therefore possible to have multiple versions of the art work; these 
multiple versions are termed editions. This is one of the reasons that it took a while for 
photography to be accepted and represented as an autonomous artistic medium within 
museums. New technological developments and methods, such as digitalization, are 
constantly changing the possibilities of photography. Hence the opinion on its aesthetics, 
quality and artistic value is continually in progress.  

The early exhibitions of photography concerned the technological advantages of photographs 
useful for documentation or scientific purposes. They mostly showed the history of the 
medium and its possibilities. The Museum of Fine Arts in Boston and MoMA in New York 
were one of the first museums to present photographs as object of aesthetic attention and 
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created their first photography departments within the museum, respectively in 1927 and 
1940 (Vogel, 2013; Wellz, 1997). They showed photographs within the gallery space and 
appreciated them as objects of scholarship and connoisseurship. Soon the New York Public 
Library created a Department of Photography, likewise the Victoria and Albert Museum in 
London created a collection of photographs and classified them under individual 
photographers (Wells, 1997). In 1949 the house of George Eastman, founder of Kodak, was 
transformed into a museum of the history of photography and the Folkwang Museum in 
Germany added a photography department in 1959. Since then, numerous different types of 
photographical institutions developed that vary in approach, size and structure.  

As a result, many different types of photography museums exist. To get an overview, these 
can be divided in four categories. The first category is the museum focused on the technology 
of photography; this includes exhibitions with collections of cameras. An example is the 
Swiss Camera Museum at Vevey. The second category is a museum created around an 
individual photographer or establishment, such as the Alinari Foundation in Florence, or the 
Cartier-Bresson Foundation in Paris. A third category is the art museum that incorporates a 
department specialized in artistic photography. As explained before, the MoMA and the 
Victoria & Albert Museum are early examples. Many others followed, such as the 
Metropolitan Museum and the Musee d’Orsay. In the Netherlands for example, until 1999 
photography was represented in the Dutch art museums as a department, of which the 
Stedelijk Museum and the Rijksmuseum had the most developed photography departments 
(Lamoree, 2013). A fourth category is the museum dedicated to the history of the medium, 
exhibited are the technical, sociological, cultural and artistic aspects since its invention until 
present. An example is the George Eastman House, which is mentioned before.  

During the 70’s and the 80’s the interest in artistic photography in general increased, 
consequently the nature of photography in museums changed (Wellz, 1997). The museum 
dedicated to photography and to all its technological, sociological, cultural and artistic 
aspects started to focus mainly on the artistic aspects of photography. Many new museums of 
this type arose, such as the Photographers’ Gallery in London, the Impressions Gallery in 
New York and the Stills Gallery in Edinburgh. In the Netherlands for example, the 
photography museum Huis Marseille opened in 1999, in 2001 FOAM followed and one year 
later Fotomuseum Rotterdam opened. Many art museums developed an affiliated museum 
specialized in photography connected to the main museum. Examples are the Fotomuseum in 
the Hague that opened in 2002, the House of Photography Hamburg, which is part of the 
Deichtorhallen since 2005 or the Fotografiska Museet in Stockholm which is founded in 2010 
and is connected to the Moderna Museet. Internationally the museum specialized in 
photography, affiliated to an art museum or not, is now a common phenomenon.  

For our research it is relevant to understand that the photography museum came into 
existence in conjunction with the technological development of the medium itself. 
Photography has multiple purposes, therefore photography museums can focus on different 
aspects of the medium. Additionally, photography allows not having one unique artwork, but 
editions, therefore the museum has to deal with different conservation and collection 
methods. It is important to keep in mind the numerous different types of photographical 
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institutions that exist nowadays and how they vary in approach, size and structure. These 
institutions can focus on providing information on the historical development of the medium 
and the different techniques and accomplishments of the past. Furthermore, they can focus on 
exhibiting contemporary artists and make the public aware of the artistic aspect of 
photography. And since photography has grown into a highly popular art form, the number of 
museums specialized in photography has expanded worldwide.  

 

2.3 Recent developments and challenges for museums 
 

Now that we have a concise outline of the main economic features of the museum that are of 
importance for our research and we have discussed the development of the photography 
museum, we continue with the challenges and changes museums face nowadays. These are 
caused by several factors, which museums take into account while managing their 
organizations and in determining the right strategy and setting the right goals (DiMaggio, 
1986). One of these factors is that patrons of the arts are changing and have developed into 
more formally structured organizations, such as governments, corporations and foundations, 
and these organizations require a formal accountability (Tobelem, 1998). Furthermore, state-
coordinated spending and public funding has declined recent years, forcing museums to re-
evaluate their traditional practices and to generate more and new financial incomes (Hutter, 
1998; Tobelem, 1998; Tufts &Milne, 1999). A need to generate and show the visitation 
figures to either justify government funding and to remain financially stable has grown (Cole, 
2008).  

These policies and targets result in a shift in the focus of museums towards audience 
development: encouraging more visits by returning visitors and to attract new groups of 
visitors (Slater, 2010). These new patrons ask for new, socially diverse audiences, or 
activities to attract new and differentiated audiences (Kawashima, 1998). It is expected that 
museums are reaching out for groups of people who are infrequent visitors. The museum 
becomes more people-oriented, to place public service at the core of its educative mission, 
and to realize this goal through strategies that reflect the needs and preferences of the current 
and potential audience (Cole, 2008). Therefore research methods have developed to gain 
more information from the visitor. Museums are focusing on improving the visitor 
experience, to find out what the visitors’ needs and motivations are and to enhance the quality 
of the visits and to develop the experience (Kawashima, 1998; Tobelem, 1998).  

A consequence of this broadened audience focus is that the number of consumers for culture 
and arts has increased. These new groups of visitors ask for a blurring of boundaries of high 
and popular culture and they want to be entertained (Kolb, 2005). As Tobelem explains, 
nowadays museums are complex organizations with many activities (1998). They have 
developed into important providers of visitor attractions and produce many activities, such as 
temporary exhibitions, educational programs and publications (Johnson & Thomas, 1998). 
The museum provides sociable, recreational and participatory experiences that redirect the 
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traditional and singular focus on collections and exhibitions (Enasel, 2011; Kotler, 2001). 
These new developed activities are becoming part of the core business of cultural 
organizations (DiMaggio, 1986). In addition, the familiar distinction between the non-profit 
world of high culture and the for-profit world of popular culture is breaking down. While 
non-profit cultural organizations now sell products, for-profit companies are able to attract 
talented artists to work for them (Kolb, 2005).  

Another challenge is the new technological developments, which are changing the way 
visitors experience the museum (Mencarelli, Marteaux & Pulh, 2010). In displaying the 
collection, new activities have developed: not only displaying the art objects with short text 
information is sufficient nowadays, guided tours, childrens’ programs, and other new 
approaches are present that require the visitor to participate more in the experience. 
Documentation has transformed into different ranges of interactive outputs with the use of 
new media and technology, such as photographs and videos (McDonald & Fyfe, 1996). These 
technologies are expanding the virtual world, it makes it sometimes unnecessary to actually 
visit the museum for information. It forces museums to create digital databases of their 
collections and archives, to promote themselves on the internet and on social media. The 
material becomes accessible everywhere by the internet and makes the museum sector much 
more complex. Moreover, these new technologies influence the supply of artifacts as well, 
the art museum is not restricted to paintings and sculptures anymore. As mentioned earlier, 
photography is accepted as artwork as well. New problems arise in preserving these new 
materials, and new areas and priorities for conservation develop (Towse et al., 2003). The 
result of these new technologies is a multi-dimensional offer, combining the virtual and the 
actual world with interactive devices, such as sound, images and computer technology 
(Kõiva, 2007). Impressing architecture has brought a new dimension to the museum, the 
building itself has become an exhibit (French & Runyard, 2011). These technological 
changes and innovations are constantly influencing museum operations (Hutter, 1998). 

Museums are not immune from forces of competition (Johnson & Thomas, 1998). They 
compete in a market place where public funding and private benefactors are only limited 
available. They compete for visitors, their visitor numbers can be affected by what other 
museums and other visitor attractions do. As a result of the increased mobility of artists and 
art works all over the world there is an expanded exposure to the worlds’ cultural products 
(Kolb, 2005). Andreasen and Kotler describe that consumers can spend only a limited time 
while there is a great number of offerings how to spend it (2003). Museums have to face the 
indirect competition of all the market players that offer a wide variety of free-time activities 
and they still have to pursue their goal to preserve the cultural heritage and educate the public 
(Enasel, 2011). This has encouraged museums to develop even more new activities to 
generate income. To compete successfully, museum practitioners actively engage with the 
worlds of economics, management and marketing (Tobelem, 1998). 

At last, evidence exists that museum visitors’ numbers are affected by the product life cycle 
(Johnson & Thomas, 1998). The idea of a product life cycle exists because the needs and 
preferences of consumers change, while technology continues to evolve (Colbert, Nantel & 
Bilodeauet, 2001). It can be applied to a specific concept or product, or to a brand or 
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organization. At first museums are subject to the development and finding of an audience 
(Kolb, 2005). Once that is reached and the organization is successful, it could be copied by 
other organizations. The organization is mature once all the potential consumers that can be 
attracted are reached. Eventually a period of decline will follow, and the organization is 
forced to revitalize its products and services. The relative importance of different types of 
museums changes over time. Consequently, it is important for museums always to review its 
products and their relevance to the audience. Hard decisions need to be made about 
initiatives, which are not successful anymore and awareness of changes in the environment is 
necessary. Adjusting to these changes and to train and develop the staff to keep its attitude 
relevant for the audience they encounter is part of this (Hill et al., 2003).  

It is evident that museums face many challenges nowadays that have influence on all aspects 
of the organization. As the funding system and patrons are changing they are forced to 
generate their own incomes. The focus has shifted to audience development and to increasing 
visitor numbers. To attract these visitors, the museum is improving the quality of the visit, by 
offering many activities that create a divers experience. In addition, the divisions between 
commercial and non-profit and high and low culture are blurring. And even more important, 
due to technological developments the museum operations has to include interactive activities 
at the museum and online. This does not only influence the exhibitions, thereupon the 
promotion and conservation and supply of artworks. They compete with other leisure 
activities and are subject to changes in taste. For the research it is important to take these 
challenges into consideration, since these maybe the cause for photography museums to 
develop new activities such as a sales gallery. 

 

2.4 Conclusions 
 

Nowadays museums are complex organizations that struggle with being a combination of the 
traditional collecting, conserving, research, exhibiting and educational institution and being 
the more popular, competitive and complex organization with many activities (Kotler & 
Kotler, 2000). Due to technological changes the output of museums has become more 
complex, their activities, their digital interactive assets and their collections have changed. 
This gave rise to the museum specialized in photography, by which photography is a 
technological invention in itself that allows to produce artworks in editions. Other challenges 
are the change in the patrons of arts, museums are obliged to generate more income on their 
own, to focus more on audience numbers and development, and experience an increasing 
competition for visitors with other leisure time providers. The museum has to create a more 
diversified program, enhancing the quality of the visitors’ experience. Therefore museums 
create a strategic framework, a set of activities, which it wants to perform to create an 
effective output that attracts an audience, while staying in alignment with its artistic mission. 
It is up to them to decide how they want to balance their output to face those challenges. It is 
important to take these challenges into consideration, since these may be the cause for the 
museums to develop new activities, such as a sales gallery. 
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3 Arts Marketing 
 

“Museums and galleries cannot simply rely on the world discovering that they are good.”3 

 

In the previous chapter we have discussed the economic features of the museum and the 
challenges they encounter today. As we have read, museums set strategies in choosing the 
activities they perform in alignment with their artistic mission. Due to the changing 
environment, museums started to integrate some concepts of traditional marketing within 
their strategies. By taking into consideration the offer the museum is striving to create: the 
supply of the museum; and how the market responses to this: the demand for this offer. 
However, they cannot just copy traditional marketing strategies, as they have an artistic 
mission. Therefore the discipline arts marketing developed, which is based upon the 
framework of supply and demand adapted for cultural organizations. This relatively new 
discipline went through different periods and is nowadays an inevitable activity within 
museum organizations. Hence, in this chapter the concept of arts marketing is described. 
Beginning with the supply and demand theory to provide a framework for arts marketing. 
Then the history and development of arts marketing is expounded to create an overview of 
this concept. Simultaneously, the useful arts marketing tools for this research on the supply 
and demand side are explained. After all things considered, we have an outline of useful arts 
marketing strategies for the museum on both supply and demand side.  

 

3.1 Arts marketing strategy 
 

Supply and demand 

Museums perform on a market. Exchanges take place between the organization and the 
consumer when the services are supplied by the organization on the market, and consumers 
buy them at a price on the market, which is the demand (Towse, 2010). This mechanism is 
represented by a supply and demand graphic, seen in the figure below (Fig. 1). Here the 
market is represented by a service, the vertical axis represents the price for the service, the 
horizontal axis the quantity supplied. Market forces can change the supply for a certain 
service or the demand for it. For example, when there is competition on the market, or when 
the uses of resources change. This mechanism works for the inputs and the outputs. With the 
theory of demand and supply it is possible to explain how exchanges take place within a 
market (Towse, 2010). It is not always easy to find out what the quantities are in which 
output or input should be measured. As explained, museums have an artistic mission and 
therefore supply and demand cannot completely be measured in financial means. Supply 
studies for museums are relevant because they can shed light on what kind of combination of 

3 (Nairne, as cited from French & Runyard, 2011, p. viii) 
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multiple outputs it can produce best. And because they cannot completely adjust their supply 
to demand. Continually, the theory of demand tries to explain the behavior and the 
participation of consumers in terms of the economic factors that affect consumer decision-
making. Studies of demand for the participation in cultural goods and services form another 
important aspect in the study of museums’ activities. Therefore both supply and demand form 
the basis of the marketing of cultural goods and services for museums. For that reason we 
have to keep both perspectives in mind for our research as the exchange takes place between 
both supply and demand. 

 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

1 – SUPPLY AND DEMAND SCHEDULE, own elaboration 
 
History of arts marketing 

As we have already mentioned, arts marketing developed from the commercial marketing 
concept. In 1967, Kotler was the first to remark the relevance of marketing for the arts. In this 
book he argued that arts organizations produce cultural goods and services, which makes 
them competitors for consumer attention and resources compared with other cultural 
organizations. At first arts marketing experienced a difficulty in gaining acceptance in non-
profit organizations (Andreasen & Kotler, 2003; Kolb, 2005). As marketing was to be seen as 
a technique to conform to the tastes of the public, it was thought of not be able to keep the 
innovations and evolution of the artistic products. And it was considered as a tool that serves 
only materialist and financial ends. However, nowadays arts marketing has grown to a 
discipline that is no longer only a department or a promotional activity within museums, it is 
central to the organizations’ functions (French & Runyard, 2011). It is accepted as an 
approach that can make an important contribution to the success of arts organizations: in 
improving their resources, in operating effectively and accountable, in helping them think 
strategically and to engage better with their public (Hill et al., 2003). Subsequently it has 
gone under a rapid professionalization and developed into an academic discipline (Boorsma, 
2006).  
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The development of the arts marketing discipline can roughly be categorized in three periods 
(Rentschler, 1998). The period from 1975 to 1984 can be defined as the Foundation Period of 
arts marketing. This period is characterized by the recognition of museums and performing 
arts organizations that a new approach to marketing was required (Kolb, 2005; Rentschler, 
1998). Museums and performing arts organizations started to analyze their economic impact 
and data on visitors. Awareness of their competitiveness and attractiveness increased, 
strategies to enhance their market position arose, and the elements of the marketing mix were 
analyzed. Marketing was seen as only an element of the overall strategy of the museum 
(Kolb, 2005). The second period is described by Rentschler as the Professionalization Period, 
this period took place from 1985 to 1994 (1998). In this phase arts marketing became 
recognized as applicable for museums and other cultural non-profit organizations and arts 
marketing departments developed. Cultural organizations started to segment and target their 
marketplace and determined the variety of their audiences. The period after 1994 until now is 
called the Rediscovery Period or the Creative Period (Fillis, 2010; Rentschler, 1998). This 
period focusses on the application of creative entrepreneurial marketing to differentiate 
cultural organizations within the increasingly competitive cultural marketplace. Arts 
marketing practitioners are encouraged to place creativity at the center of marketing thinking 
(Fillis, 2010). This means a proactive attitude towards innovation from within the 
organization to find new ways to deliver products or services, to communicate with the 
consumer, to organize the company and to manage relationships (Fillis, 2010). 

In discussing the most recent period of the arts marketing development, there is a definition 
that needs mentioning: cultural entrepreneurship. As Klamer explains, this definition is 
relatively new in the field (Klamer, 2011). The cultural entrepreneur is someone who is 
focused on the cultural content, while economics and the market is an instrument for the 
cultural entrepreneur to achieve the mission of the organization. As a museum has to find a 
balance between the market and its mission, cultural entrepreneurship could be a method to 
achieve this. As Klamer explains there are several characteristics that are cultural 
entrepreneurial: be alert to opportunities, being creative in the artistic content and in 
organizing the conversation and the finances, the art has to remain the main focus, by being 
persuasive and prudent and at last by having courage, hope and faith in their actions (2011). 
Cultural entrepreneurship could help museums nowadays in developing its strategy and the 
activities it performs, and aligns with the Creative Period in that it has a focus on creative 
entrepreneurial marketing strategies to achieve their artistic mission. 

Arts marketing concept 

Arts marketing originally adopted the theory of commercial marketing. Commercial 
marketing is defined by the American Marketing Association as: “the process of planning and 
executing the conception, pricing, promotion, and distribution of ideas, goods, and services to 
create exchanges that satisfy individual and organizational goals” (Bennet, 1995). Arts 
marketing and commercial marketing have much in common: both need to make a balance 
between consumer and organizational needs; both need to take into account the immediate 
consumer and a range of stakeholders; and both pay attention to creating and maintaining 
long term exchange relationships with mutual value (Hill et al., 2003). Marketing implies the 
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next elements: that there is a consumer need; that consumers can have a satisfaction of these 
needs; that there is a relationship between consumer and the company; and that the company 
tries to optimize its profits (Colbert et al., 2001). The optimization of profits is especially 
important for cultural organizations, as this is different than the maximization of profits. 
Optimization means to reach the highest possible profits while taking into account 
organizational or environmental elements. Thus for cultural organizations the difficulty lies in 
the combination of using progressive arts marketing tools to meet the audience needs while 
remaining true to the creative mission of the organization (Rentschler, 1999).  

As the mission already shows, the context of cultural organizations is unique and therefore it 
is inappropriate just to copy the commercial marketing approach (Rentschler, 1999). Some 
important differences need to be remarked that cannot be ignored (Diggle, 1994). As the 
products of cultural organizations have some specific characteristics, many available 
marketing methodologies suffer failings in attempts to discover the value of the exchanged 
products (Kawashima, 1998). The characteristics of cultural products are that they are 
abstract, subjectively experienced, unique, holistic (they are encountered as wholes), non-
utilitarian (products are valued for their own sake) and can be considered as a common good 
(Hirschman, 1983). In traditional marketing, the market is both the start and the finish of the 
process (Towse ed., 2003). In arts marketing the cultural product is created by artistic 
independency, therefore arts marketing cannot conform the product to the needs of the 
consumer as in commercial marketing. As a result arts marketing developed into a practice to 
match the artistic product with an appropriate audience; this approach is emphasized by 
Diggle and Melillo (1994; 1995). The artistic product is seen as independent from market 
forces, and is excluded from marketing tools (Colbert et al., 2001p; Hirschman, 1983). 
Marketing activities are not applied to the artwork itself, but instead to the surrounding 
activities such as the inscribing, pricing, packaging, delivering, exhibiting and enhancing the 
work (Boorsma, 2006).  

Colbert described a model that is useful to understand the differences of both arts and 
commercial marketing approaches (fig. 2) (2001). In this model a distinction can be made 
between market-centered companies and product-centered companies. Furthermore a 
distinction can be made between companies who produce prototypes, and companies who 
make reproductions of prototypes. Four categories become clear, one category is typically for 
the commercial marketing approach, where it is market-focused and does not produce unique 
cultural products (3). The opposite category is the product-focused company with a 
production of unique cultural products (1). Between these two opposite approaches, a mixed 
approach is possible, where compromises can be made between product adjustments, or 
consumer preferences (2 & 4). For museums, these options are most suitable, as they provide 
many activities, for example the exhibitions are product centered and display unique pieces, 
yet the catalogue of the exhibition and the museum shop merchandize can be reproduced and 
produced for a specific market. 
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2 – CRITERIA FOR DISTINGHUISHING CULTURAL ENTERPRISES (Colbert et al., 2001, p.17) 

All differences and comparisons with commercial marketing considered, we continue with a 
useful definition for arts marketing: “… an integrated management process which sees 
mutually satisfying exchange relationships with customers as the route to achieving 
organizational and artistic objectives” (Hill et al., 2003, p.1). In this definition it is 
emphasized that arts marketing needs to be integrated within the organization as a whole, and 
that all activities need to be organized around the customer and the objectives of the 
organization. It is a process, because it is about a constant satisfying exchange of mutual 
values between the supply and the demand. It stresses its relationships with the customer over 
a longer period of time, as both the organization and its customers can grow from the 
interaction they have together. Therefore it is important for our research to take both supply 
and demand in consideration and link them together (French & Runyard, 2011). As both 
perspectives are the bases of the concept of arts marketing, and can shed light on why 
museums have chosen to perform the activity of a sales gallery. The following paragraphs 
will describe different arts marketing tools for museums on the supply and demand side that 
will help us to investigate this specific activity. 

 

3.2 Supply strategies 
 

The organization is responsible for its supply and can choose which positioning strategy it 
will use to demonstrate its place in the market and how it will communicate this to its 
audience. The offerings of a museum to its audience can be described as a service, which the 
visitor experiences; both have specific characteristics. For that reason we start analyzing the 
service elements of supply, and continue with the experience elements. 

Service marketing 

A service has several characteristics that are different from products. Bateson and Hoffman 
outlined four important aspects (1999). First, services are intangible: a visit to a museum 
cannot be bought and taken home, it is rather an activity instead of an object (Hill et al., 
2003). This makes it difficult to set and justify the price for a service. The consumer needs to 
be assured that it is worth paying for, and it needs to be user-friendly and approachable. The 
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second aspect is that it is inseparable of production or consumption. The experience of the 
artworks or the displayed objects in a museum are filtered and controlled by a time-restricted 
environment. A third characteristic is heterogeneity: every artistic experience is unique and a 
large number of people are involved in the delivery of this experience. Another aspect is 
perishability: cultural organizations provide experiences that need immediate consumption. 
And at last, McLean added the aspect of lack of ownership to services (1994). Services are 
served in a mixture of visible and invisible sources: visible are the visitor experiences, 
invisible are the internal systems and processes in an organization.  

Moreover, services are delivered in a mix of intangible and tangible aspects (Rentschler & 
Gilmore, 2002). This can range from the actual building to communication with the visitor at 
the wardrobe. So service marketing is about continuous series of social and economic 
processes to the consumer (Vargo, 2004). All these various aspects are illustrated in the next 
figure, originally designed by Gilmore and Carson in 1993, which is adapted for museums by 
Rentschler and Gilmore (fig. 3) (2002). With this illustration it is possible to get an overview 
of all the aspects involving the museums’ services that can be analyzed schematically from 
the intangibles to the tangibles. It emphasizes the complex interaction within a museum and 
its multiplicity of combinations in output (McLean, 1994). In our research only one element 
is researched of the museums’ output, however it is important to keep in mind that this 
element is part of this multiplicity of combinations in output, as visible in the figure below 
(fig. 3).  

 
3 – DIMENSIONS OF MUSEUM SERVICE DELIVERY (Rentschler & Gilmore, 2002, p. 65) 
 

The 7P’s  

This supply of services can be ordered with one of the core concepts of marketing: the 
marketing mix. Traditionally the marketing mix is composed of four components: price, 
product, place and promotion, together called the 4 P’s (McCarthy, 1994). Booms and Bitner 
extended this framework to make it more applicable for service marketing (1981). Since 
museums offer services, this framework is adopted for this research. By including process, 
physical evidence and people to the 4 P’s this marketing mix framework consists of 7 P’s 
(Booms & Bitner, 1981). A successful marketing strategy depends on the balance and 
synergy of the components of this framework and can be defined as: “the set of controllable 
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marketing variables that the firm blends to produce the response it wants in the target market” 
(Kotler & Armstrong, 2001, p.45). All the 7P’s are interrelated to each other, as the 
experience visitors have is influenced by the product, the price, the place, the promotion, the 
people, the process and the physical environment (Booms & Bittner, 1981; Yelkur, 2000). 
The individual elements of the marketing mix are explained in the following text and provide 
us a framework to research the different controllable marketing variables of the museums 
researched in the empirical part from the supply side.  

The product that a museum provides is an experience. The experience can be distinguished in 
distinct levels, as visualized in the figure below (fig. 4) (Andreasen & Kotler, 2003). These 
levels make it easier to analyze the service provision a museum can offer. At the center of a 
service offered is the core benefit; for a museum this is the artistic experience. The artistic 
experience is the communication between the artist and the audience. This communication is 
a creative process that happens when the public experiences what the artist wishes to 
communicate (Hill et al., 2003). The next level, the central benefit, covers the tangible 
aspects of the artistic experience, such as the artistic object itself, the location and its 
environment, the behavior of the staff, the branding of the organization and the access to it. 
These elements are important influence factors for the experience of the consumer. The third 
level is the extended experiences, which are services and products that are related to the core 
product itself, however they provide extensions and other aspects to the consumer experience. 
They enhance the offering of the service to specific sectors of the market, with workshops, 
merchandise, catering and so on. The fourth level is the potential experience; this level 
encloses the forms of deeper involvement. This level makes sure that museums keep their 
offers interesting for current audiences, keep attracting new audiences and that they adjust to 
the changing environment. Examples of this level are the consumer becoming a volunteer, 
donor, member, friend or participant of the museum. It is important to recognize these 
differences of the experience a museum offers and that the museum is able to change 
different aspects of the artistic experiences: the art works it chooses to show; the central 
experiences: the atmosphere, the staff attitudes; the extended experience: workshops, catering 
and additional services, and the potential experiences: becoming part of the museum or 
influencing the participation. With this division of levels, it is possible to analyze the service 
offered, to divide the different activities it provides and to find new opportunities.  

 
4 – FOUR LEVELS OF PRODUCT IN THE ART EXPERIENCE (Hill et al., 2003, p.120) 
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Every cultural organization has to generate income. The museum has several different 
sources to generate income of which the most important are: public subsidies, sponsorships 
and donations, trusts and foundations, entrance fees and sales revenues from ancillary 
services (Hill et al., 2003). Therefore it has to set prices; however, a museum not only 
exchanges monetary values, the organization and the audiences exchange other benefits as 
well, such as time and knowledge. The setting of prices effects demand; this makes it a very 
important strategic variable. Prices imply the level of quality, and different pricing levels can 
split the market into different segments. Prices should reflect the value that consumers place 
on the experience offered, which contain tangible and intangible aspects. The problem of 
services is that the consumer has expectations about it beforehand. Only after the experience 
of the service the consumer is able to judge whether it was worth buying a ticket. In the end, 
the pricing policy should encourage demand, generate sufficient revenue to cover costs and 
should meet the artistic and social objectives of an organization. 

The different influences on pricing strategies are shown in the illustration below (fig. 5) (Hill 
et al., 2003). Financial objectives are set within a museum to ensure that all sources of 
income are sufficient to cover costs. The marketing objectives are decisions on the pricing 
strategy to gain a stronger position in the market, like building a loyal audience or attract new 
audience groups. The market position influences pricing decisions as consumers have a 
perception about the organization and the quality of the services its offering. The nature of 
the market determines the ability to pay and the willingness to pay for the consumers. And at 
last, the competition of prices of competitors, similar services, and internal competition or 
substitute activities has influence on the pricing strategy.  

 
5 – INFLUENCES ON PRICING STRATEGY (Hill et al., 2003, p.160) 

Another element of the marketing mix is place, which is also known as distribution (Hill et 
al., 2003). Distribution is about creating relationships with a maximum of consumers at a 
minimum cost for the organization. It deals with the effectiveness of supply and is very 
linked to price and product. The distribution within museums is done by marketing channels, 
which are a number of intermediaries connecting the organization with its customers. The 
shorter the marketing channel is, the more control the organization has on how the service 
reaches the consumer. Technology or innovative organization can create new ways to reach 
(new) audiences. The physical access to the museum, and the physical elements of the 
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environment of the venue itself are very important for the perception of the museum 
experience for the consumer. And time is an important element, such as opening hours, which 
have an important impact on the accessibility of the museum. 

Promotion is the element of the marketing mix in which the benefits of what is offered are 
communicated to the targeted audience (Hill et al., 2003). Hence it is the most visible element 
of the marketing mix. To make a promotion plan, one has to take into consideration the 
nature of the audience, the nature of the message and the size of the available budget. 
Promotion contains advertising, public relations, sales promotion, personal selling and direct 
marketing. Advertising is a form of promotion when an organization pays to get media 
exposure to inform (potential) consumers. Public relations is a form of creating an 
understanding between an organization and its audience by looking after its reputation, and 
by influencing opinion and behavior. Direct sales is face-to-face presentation and sales 
promotion is a technique that offers something for nothing, like subscriptions. At last, direct 
marketing nowadays comes in the form of relationship marketing, in which the organization 
tries to have a direct relationship with the consumer. This can be in many forms, like e-mail, 
by phone, personal letters or social media channels such as Facebook and Twitter or a blog 
on the internet, by these channels the organization can have direct contact with the consumers 
and they can respond online.  

The last three elements are people, physical environment and process. People are all the 
human actors who are involved within the exchange of the service, such as the firms’ 
personnel and the consumers (Rafiq & Ahmed, 1995). Not only the consumer who buys the 
service, also the other people in the consumers’ environment should be taken into 
consideration, as they can affect the service quality. It emphasizes the importance of the 
human interface during a museum experience (Hill et al., 2003). People and personnel have a 
co-operative role and are a key element of the service provided. The process stands for the 
procedures, mechanisms and flow of activities (Rafiq & Ahmed, 1995). In a service situation, 
the consumer experiences a process. All these factors influence how the consumer will judge 
the quality of the service provided. This means managing the care for the customer during the 
whole visit. Physical environment is the surroundings in which the service is delivered (Rafiq 
& Ahmed, 1995). This could be the building, or other tangible goods that facilitate the 
performance and communication of the service. The physical environment is part of the 
service provided itself, as people assess the quality of the service provided by using tangible 
clues. With an appropriate environment in which the service is delivered, it can reinforce a 
positive valuation of the intangible aspects of the artistic experience.  

Experience marketing 

In summary we have discussed all the seven elements of supply that can be adjusted to a 
service. As we described before, the visitors experience the service offered by a museum. We 
already have mentioned that its product has different levels of experiences: the artistic 
experience, the central experience, the extended experience and the potential experience. 
Additionally, the tools of experience marketing can be useful to understand the experiential 
dimension of the multiple services of a museum for their consumers (Petkus, 2004). First, the 
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development of the experience economy is described, to get an overview of how this concept 
came into being. Followed by an explanation of the characteristics of the total museum 
experience and a model to visualize the range of the total museum experience a museum can 
offer. At last the meaningful experience is explained and the different methods to create this.  

Development of the experience economy 

The experience economy has its roots in the entertainment business, such as team parks, 
sports and the arts. In 1998 Pine and Gilmore explained that nowadays experiences are no 
longer only offered by entertainment businesses, other businesses started to provide this as 
well. They explain the evolution to an experience economy as a historical development, 
which started with agrarian trades (Pine & Gilmore, 1998). People started with the trading of 
animals, vegetables and minerals from nature: a market arose in which these commodities 
were traded. Mostly they were traded by family owned small companies or groups of people. 
This period is called the agrarian economy. In the 19th century the bigger companies started to 
rise and slowly took over the family companies. This was enforced by the Industrial 
Revolution, which developed the big companies that traded mass produced goods. Due to 
improved technologies, work became a routine and machines were used. Goods were sold in 
large amounts, to anonymous buyers and the market became competitive.  

The development to a service economy happened in the second half of the 19th century. In 
this economy services are valued higher then goods, and soon other firms adopted this 
approach. It became more difficult to differentiate their offers from each other. Hence 
competitive advantage and satisfaction diminished for services. This has caused that 
companies in the 21st century try to find new ways to reach the consumer in a unique way 
(Pine & Gilmore, 1998). In the 21st century an economy based on experiences emerged, 
which are different from goods and services and offer a unique experience for consumers, 
based on memorable elements.  

Characteristics of the museum experience 

Kotler and Kotler emphasize that it can be a very effective tool to consider the range of 
visitor experiences and the range of the museums’ offerings and services an integral part of 
the total museum experience (2000). They developed an illustration that demonstrates all the 
dimensions of a visitor experience (fig. 6). The horizontal axis indicates the range of visitor 
experiences, the vertical axis demonstrates the levels of intensity of the experience. The circle 
shows the degree of the services provided. By approaching the museum offerings as a 
combination of experiences the museum is able to extend its offerings beyond the traditional 
focus on the objects, collections and services. In an experience the visitor can directly 
participate, sensory perceptions can be combined and visitors can be immersed in unique and 
memorable visits. Kotler and Kotler state that there is no singular formula for shaping the 
visitors’ experience; every museum has to create its unique balance, and this visual tool helps 
to create an overview of all dimensions of the experience to the visitor (2000). This tool 
emphasizes that every museum creates its unique balance, with all different dimensions of an 
experience, which we have to consider in researching different museums in the empirical part 
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of our research, as all three museums create their own unique visitors’ experience. 

 
6 - DIMENSIONS OF THE MUSEUM GOING EXPERIENCE (Kotler & Kotler, 2000, p.280) 

Within this model, different characteristics of the museum experience become clear. This can 
be explained by the four characteristics that Pine and Gilmore developed (1998). A 
distinction can be made concerning customer participation in an experience. The customer 
can participate in a passive way, which does not affect the performance at all; or in an active 
way, when the customer plays a key role in the creation of the performance that creates the 
experience. A second distinction can be made by the environmental relationship, between the 
customer and the event or performance. People can be absorbed by the experience, this means 
the experience reaches the mind of a consumer; or they can be immersed by it: the consumer 
goes into the experience. In the illustration below the experience is categorized with a 
spectrum of these four dimensions (fig. 7). The horizontal dimensions are passive and active 
participation, while the vertical dimensions are absorption and immersion.  

  
7 – THE FOUR REALMS OF AN EXPERIENCE (Pine & Gilmore, 1998, p. 102) 

Within these two distinctions lie four domains, these domains can be divided in an 
entertaining experience, an educational experience, an aesthetic experience and an escapist 
experience. The entertaining aspect is an experience in which the consumer participates in a 
passive manner and the experience is absorbed; an example of this domain is watching a 
movie. The educational domain requires more active participation; however, the consumer is 
not immersed, but absorbs the experience, as he or she keeps a certain distance from the 
experience. The escapist domain requires the consumer to be completely emerged in the 
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experience and to participate actively, for example a theme park. The last domain is the 
aesthetic experience; in this case people have to immerse with the experience, but act in a 
passive way. This happens for example when people watch art in a museum. Pine and 
Gilmore argue that the most memorable experiences have some aspects of all four domains 
(1998).  

These four domains can be stimulated within the museum (Petkus, 2002). The entertainment 
domain can be applied holistically and can be incorporated into areas outside the actual ‘art’ 
itself. The second domain is education. A museum provides many educational dimensions. 
By actually training its audience in different dimensions, its educational objectives can be 
enhanced. The escapist dimension demands an active participation in the experience; 
museums can develop this aspect by providing activities that the consumer actually becomes 
the artist or to create a new role for him within the museum. The last realm, the aesthetic 
realm, can be varied in the intensities of sensory experiences to avoid boredom. Combining 
these four disciplines with the model of Kotler & Kotler creates an extensive and complete 
overview of what kind of visitors’ experience the museums try to create with the activity of a 
sales gallery (2000).  

Meaningful experience 

Nowadays a theory regarding the further development of the experience economy exists, 
which is described as the significance economy (Kuiper & Smit, 2011). Kuiper and Smit state 
that companies have to create meaningful experiences for their consumers to connect with 
them on an emotional, rational and social level, and to connect them with their brand (2011). 
This is possible with an experience that transforms the consumer. This transformation can be 
created in an interactive experience, which is lasting and adds something to the needs, values 
and wishes of the consumer. According to Kuiper and Smit four different methods can be 
used to give meaning to an experience: the first is by enabling, which means offering extra 
services to the consumer to make things easier. The second is by educating, to increase the 
knowledge of the consumer. The third is by engaging, to increase social welfare and 
responsibility. And the fourth: by enlightening, by inspiring the consumer and to realize 
immaterial happiness.  

For the museum this would mean that it tries to create an experience by which the visitor 
transforms. It has to create an offer with extra services, to enable, or to increase the 
knowledge of the visitor by educating. The museum can try to increase the responsibility, or 
social welfare of the visitor, by engaging them. A cultural institution normally has an artistic 
mission; therefore it seems more appropriate that it wants to engage the visitors on a cultural 
level and make them feel more involved and responsible for culture. Museums could try to 
enlighten the visitors, by inspiring the consumer during a visit, and try to increase the 
immaterial happiness of the visitors by what it has to offer: culture. Since this new theory 
involves the total experience a consumer encounters, it could be interesting to see if the 
museums to be studied took this idea into consideration while deciding on their strategies for 
their offering. And second, it is interesting to research whether these meaningful elements 
reach the visitors.  

23 
 



 

3.3 Demand research 
 

The supply side is only one aspect of the museums operations, as it exchanges their offerings 
on the market. The market comprises all the people with whom an organization has some 
form of communication (Towse ed., 2003). A museum has to deal with several different 
markets: the stakeholders, such as donors, sponsors and the state; the ultimate consumers; 
intermediaries, distribution agents, gate-keepers; and the artists. One of the main tasks of arts 
marketing is to reach the consumer market for the services it has to offer. This means that the 
museum as an organization needs to motivate (potential) consumers to experience the 
services provided and to share the artistic experience (Hill et al., 2003). To be able to do this 
effectively, the museum needs to find out what the motivation, the needs, desires and 
expectations are of these (potential) consumers. Marketing research is necessary to examine 
the visitor patterns and profiles, to be able to adjust the service and goods provided to satisfy 
the consumer (French & Runyard, 2011). This can be done by demand studies. Demand 
studies for cultural goods and services are mostly measured by surveys (Towse, 2010). Socio-
economic characteristics provide insight in the profile of a consumer and reveal factors of 
influence on arts attendance. Audience surveys provide understanding in the characteristics of 
visitors, which can be important for an organizations’ marketing and planning purposes. 
Hence, demand studies can provide insight in the impact of factors such as marketing or the 
demand for different products (Johnson & Barry, 1998). Therefore demand studies can 
provide insight for our research on how visitors’ perceive the activity of a sales gallery within 
the museum. 

Visitors’ profile 

Information that can be obtained from surveys is a visitor profile (Kawashima, 1998). This 
mostly analyzes demographic characteristics, educational and income levels and geographic 
characteristics. It may be referenced with participation rates, like frequency, 
representativeness in a certain community, content of activity, context of the activity and 
attitudinal dimensions of participation. Between consumers, many different patterns of art 
attendance are visible (Hill et al., 2003). This is dependent on several factors that influence 
the choices consumers make. Ranshuysen explains five important factors that influence the 
cultural participation of visitors (1999). First is the complexity of the offer: culture is better 
understood by people who have more cultural capital. Cultural capital can be obtained by 
being confronted with culture, for example during childhood by your parents. Therefore the 
cultural offer can be adjusted in complexity to attract a wider range of people with less 
experience. Second is the social status, cultural activities can provide status for people in 
specific social circles, and people visit in social groups. The third factor is time: people have 
different ranges of free time to spend. The fourth is the budget people can spend, if the 
cultural offer is affordable for them. And the fifth is geographical reach: are people able to 
travel to the organization and how often? Kotler and Scheff argue that most factors affecting 
the consumers’ attendance go beyond the specific offering of the cultural organization 
(1997). They believe that the main factors that are of influence are social factors: reference 
groups and social classes; personal factors such as age, gender, income and education; 
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cultural factors: nationality and subcultures. Continuing with psychological factors like 
perception, beliefs and attitudes, personality and motivation (Kotler, & Scheff, 1997). It is 
therefore important to construct a visitors’ profile from a market research, to be able to 
discover factors that could be of influence on the attendance of the museum and it can explain 
some of these factors that might have influence on how visitors’ experience the museum or 
specific activities.  

And it can be interesting if specific demographic characters might be more interested in a 
specific activity compared to others. The museum can anticipate on this by segmenting the 
audience. Segmenting means that the audience is divided into different groups. For every 
group an organization can develop a different marketing strategy and marketing message. A 
market segment consists of consumers with similar needs and wants (Hill et al., 2003). The 
strategy and message are made to meet most of the needs of each group and to communicate 
this with them most effectively (Kolb, 2005). This can be done in two ways, by reaching out 
for market depth; this entails a consumer group that is already attracted to the museum, and 
the museum wants to attract more people of this group. The other method is by reaching out 
for market breadth; then the museum tries to reach out for new market segments. To use 
market segmentation, first different groups need to be identified (Kolb, 2005). Likewise, this 
can be done by visitor research, thus for the empirical part it is important for us to gain 
information on the visitors’ profile. 

Visitors’ experience 

With visitor research the opinion on the different elements of the service offered can 
obtained, based on the 7 P’s. However, the service marketing approach suggests that the 
customer will process the visit in its entirety, and that it does not separate tangibles and 
intangibles (Hume, Mort, Winzar, 2007). We can describe the offering of the museum as 
“…a service that is produced and consumed simultaneously, and consumed by the user 
participation in it” (Kawashima, 1998, p. 30). A character of the museum service is that it is 
holistic, which means that the quality of a visit is affected by all factors that include the visit. 
Consequently the additional services a museum offers influences the overall quality of the 
visit. This makes it very difficult to define the product, the service itself and to extract 
particular elements that have affected the consumer (Kawashima, 1998). For our research it is 
therefore important to keep in mind that the visitor experiences the museums’ offering as 
holistic, and that because of the service elements it does not separate the tangible aspects and 
the intangible aspects. 

Visitor research can give insight in which characteristics of the experience reaches the visitor, 
or which experiences the visitors prefer to have at the museum. Again questions concerning 
the different characteristics can shed light on this. This can concern active and passive 
participatory experiences, or absorbing and immersive experiences, or the four dimensions of 
educational, aesthetic, escapist and entertaining. Additionally the different methods to reach a 
meaningful experienced can be researched. Again, we have to bear in mind that experiences 
are holistic too, therefore it could be difficult for visitors to separate the different 
characteristics of the total museum experience. 
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A useful model to perceive the visitors experience from the demand side is the Interactive 
experience model (Falk & Dierking, 1992). Falk and Dierking created this model to present a 
coherent picture of the total visitors’ experience (1992). This model presents the similarities 
and differences among visitors and museums and the unique complexities and common 
strands of the museum experience. The model is illustrated below (fig. 8). 

 

 

 

 

 

 
8 – INTERACTIVE EXPERIENCE MODEL (Falk & Dierking, 1992, p.5) 
 

This model approaches the museum experience from a visitor perspective and involves the 
interaction of three contexts. The first is the personal context: each visitor is unique; it has 
various experiences, motivations, interests, concerns and knowledge. The second context is 
the social context. Most people visit museums in groups, or are confronted with other visitors 
or museum staff. The perspective of every visitor is strongly influenced by this social context, 
as we explained before, visitors are constantly influenced by other visitors and staff, it is a 
service and these encounters influence how the total experience is judged. The third is the 
physical context: visitors enter a physical setting when entering a museum. The physical 
context is about the architecture, the ambiance and the collection. The visitors’ experience is 
a continuous shift of interaction between personal, social and physical contexts. The model 
demonstrates that all three contexts contribute to the museum experience and function as an 
integrated whole, while the museums cannot control every element of all these three contexts. 
This emphasizes that demand research is important for our research to find out if the 
experiences a museum wishes to supply, actually reach the consumer.   

To summarize, from the demand side it is possible to do visitor research. This can give 
insight in demographic characteristics. These characteristics can create a visitors profile to 
which the museum can adjust their activities. Furthermore it can explain factors that influence 
how the visitors experience the offerings of the museum and what they expect to experience. 
At last, the Interactive experience model can be used as a tool to understand how this 
experience takes form in the mind of the visitor (Falk & Dierking, 1992). Hence, these tools 
provide a useful framework to research and evaluate the practices for museums from a 
visitors’ perspective. 
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3.4 Conclusions 
 

Concluding, arts Marketing can be defined as: “… an integrated management process which 
sees mutually satisfying exchange relationships with customers as the route to achieving 
organizational and artistic objectives” (Hill et al., 2003, p.1). By viewing arts marketing from 
a supply and demand perspective it is possible to research and analyze the museum activities 
and to gain knowledge on how the visitors perceive these. The museum offerings appear to 
have unique characteristics, which need to be taken into consideration while using art 
marketing tools and concepts. One of these characteristics is that it offers services to their 
visitors, and visitors experience these services. Therefore the offering has tangible and 
intangible aspects and is inseparable, perishable and it has heterogeneity. It can therefore be 
approached as holistic. The supply theory provides us with a 7 P’s marketing mix in which 
seven service elements are emphasized that can be adjusted in the offering of the museum. 
These are price, product, place, promotion, people, processes and physical environment. All 
categories provide instruments to reach the aims and goals of the organization. The 
experience can be categorized with different characteristics, such as participation level and 
distance: to be absorbed or immersed by it. An experience can therefore be divided in four 
domains: education, aesthetic, entertainment, and escapist, which are all provided by the 
museum. Furthermore, it may be possible to give meaning to an experience by being 
enabling, engaging, enlightening or educating. From the demand side, it is possible to get 
information on the visitors by doing visitor research. Important information can be obtained 
on the visitors’ profile, this makes it possible to segment the visitors in groups and to gain 
knowledge on how visitors perceive the services. Furthermore it can provide information on 
what service elements visitors appreciate and what type of experiences they prefer or have at 
the museum. Falk and Dierking created a model of the different contexts that visitors 
experience at the museum, which makes it understandable how visitors interpret all different 
elements of a service (1992). As Tufts and Milne emphasize, research linking the supply and 
demand perspectives can provide insight in the changing nature of cultural organizations 
(1999). And by combining the theory of demand and supply, it is possible to explain how 
exchanges take place within a market (Towse, 2010). As a result, by combining the arts 
marketing tools of supply strategies and demand research a useful framework is provided to 
research and evaluate the practices for museums, which will be used for the empirical part of 
the research. 
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4 Objectives and Methodology 
 

4.1 Research approach 
 

In social research there are three different approaches: the positivist, the interpretive and the 
critical social science (Neuman, 2006). The focus of our research is on social behavior, 
therefore it has a clear predisposition towards the interpretive epistemology. Some 
components of the research can be positioned in the critical perspective as well, since the 
research aims to offer recommendations by observing effectiveness of actions and strategies 
of organizations. 

 

4.2 Research questions 
 

Our primary research question can be formulated as: 

To what extent is a sales gallery within photography museums an effective arts marketing 
strategy in terms of the total museum experience viewed from a supply and demand 
perspective? 

So our objective is to determine whether this activity is a successful arts marketing strategy 
from a total museum experience viewpoint. We will be looking at the supply side: the 
museum itself, as well as at the viewpoint of the visitor: the demand side. In order to get our 
result, sub-questions are made to allow a refinement of the answer: 

1) What are the arts marketing strategies considering the total museum experience of 
photography museums to add this activity of a sales gallery to the museum? 

2) How do the visitors of photography museums perceive the arts marketing strategy activity 
of a sales gallery within the total museum experience? 

These sub questions cover the perspectives of supply and demand; from both answers a 
general position on the effectiveness towards the additional service of a sales gallery within 
the museum can be made.  

 

4.3 Research strategy, design and methods 
 

To answer both sub questions a mixed methods approach with qualitative and quantitative 
strategies is chosen. With mixed methods it is possible to use multiple methods to explore the 
research question from different perspectives (Seale, 2011). Since we deal with a demand 
perspective and a supply perspective, a combination of both strategies enables us to 
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understand the complex issue of the arts marketing strategy from both viewpoints. The 
research design is a comparative case study; case studies aim to produce in-depth 
understanding of organizational or social processes by an intensive analysis of complex data 
situated in a social context (Bryman, 2008). A comparative case study makes it possible to 
research two or more cases using identical methods. In this research the three case studies are 
FOAM Amsterdam, the Photographers’ Gallery London and the House of Photography 
Hamburg. The intention was to compare both demand and supply for every case, to be able to 
answer the main research question for every situation, and to compare cases with each other. 
Unfortunately, this was not possible, as we were not permitted to do a demand study at the 
Photographers’ Gallery in London. Therefore, the research is imbalanced, as we have three 
cases from the viewpoint of supply, and only two cases from the viewpoint of demand. In 
spite of this imbalance, we decided to keep the supply study of the Photographers’ Gallery 
within the research as interesting elements were discovered. With the analysis of all three 
cases, connections between theory and practice can be made and a comparison of major 
themes and patterns is possible. 

Accordingly the empirical research is divided in two parts, a qualitative research and a 
quantitative research. To research the supply side perspective for all three case studies, a 
qualitative method is chosen. Qualitative research is useful to explore a field of research and 
its foundations (Bryman, 2008). Since the topic of this research is a phenomenon of which we 
do not have any knowledge from other studies, the necessary information is gained by semi-
structured interviews. With semi-structured interviews it is possible to get in-depth 
information on the specific topic of a sales gallery within the museum and this method can be 
repeated for all interviewees (Seale, 2004). It is possible to generate scope information, as the 
interview can be long and the interviewee does not have to write down the answers; 
furthermore complex questions can be explained to the interviewee. First a preliminary study 
was conducted to gain general information on the topic for every case, this was done by desk 
research. On the basis of this preliminary study, an interview guide was created covering all 
relevant topics used during the semi-structured interviews. Adjustments were made 
depending on the responds of the interviewee. The motivations for the semi-structured 
interview are recapped in the figure below (fig. 9).  

Necessity Approach 

Explore a field of research 

In-depth data collection 

Sample  

Representative comparable findings 

Qualitative approach 

Semi-structured interviews 

Professionals working at the museums 

Interview guide covering all topics, based on a 
preliminary study 

9 – METHODOLOGICAL CHOICES FOR THE QUALITATIVE PART, own elaboration 

The second part is a quantitative study in which the demand side is researched. A market 
study among the current visitors of the cases in Amsterdam and Hamburg is done to analyze 
how they perceive the activity of a sales gallery within the museum. We have made the 
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methodological choice for self-completion questionnaires. With self-completions 
questionnaires it is possible to reach a large sample group within limited time, and it is 
possible to gain unbiased information, as more people can fill out the questionnaires at the 
same time and the researcher is not directly involved when they fill out the survey (Bryman, 
2008). Furthermore interview effects, prejudices and social desirable biases are diminished. 
The questionnaires were undertaken among visitors of both case studies to research the 
demand for this activity. By handing out the questionnaires personally in the museum, the 
response rate is maximized and this makes it easier to be sure they actually have visited the 
museum. In the figure below the motivations for the quantitative part is summarized (fig. 10). 

Necessity Approach 

Represent a large population 

Unbiased data collection 

High respond rate 

Representative museum visitors sample 

Quantitative approach 

Self-completion questionnaires 

Personal administration 

Location within the museum 

10 – METHODOLOGICAL CHOICES FOR THE QUANTITATIVE PART, own elaboration 

In the end the objective is to link supply and demand in all case studies, although this will not 
be possible for the Photographers’ Gallery. For the other two cases a comparison can be made 
and conclusions can be drawn whether this activity can be considered an effective arts 
marketing strategy regarding the theory of the total museum experience. In the following text 
the methodology for the research is further explained, with an extensive description of the 
research strategies, designs and methods used. At last, challenges and solutions for the 
empirical research are described. In the figure below the construction of the research is 
summarized, including the strategic, methodological and design decisions (fig. 11). 
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 Strategy Design Methods 

Main Research Question 

To what extent is a sales gallery within photography 
museums an effective arts marketing strategy in terms of the 
total museum experience viewed from a supply and demand 
perspective? 

Mixed methods: 
Qualitative and 
Quantitative 

Comparative Case 
Study 

Desk – 
research 

Semi-
structured 
interviews 

Surveys 

Sub question 1 

What are the arts marketing strategies considering the total 
museum experience of photography museums to add this 
activity of a sales gallery to the museum? 

Qualitative Case study 1: FOAM 

Case study 2: The 
Photographers’ 
Gallery 

Case study 3: House 
of Photography 

Preliminary 
study 

Semi-
structured 
interviews 

Sub question 2 

How do the visitors of photography museums perceive the 
arts marketing strategy activity of a sales gallery within the 
total museum experience? 

Quantitative Case study 1: FOAM 

Case study 2: House 
of Photography 

Surveys 

11 – CONSTRUCTION OF THE RESEARCH, own elaboration 

4.4 Qualitative part 
 
The first part of the empirical research is the qualitative part. The interviews provide data 
generation to find the reasons for adding this new activity to the total museum experience of 
the researched photography museums, and answers the following question: What are the arts 
marketing strategies considering the total museum experience of photography museums to 
add this activity of a sales gallery to the museum?  

The following sub-questions are made, to answer this question: 
a) How has the museum interpreted the arts marketing components for the activity of selling 
photography editions within the museum? 
b) What is the museum trying to add to the total museum experience by having a sales 
gallery? 
c) What strategies does the museum use in offering this additional activity of a sales gallery?  

Sampling 

Several photography museums were contacted, all of them having a sales gallery within the 
museum where they sell photography editions. Selection criteria were that the museums all 
sell them within the museum; that this activity has commercial goals; that they sell 
photography editions of living artists, or of photographers’ estates which are signed, equally 
as photography editions sold by commercial galleries. Thus they distinguish themselves from 
a museum shop by selling limited edition art works, no merchandize. The museums 
approached were: Fotografiska Stockholm, Fotomuseum Winterthur, FOAM Amsterdam, 
Deichtorhallen Hamburg and the Photographers’ Gallery, London. Targeted participants were 
staff members working at the sales gallery department, or working at the museum with 
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sufficient knowledge on the sales gallery. As the aim is a comparative case study, first 
Fotografiska and FOAM were approached to cooperate with interviews of one hour. As 
Fotografiska refused to cooperate, the Photographers’ Gallery was approached. After this, 
also Fotomuseum Winterthur and the House of Photography in Hamburg were contacted. In 
the end, FOAM, the Photographers’ Gallery and the House of Photography were willing to 
cooperate. 

The semi-structured interviews were conducted with Marloes Krijnen, director of FOAM, 
Floor Haverkamp, director of Foam Editions, Gemma Barnett, Print Sales manager at the 
Photographers’ Gallery, Ingo Taubhorn, curator of House of Photography and Michael Klein-
Reitzenstein, director of the photobook shop at the House of Photography. These people are 
considered to have specific knowledge on this topic and give access to a representation of the 
aims and arts marketing strategies of the sales galleries within the museums. The interview 
with FOAM was conducted in October 2013, the one with the Photographers’ Gallery in 
January 2014 and the interview with the House of Photography in February 2014.  

Data Collection Methodology 

In preparation for the semi-structured interviews, general information was collected regarding 
the different organizations and its activity of a sales gallery. All these documents included 
information on the organizations’ mission, the program and photographers of the sales 
gallery, their formula and their organizational structure. We have created a summary of the 
general information on the activity of a sales gallery for every museum below: 

At FOAM, limited editions of photographs can be bought at Foam Editions (www.foam.org). 
This gallery represents a selection of signed prints by young talented photographers at 
attractive prices. In addition, Foam asks celebrated international photographers who have 
already exhibited their work at the museum or who are scheduled to have an exhibition there 
to make a ‘special edition’ to be sold at Foam Editions. Foam Editions does not specifically 
represent photographers, they only represent a selection of works that are offered as a limited 
edition. Besides prints it offers a selection of signed photo books or copies with limited – 
edition prints. Additionally, they organize collecting courses to help first-time photography 
buyers. During these courses participants learn about the basic elements of the process of 
acquiring photographic works. The revenues from Foam Editions are used to help set up 
permanent educational projects and to further expand the Foam collection. FOAM added the 
activity of a sales gallery to its operations in 2007.  

The Print Sales department of the Photographers’ Gallery is a commercial gallery. It stages 
exhibitions of group and solo work for sale throughout the year 
(www.thephotographersgallery.org.uk). They represent thirty-five photographers, which are 
acclaimed contemporary photographers offered at affordable prices. Furthermore it offers 
rare buying opportunities through a Gallery Edition scheme, which is a scheme that offers 
previously unavailable work by some of the biggest names in photography today related to 
the exhibitions of the Photographers’ Gallery. Print Sales provides expert advice to a new 
generation of collectors as well as major buyers, corporate collections and public institutions. 
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It also offers a guide to collecting photography. All profits from Pint Sales return to support 
the public program of The Photographers’ Gallery. The Photographers’ Gallery was founded 
in 1971, since then Print Sales has been operating as part of the museum. 

At the House of Photography, special photography editions are offered for sale 
(www.deichterhallen.de). The editions are presented at a wall within the exhibition space of 
the museum and they are visible on the website. The editions on offer are always related to 
the exhibitions of the museum and specially made for the House of Photography. The aim is 
to offer low priced editions in smaller sizes and in higher multiples than at galleries, to create 
an opportunity for the visitors to have a piece of art at home. The profits from the editions 
support the museums operating budget. Ever since its existence in 2005, the House of 
Photography offers the editions for sale. All three sales galleries have commercial goals. Print 
Sales and the Photographers’ Gallery both have a separated space within the museum 
designed to function as the sales gallery. Furthermore Print Sales and the Photographers’ 
Gallery both present themselves as sales galleries at art fairs. This is not the case at the House 
of Photography. 

An interview guide, which is attached in the appendix (Appendix A), has been made covering 
all the topics based on the literature review. The interview guide follows a clear schedule, 
although it is used flexibly in the interviews. This guide forms an important structural basis 
for the three case studies; it provides a composition for case comparability in the coding and 
analyzing phase of the research (Bryman, 2008). The interview guide is divided into three 
parts and contains questions covering all topics to be sure all three sub questions can be 
answered. At every museum the overall interview time with the staff lasted approximately 
one hour and all interviews are recorded and transcribed. The complete transcriptions are 
filed in the archive of the author of this thesis. The interview texts as well as the recordings 
can be retrieved by the researcher upon request. The symbols used in the transcriptions are 
according to the transcription system of Jefferson (Seale, 2004). As Seale describes, an 
important distinction in the analysis of the material of the interview is to treat it as a topic or 
as a resource (2004). We have chosen for the viewpoint of resource, since the interviews are 
reports of the experience of the interviewees. The data from the interviews provide directions 
for future research on this phenomenon and are an effort to investigate arts marketing 
strategies for additional services in practice. 

Focus of the interviews 

The literature review provided insight into arts marketing strategies for museums. Based on 
these theories the sub questions were made. To answer these sub questions the following 
themes form the basis for the interview guide: 

Part 1 

Components of the 7P’s: product, price, place and promotion, people, process and physical 
environment. A focus in the interview on these arts marketing components makes it possible 
to determine how the museum has strategically chosen to use these elements.  
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Part 2 

The addition of value to the total museum experience by this activity. An interview topic will 
focus on how the museum tries to stimulate or influence the visitors’ total museum 
experience with the sales gallery. Questions are designed on determining which of the four 
domains of the museum experience their focus is and whether it uses methods to create a 
meaningful experience.  

Part 3 

Arts marketing strategies. Arts marketing strategies are set by museums to achieve different 
goals, and to balance the economic issues and constraints of the market with the importance 
of meeting the artistic and cultural mission of the organization. This topic will create an 
understanding on what the museum is trying to achieve with this additional service, and how 
its strategy affects the total museum experience offering. 

Coding and Analysis Procedure 

The grounded theory framework is used to analyze the interviews, which can provide 
concepts derived from the data that are collected systematically and are analyzed through the 
research process (Bryman, 2008). This method creates a framework by coding the textual 
data of the interview, which seeks to analyze the texts in terms of the presence and frequency 
of specific terms, narratives and concepts (Seale, 2004). This analysis can map the 
motivations and strategies that caused the development of a sales gallery within the 
photography museum, and how this fits within the total museum experience theory. The 
purpose of the coding is to exclude irrelevant material and to group things together that are 
similar. First, the open coding method was used, to classify general concepts. Then categories 
were developed to group the general concepts (Bryman, 2008). This is done with a qualitative 
thematic analysis and then subcategories were created. Unexpected issues that emerged 
during the interview are also taken into consideration. This way, a set of codes is developed 
that reflects the aims of the research question of the qualitative part of the research, it enables 
the identification of patterns between topics and makes comparisons possible with the related 
theories. The final coding scheme is attached in the Appendix (Appendix B). Simultaneously, 
this framework is used to interpret the content of the interviews. 

 

4.5 Quantitative part 
 

The second part is the quantitative research in which surveys are undertaken to gain insight in 
the demand for this activity. The objective of this part is to research the opinion of the visitors 
on the additional service of a sales gallery within the museum seen from the total museum 
experience viewpoint. The aim of the quantitative part is to answer the question: How do the 
visitors of photography museums perceive the arts marketing strategy activity of a sales 
gallery within the total museum experience? 
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Sub questions are designed to refine the different elements of this additional service:  
a) What is the opinion of the visitors on the product, price, place and promotion arts 
marketing components of the 7 P’s framework for selling photography editions within the 
museum?  
b) How do they perceive the people, process and physical environment arts marketing 
components of the 7 P’s framework that can influence the social and physical contexts of the 
visitors within the total museum experience? 
c) What does the sales gallery add to the total museum experience in the opinion of the 
visitors? 

The methods to present each question to the respondents in the survey will be explained later 
on in this chapter.  

Sampling 

We want to represent a large population of respondents for every museum, however decisions 
in choosing the right sample size are somewhat arbitrary as there is no rule of thumb in 
determining the sample size is social research (Aguinis & Harden, 2009). Bryman observes 
the precision of research is affected by the sample size, which diminishes after a mark of 
1000 (2008). However this size was unachievable due to time constrains. Therefore the 
sample size is decided upon the indication of Hill et al., who advices a sample size with 300 
as a minimum (2003). This is one of the reasons why the quantitative approach is used. To 
collect the surveys, we positioned ourselves in the museum with permission of the staff 
working at the museum. We considered the best position in a hallway between the various 
exhibition halls. These way museum visitors have some time to fill out the surveys, and we 
were able to approach them, without disturbing them. We decided handing out the surveys 
within the museum between exhibition floors, and not at the sales gallery, to have a 
representation of the average museum visitor. The sampling occurred randomly, with each 
first entering visitor being approached to participate in the research. In the month December 
2013 all data was collected at FOAM, including one test day. In the month of February 2014 
all data was collected at the House of Photography. In total 330 surveys were collected from 
each museum. The small excess making it possible to compensate for some missing data.  

Questionnaire Design 

The questionnaire design is a single page, with a clear overview of all questions and how to 
answer them. This to make sure that the visitors know what to expect, and how many 
questions need to be answered. The survey has been tested among different people and 
among a group of visitors beforehand to make sure the questions were clear and 
unambiguous, and to secure that all the questions are understandable and interpreted in the 
same way. The final survey was a modified version, after several times of receiving feedback 
from the test respondents. Main changes were making the questions shorter, and the 
introduction text was changed to be more obvious it is about their opinion as a visitor of the 
museum and not necessarily as a visitor of the sales gallery.  
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Firstly, we must assume that not all respondents are aware of the existence of a sales gallery 
within the museum. Secondly, the specificity of our topic requires some background 
information for respondents. Therefore an introduction text was included, that explains three 
main points: first, a short explanation what the sales gallery is; second, that the visitor is 
asked his/her opinion about the sales gallery; third, that it is not a requirement to already 
know about the sales gallery to participate in the research. The final introduction text can be 
found in the questionnaires in the appendix (Appendix C). The questionnaires were handed 
out in the native language and in English, to make sure that international visitors could 
participate in the research as well. 

Then respondents were asked to fill out some questions with socio-demographic variables 
that could be interesting for possible correlations. These questions were: 

• Gender, which is dichotomous.  

• Age, ratio.  

• Citizenship, dichotomous: Dutch / non – Dutch, or German / non - German.  

• Education level, ordinal with multiple choices, based on a general division in the 
education system: primary school, secondary school, higher education and university. 

• If visited in the past 12 months, dichotomous. 

• Number of visits in the past 12 months, ratio.  

After the socio-demographic part, the survey presents three parts. The first part answers the 
first sub question, the second part the second sub question, and the third presents the third sub 
question. These three parts have a total of 23 elements. The attitude of the visitors is 
measured in terms of agreement with a 5-point Likert scale, which is a multiple-indicator of a 
set of attitudes that relate to a particular area (Bryman, 2008). With the Likert scale it is 
possible to measure the intensity of feelings. The scale presents numerical labels from 1 to 5, 
with explanation that 1 resembles “totally disagree”, until 5 which resembles “totally agree”. 
The choice of a 5-point is made by the motivation of Cicchettie, Shoinralter and Tyer and 
Likert that reliability is best at 5 or 7 points (1985; 1923). The structure of the Likert items is 
outlined in the table below (fig. 12).  

The first part aims to provide statements on the first four arts marketing concepts of the 7 P’s 
framework: product, price, place and promotion. Here the opinion is asked of the visitor on 
different important aspects of those four concepts. The first question also provides us 
information on the general opinion of the additional service of a sales gallery within the 
museum. The second part researches the 7 P’s marketing concepts specifically for services: 
people, process and physical environment. These three elements are strongly connected with 
the total museum experience contexts: social and physical. Therefore, with this part 
information is obtained about how these tactics could influence these contexts as well. The 
third part combines questions about the total museum experience and giving meaning to this 
experience. These two are combined because to give meaning to an experience four different 
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methods are possible: by enabling, by educating, by engaging and enlightening. The first two, 
enabling and educating are already covered in the four domains of the total museum 
experience, since enabling is the additional service itself, and educating is covered by the 
educational domain. Hence, only extra questions are added regarding engaging and 
enlightening.  

Part 1: 4 P’s Part 2: Service elements Part 3: Experience characteristics 

1 - Item related to product: 
photography editions 
2 - Item related to product: 
young, new talent 
3 – Item related to product: 
related to exhibitions 
4 - Item related to price: 
below €7.000,- 
5- Item related to place: 
separate room 
6 - Item related to place: 
within the museum 
7 – Item related to place: 
prominent location 
8 - Item related to promotion: 
independent promotion 

9 - Item related to people: expert 
advice 
10 - Item related to people: 
interact other visitors 
11 – Item related to physical 
environment: comfortable 
12 – Item related to physical 
environment: permanent location 
13 - Item related to process: buy 
photography 
14 - Item related to process: 
talk about buying photography 

 

15 – Item related to enabling: additional 
experience 
16 – Item related to enabling: new 
experience with photography 
17 - Item related to educational: learn 
about buying photography 
18 - Item related to aesthetic: 
immersed by the editions 
19 – Item related to escapist: 
stimulates becoming a collector 
20 – Item related to entertaining: fun 
21 - Item related to enlightening: 
inspiring 
22 - Item related to enlightening: 
increase happiness 
23 – Item related to engaging: 
more socially and culturally involved 

12 – QUESTIONNAIRE LIKERT ITEMS, own elaboration 
 
Coding and Analysis Procedure 

The results of the surveys are analyzed with SPSS, which will produce ordinal variables for 
the Likert items. The discussion exists that Likert-scales could be measured as interval 
variables due to the large number of categories (Kislenko & Grevholm, 2008). However, we 
remained with the dominating opinion that strictly they are ordinal in nature and therefore we 
analyzed the data as ordinal-type (Bryman, 2008; Field & Miles, 2010).  

 

4.6 Validity and credibility 
 

To increase validity, some different aspects where taken into consideration while conducting 
the interviews. The first is face validity: first of all, the people interviewed have knowledge 
of the area researched. Second, construct validity is increased, since the questions asked at 
the interviews all considered theories from the literature review. An interview guide was 
prepared, the questions where tested beforehand to make sure the question indicated the 
concepts used, and whether all concepts of the literature were covered. If terms were not clear 
during the interview, the definitions and concepts were explained before they answered the 
questions. With the comparison of concepts, Foam Editions, Print Sales and Editions, it is 
possible to compare them and to increase concurrent criterion validity. External validity and 
generalization concerns are not as important for the qualitative part as they are for the 
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quantitative part, as the goal of the interviews is to provide an in-depth analysis of both cases 
(Bryman, 2008).  

To increase validity for the quantitative part, some different aspects where taken into 
consideration while constructing and handing out the surveys. First, face validity is 
established by testing the survey first with other students who have knowledge of the topic to 
make sure all concepts were covered and whether the questions were relevant to the research. 
Then the survey was tested among visitors at FOAM one day, before starting the actual 
research, to be sure that all questions were understood and that all concepts were clear and 
understandable for them. The final survey was the result of several adjustments after the tests, 
after this, the survey was not changed anymore. Considering the many questions it was hard 
to add control questions to the survey, since the survey would not fit on one page. However, 
several questions touch upon similar points; these serve as control questions to confirm the 
validity of the responses. Our location made sure to represent the average museum visitor. 
However, it could be that only people who were more interested in the museum (and not the 
gallery in particular) were willing to cooperate, while others could refuse to fill out the 
survey.  

In the end, the results of the interviews and the surveys are compared and analyzed, so that 
conclusions can be drawn (chapter 7). Recommendations are given for both museums on 
what can be improved considering their strategies (chapter 7). 

 

4.7 Possible challenges and solutions 
 

Since the research topic considers the marketing strategies of the organizations, it could be 
that the interviewees are reluctant in revealing the strategies of their organizations. To make 
sure they wanted to cooperate and would reveal their strategies in the interviews, all 
cooperating organizations are asked whether they wanted to sign a confidentiality agreement. 
This agreement makes sure the information will only be used for this research and will not be 
published anywhere else than in this thesis. However, all organizations did not find that 
necessary. Furthermore, it could be that the interviewees are not familiar with the arts 
marketing concepts discussed in the questions, and therefore might feel uncomfortable during 
the interview or do not know how to answer them. Therefore, these theories were explained 
when they were not familiar with it, so they could answer the questions properly. 

Regarding the questionnaire, it could be that the visitors are not aware of the existence of a 
sales gallery within the museum, or have not made use of this service before. Therefore the 
survey is designed to only ask their opinion about this service. It is not necessary that they 
already made use of it before. This is described in the introduction of the survey.  

We were not able to explain the used arts marketing concepts in the survey for the visitors. 
Therefore the questions were designed to be understandable even without any knowledge on 
these concepts. For that reason it could be that the visitors might not exactly understand what 
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information we are trying collect and the survey as a whole might therefore be confusing or a 
bit vague. We have tried to diminish this affect by staying close to the visitors who were 
filling out the surveys, and offer the possibility for them to ask questions about the survey at 
the researcher. Additionally, the topic researched in the questionnaires are services and 
experiences, these are holistic for the visitors. It could therefore be that the visitors may find 
it difficult to have an opinion on the different elements of the service or the experience. To 
make sure we still received the correct information from them, our main focus was to make 
every single question as clear as possible, and we have taken these risks into consideration 
while analyzing the surveys. 

Questionnaires always have the risk that respondents are filling in the questionnaire at 
random and are just ticking boxes (Adam & Brace, 2006). Another risk exists that visitors 
can not fill out the survey in their leisure time, therefore the risk that the validity of the 
answers could be threatened is present, since they are not interested in the subject or they 
could be in a hurry. Therefore, as mentioned before, the survey was tested and limited to one 
page. 
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5 Qualitative Analysis 
 

“A question for museums is how best to organize the museum-going experience so as to offer a deeper 
level of meaning than theme parks yet also makes it inviting, orienting, and comfortable.”4 

 

In this chapter the semi-structured interviews with FOAM, the Photographers’ Gallery and 
the House of Photography are analyzed. The transcripts of the interviews are filed in the 
archive of the author of this thesis. A set of codes is developed from the textual data of the 
interviews as a guide to be able to answer the research question of the qualitative part: What 
are the arts marketing strategies considering the total museum experience of photography 
museums to add this activity of a sales gallery to the museum? This coding scheme is 
attached in the appendix (Appendix B). With this coding scheme, quotes and information 
from the interviews regarding these topics are classified. An extensive coding scheme with 
short descriptions and quotes concerning every code per interview can also be found in the 
appendix (Appendix D). Thereupon this framework is used to interpret and analyze the 
content of the interviews. In this chapter, the analysis is divided into three parts; these parts 
match the sub questions for the quantitative research mentioned in the previous chapter (4). 
Therefore we start with the arts marketing components of the 7 P’s framework of the activity 
of the sales gallery for all three museums. Then the characteristics of the total museums 
experience the museum wishes to create for its visitors with this activity are discussed. And at 
last the arts marketing strategies of every case study are described for this activity and 
compared.  

 

5.1 Arts marketing components 
 

As a starting point, the arts marketing components of the 7 P’s framework that is discussed in 
the literature review will be examined for the activity of the sales gallery for all museums 
researched. These components consist of product, price, place, promotion, people, physical 
environment and process, and can be used as a tool to find out what every museum wants to 
offer with the sales gallery. In the following text for every component the cases are compared 
and noticeable elements are discussed in order to get insight in how every museum has 
interpreted the arts marketing components for this activity. At last we consider how they try 
to synergize all these elements to create one rounded offer.  

Product 

The activity researched is part of the extended experience, it is related to the core product of 
the museum and it provides an extension to the experience for the consumer at the museum. 

4 (Pachter, in: Kotler &Kotler, 2000, p. 28) 
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The sales galleries provide the service to buy photography editions at the museum. At Print 
Sales and Foam Editions they also provide an information platform on collecting 
photography. In both cases they extend the sales gallery to the potential experience with this, 
as they want to attract potential collectors, and involve them with collecting. In Hamburg this 
is not the case, as they only offer the editions for sale and have not created an information 
platform surrounding this activity. 

Every case has a slightly different offer. One thing they all have in common is the offering of 
special editions of artists who exhibit at the museum. They mostly receive these images as 
gifts from the artists to sell at the sales galleries. These editions are from established artists, 
and in general there is already a demand for these editions. At the House of Photography this 
is the only offer of editions they have. At Foam Editions this is extended with special editions 
of young, emerging artists. For these editions they try to create a demand. Foam Editions also 
offers collecting courses, to extend the service of providing information on collecting 
photography. At Print Sales they also represent artists, next to the special offered editions. 
These artists are a combination of established, historical photographers and new, emerging 
talent. So they have a combination of an already existing demand and creating a demand. In 
addition they organize exhibitions of their artists at the sales gallery. 

Price 

FOAM and the House of Photography have a similar pricing strategy, they set the prices in 
consultation with the artist or the representive gallery. They have prices in the lower segment, 
to attract the museum visitor, and the non-collector. They are able to offer low prices, 
because the artist is emerging, and therefore still affordable, or they create larger editions in 
smaller sizes. For the House of Photography the price range is between € 500, - and € 1.000, -
. At Foam Editions this is between € 125, - and € 3.000, -. At Print Sales they work 
differently with prices: they try to set the prices at the lower end, at price brackets of which 
they think the editions will sell. They try to grow the artists’ careers, to grow demand, and 
therefore to increase the prices. They have no price limit within their offering. 

Place 

All three museums offer the editions within the building. At FOAM, Foam Editions has its 
own floor, at Print Sales they have their own space in the basement. Foam Editions has its 
own opening hours which not always correspond with the opening hours of the museum. At 
Print Sales, they have the same opening hours as the rest of the museum, which makes them 
more accessible. At the House of Photography they try to have a wall for editions with every 
exhibition; however this is not always possible due to little wall space. If they have a wall, 
the editions are always visible when the museum is open and as a result they are very 
accessible. However, the House of Photography endorses that not having a permanent 
location appears to be problematic for the accessibility of this activity. 
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Promotion 

The promotional activities of the sales galleries are mostly linked with the promotional 
activities of the museums as a whole. So the activities of Foam Editions, Print Sales and 
Editions of the House of Photography are communicated by the websites of the museums. 
Other communication forms are by the social media channels of the museums and the 
newsletter. Some independent promotional activities are present at FOAM and the 
Photographers’ Gallery such as a flyer. Print Sales has its own marketing poster in the 
window of the museum. And Foam Editions and Print Sales are present at art fairs. 
Additionally, Foam Editions and Print Sales both have direct marketing activities, they have 
their own mailing lists and personal contact with the regular clients. They often organize 
special events, or previews to create long-term relationships. FOAM and the Photographers’ 
gallery both state in the interview that it is sometimes problematic to promote the sales 
gallery within the overall promotional strategy of the museum. As it is a different activity 
than the exhibitions the museum organizes, and visitors do not always understand this.  

Service: People 

At Print Sales and Foam Editions there is always someone present at the sales gallery. They 
want to offer the service of providing information on collecting photography to their visitors. 
Moreover at Print Sales and Foam Editions they try to get people in conversation with each 
other on collecting. At Foam Editions they do this with the collecting courses, and the special 
previews at the sales gallery. At Print Sales they underline this as well and they organize 
special events for their clients: “And we gave them a way of meeting some of the other 
people in the gallery, our colleagues, other collectors, the director, and just having a sort of an 
intimate experience at the gallery really excites them, and it makes them feel included.” They 
both really try to make people feel more involved with collecting photography and to make 
them meet other people in this social sphere. At the House of Photography this is not the 
case: the exhibited editions are in the exhibition hall, while in the bookshop the owner is 
present who can answer questions and sell the artworks. So if somebody has questions or 
wants to buy something, he or she has to go to the bookshop. 

Service: Physical Environment 

At the House of Photography the editions are on a wall in the exhibition room near the 
entrance, with information signs that it is for sale. At Print Sales the staff decided over the 
physical environment of the location. They choose to give it a different lay out than the rest 
of the gallery. They try to create an environment that is: “…accessible, make it welcoming, 
and hopefully that would appeal to anyone.” They do not show prices next to the artworks on 
show. Foam Editions is located in the attic of the building, it therefore looks differently than 
the rest of the museum. However, the aesthetics inside are designed in the same style as the 
rest of the museum. Furthermore there are signs on the wall next to every edition with 
information on the artist, the title, the price and the material, mainly to make clear the works 
are for sale.  
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Service: Process 

There are two main ways to buy an edition at the House of Photography: with Michael Klein-
Reitzenstein in the photo bookstore, or people can contact him by mail or on the phone and 
the sale will be arranged. At Print Sales they experience that interested people most of the 
time did some research before on the website and approach them in the gallery, or they call 
them. At Foam Editions, if someone buys a work they have contact with the staff of editions, 
and they pay there and receive an invoice. Additionally, people can order the work online by 
the web shop. 

These three elements make clear that the House of Photography does have the extra service 
that it is possible to buy editions at the museum, yet it has no specific focus on the people, 
how the process goes and the physical environment of this service. It functions more like an 
add-on that happens between all the other things the museum has to offer and is managed by 
the bookshop owner. Foam Editions and Print Sales for mostly try to offer the extra service 
that it is possible to buy photography editions at the museum. With this service they want to 
give the opportunity for visitors to learn more about collecting photography. They try to offer 
this by creating a welcoming physical environment where people can have personal contact 
with the staff and ask for advice, furthermore the process to buy an artwork is always with the 
same contact person.  

Synergy 

At the House of Photography the marketing components of the editions are not developed yet 
into a synergized activity, although they are aware that that might be necessary to be more 
successful. At Print Sales and Foam Editions it looks like they try to fit all the elements 
together if this is possible. Both are restricted by the location and the promotion, as these are 
decided by the museum as a whole. Nevertheless, when we look at all the elements, it appears 
that Foam Editions and Print Sales have synergized most of the marketing components such 
as price, physical environment, process, people and place to make everything fit within their 
strategy.  

These different elements make clear that there is a different level of development of this 
activity between the museums. Print Sales is the oldest example, and the most professional 
one. They are the only case where they actually represent artists and organize exhibitions, 
therefore they function as a commercial gallery. At FOAM they professionalized this activity 
by creating a permanent gallery space within the museum for Foam Editions and by having 
one staff member managing the Foam Editions fulltime. They did not professionalize the in- 
and outflow of editions yet, because it is still in its infancy. The House of Photography has 
developed the activity the least, they offer editions at the museum, but they do not have 
anybody fully responsible for this activity. They do not have a permanent space, contrasting 
to the other cases, and have not thought about synergizing all the arts marketing components 
yet. 
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5.2 Characteristics of the total museum experience 
 

We will continue analyzing what value the three museums try to add to the experience of the 
visitors with this extra activity. The first part evaluates the four domains of the total museum 
experience as discussed in the literature review and compares the three museums researched. 
After this, the characteristics of a meaningful experience are discussed and analyzed, making 
an overview of what kind of experience every case tries to create and how they do this.  

Total Museum Experience 

At all three museums it is stimulated to have an escapist experience. At Foam Editions they 
try to make people aware that the visible art is for sale, people can participate actively by 
buying art at Foam Editions and immerse in the collecting experience. At Print Sales they try 
to create an escapist experience by making the visitors realize they can buy art: “To feel 
empowered, and to feel a sense of how it is to be an art collector.” At the House of 
Photography the escapist experience is stimulated, because the artworks are for sale. The 
curator explains this: “…a lot of people see the exhibition and maybe they can live the 
experience of the exhibition a bit at home […] that you experience art at home, that it gets 
further then the museum.”  

FOAM and the Photographers’ Gallery emphasize the importance of the educational domain. 
Foam Editions and Print Sales both try to provide this by having personal contact with the 
visitors and providing information on collecting. Foam Editions organizes courses on 
collecting. At Print Sales they try to provide the visitors all the information they want and 
need on collecting photography, like the manager explains: “I think we are just trying to offer 
the first insight into how to start a collection. So our service here is to give people an 
opportunity to learn about collecting, and to begin with collecting artworks.” At the House of 
Photography they realize that the educational experience is an important element of the 
service of editions, however they have not the sufficient time, money and people to add this 
to their offer. It is remarkable that all three museums state that it is important to educate the 
visitors, in order to actually sell an edition. Like the manager of Foam Editions explains: “So 
I think and a product but also the service of creating a bridge between the collector and a 
gallery. (Dus ik denk én een product maar ook de service van een brug slaan tussen de 
verzamelaar en een galerie.)” So the educational domain is important to stimulate active 
participation; it is the first step from absorbing the activity to being immersed by it. Hence, 
the educational domain continues in the escapist domain: learning about collecting continues 
in collecting itself.  

Print Sales definitely puts most effort in the aesthetic domain as they organize exhibitions on 
their own. This is related to the fact that they actually represent artists, like the manager 
explains: “…the idea of having exhibitions, it was really important for us to being able to 
engage the public with an individual artist, to promote an artist. And without that the artists 
did not really want to be here either.” At FOAM it is also possible to have an aesthetic 
experience: “First of all, it is of course outside the exhibits, or at least there is a lot more to 
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see than just the photographer of the four exhibitions that we have here at the moment. (Ten 
eerste, het staat natuurlijk buiten de tentoonstellingen, of tenminste er is veel meer te zien dan 
alleen de fotograaf van de vier tentoonstellingen die we hier dan op dat moment hebben.)” At 
the House of Photography they consciously decided to show the editions in the general 
exhibition hall. They do this to let people see them as special as the other artworks exhibited, 
like the curator explains: “Because when it is shown in the exhibition hall, it makes all the 
editions look a bit more important, than when it is shown in the bookstore.” So visitors can 
watch the editions passively and be immersed by it and have an aesthetic experience. 

At all three museums the entertaining experience is possible, however this is not their focus. 
At Foam Editions this is possible as people can just sit and relax in the space, and absorb the 
environment and what is happening there. At Print Sales the entertaining experience is 
stimulated in a passive way, as they try to create an experience where people feel welcome 
and comfortable. At the House of Photography this is also possible, as the editions are in the 
exhibition hall and people can absorb them by remaining passive. As the literature already 
mentioned, the entertaining experience can be applied to every aspect of the museum 
experience outside the actual art. In all three museums this is the case.  

As these examples show, museums can add many extended activities to their offerings that 
extend the different types of experiences visitors have. The categorization into four domains, 
divided into participation levels and absorbing/immersive appears to be a very helpful tool to 
analyze the different characteristics of the created experience. In these cases, adding a sales 
gallery to the museum in some way stimulates all four domains, foremost the escapist and 
aesthetic experiences. However it needs to be mentioned that it is still dependent on the 
visitor, as he or she decides how intense he/she wants to participate and what kind of domain 
the experience will reach.  

Meaningful Experience 

All three museums try to transform the visitor by enabling, they all offer the extra service that 
the visitors can buy photography editions at the museum and want to make the collecting of 
photography easier and more accessible. At the House of Photography they explain: “The 
barrier is very much lower, yes. When people buy photographs, prints here, these are 
normally other clients, they come more from books, and then they see okay, you have nice 
prints, they are not as expensive as the gallery prints, and then they start buying.” At Print 
Sales, the enabling experience is even more extended, as they really provide the experience of 
a commercial gallery within the museum: “And so, I think a lot of people that come in here 
would never, never have otherwise had that experience of walking into a commercial gallery, 
and we are in fact working in exactly the same way as a commercial gallery.” The House of 
Photography and Print Sales both mention that people could buy art as an investment. The 
House of Photography believes that this is not the case for the editions they offer: “I think 
people buy editions because they think I like this image, it is an artwork but it does not costs 
so much, but it is not an investment.” At Print Sales, they do believe that investment is one of 
the reasons that people buy editions, because in the unstable financial times, it could be a 
stable investment and people get to enjoy the work in their home. This could be categorized 
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within an enabling experience, as the museum expands their offer for visitors and makes it 
possible for them to make investments.  

By increasing the knowledge of the consumers, they can be transformed. This educational 
aspect is already discussed within the total museum experience. All three museums state that 
this is important. However, Foam Editions and Print Sales integrated this in their activity, at 
the House of Photography this still is open to develop more in the future.  

The third option is by creating an engaging experience. In the literature this is explained as 
initiatives that improve social welfare and responsibility. We have already added that a 
cultural institution might use this to improve cultural involvement and responsibility, as they 
have a cultural mission. In all three interviews several elements of engaging are mentioned, 
however most of them focused on engaging with culture by transforming them into 
collectors, not necessarily by becoming more socially responsible. This is the case at Foam 
Editions and Print Sales, as both are conscious on creating activities to engage people more 
with photography, by making them realize they can buy photography. Like the manager of 
Print Sales explains: “And I think what it offers is the opportunity to engage at a collecting 
level whether you are in a position to buy or not.” The House of Photography is aware that 
personal contact is important, and that they have to create an experience by which people 
might get more involved to make them actually buy things and become collectors, but they 
have not developed this into their activity yet.  

It is noteworthy that Foam Editions and Print Sales not only want to transform people into 
collectors by creating an engaging experience, they also want to make people more involved 
with the museum with this activity. They are anticipating on the need of people to feel 
included within the photography world. The manager of Print Sales explains, they organize 
events for clients that “…wanted to engage and needed more experience, a more immersive 
experience in the gallery. And we gave them a way of meeting some of the other people in 
the gallery, our colleagues, other collectors, the director, and just having a sort of an intimate 
experience at the gallery really excites them, and it makes them feel included.” Likewise at 
Foam Editions the manager explains: “But just because they like to be part of that world. 
(Maar gewoon omdat ze het leuk vinden om er onderdeel van uit te maken van die hele 
wereld.)” Therefore they try to engage people, but contrasting to the literature, not to make 
them socially responsible, but to make them more involved with culture and their cultural 
organizations. 

The last element of a meaningful experience is enlightening. All three cases belief that having 
photography at home can create immaterial happiness for their visitors, that they can 
experience art at home, and enjoy it, whereas this is one of the main reasons why people buy 
editions. The manager of Print Sales explains: “And to be able to gain some happiness from a 
piece of work that you have on your wall, that you have always loved, and know that it is 
fairly save.” It is remarkable that the House of Photography mentions that they believe the 
editions mostly do not increase the immaterial happiness of their visitors, on the contrary, it 
brings disappointment. Because people see the exhibition, and are inspired to buy a work 
from the artist, but the editions never have the most popular artwork. The curator explains: 
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“…because sometimes you understand why a picture in an exhibition is a very important 
print, because a lot of people like it, but it is not possible from this print to make an edition. 
So, the way from the inner circle of the exhibition to the special room where you can see the 
picture, disappointments happen, a lot of disappointments happen.” He explains that people 
therefore turn to merchandizing, such as posters with the favorite image. So it might be worth 
to have a look at the strategy of the sales gallery and look for improvements as for now it 
does not create the experience they want it to be in Hamburg. 

On the whole, all three interviews demonstrate that the museums do try to create an 
experience in which a transformation takes place. First by enabling, with the sales gallery 
they make it easier to buy photography, and even in London to make an investment in art. At 
Foam Editions and the Photographers’ Gallery they also try to increase the knowledge on 
collecting. It is evident from the research that FOAM and the Photographers’ Gallery try to 
engage the people, and transform them to making them feel more culturally involved, and to 
make them feel more related with the organization with this experience. And at last, they all 
belief that culture can make them feel enlightened, that it can increase their immaterial 
happiness, by having art at home. So all four levels of transformation are in some way present 
with this experience to stimulate transformation. 

 

5.3 Arts marketing strategies 
 

Now that we have an overview of how each museum has considered the arts marketing 
components of the service provided at the sales gallery, and what kind of experience it wishes 
to create for its visitors with this, we can examine the arts marketing strategies set for the 
sales galleries. This is done to extend our understanding on why they perform this activity 
and why they added this to their museums’ offerings. For each museum, it is examined 
whether this activity is in alignment with the overall mission of the organization. The most 
important goals and objectives for this activity are described according to the three categories 
of audience goals, product goals and competitive goals by Kotler and Kotler (2000). After a 
global view of the strategy for every museum, noticeable similarities and differences between 
every case study are compared. So that in the end we have a clear overview of the strategies 
of this additional service for every museum and of noticeable aspects compared with each 
other.  

Case 1: Foam Editions 

The overall mission of FOAM is to create enthusiasm for photography in the widest sense 
with many different projects. In the interview they emphasize that they are cultural 
entrepreneurial, so they organize different activities to create more interest for its mission and 
for FOAM as an organization. The director explains: “That is what we are of course, we are 
cultural entrepreneurial. Yes it really is a circle, everything interacts or reflects with each 
other, everything comes together. (Want dat zijn we natuurlijk, we zijn cultureel 
ondernemend. Ja het is echt een cirkel, een wisselwerking van alles bij elkaar, alles komt wel 
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weer terug of samen.)” Foam Editions can be considered a cultural entrepreneurial activity 
that fits within its overall mission, as it is a new activity to create interest for collecting 
photography and it expands the offer of the museum with a sales activity that generates 
incomes to support the organization.  

Foam Editions tries to reach different audience groups. They have a client group of more 
experienced collectors, or people who are highly interested in photography. They try to 
organize private events for them and activities where they can talk about photography, to 
create a community around it. Another group is the first time buyers and interested audiences; 
for them they have the collecting course, and they want to reach them as a first information 
point on collecting photography at the museum. At last they have the visitors who encounter 
Foam Editions by accident during a visit at the museum; for them they try to be accessible 
and approachable. As explained before, they have divided their offer in two parts, the first 
part contains the special editions of established photographers related to the exhibitions, and 
the other part consists of special editions of young, emerging artists. Considering the 
organizational and competitive goals, they want to attract a different audience than a 
commercial gallery; therefore Foam Editions is located within the museum and the prices are 
in a lower segment. This makes the barrier to enter lower and they can be a platform where 
people can ask information on collecting photography: “So as a sort of first place, free of 
charge perhaps, to obtain noncommittal information on collecting photography. (Dus als een 
soort van eerste plek om gratis, misschien wel, vrijblijvend informatie te verkrijgen over 
verzamelen van fotografie.)” Moreover, they do not represent artists like commercial 
galleries; they only offer special editions. The profits Foam Editions generates are used for 
the educational projects of FOAM. They do not want to set strict goals and targets for Foam 
Editions for now, as they want it to develop organically and be able to adjust this to changes 
in the environment, so that they can remain sustainable. 

Case 2: the Photographers’ Gallery 

The mission of the Photographers’ Gallery is to present photography in all its forms 
(www.thephotographersgallery.org.uk). They came up with this activity of Print Sales, as 
they believed that collecting is an integral part of photography. In the offer of Print Sales they 
represent latest emerging talent, established artists and historical archives, which correspond 
with the mission of the institution as a whole. The additional activity of Prints Sales therefore 
fits within their overall strategy. Their general strategy is to remain self-sufficient and to be 
able to support the public gallery. The Print Sales used to be an add-on activity, but over the 
years it has become an absolutely central part of the institution to generate incomes. The 
manager explains that they try: “…to beat the target that they have set for us, or when we 
beat the amount of money we have made the year before and if we continue to grow what we 
are doing, and to continue to growing our business, grow the finances coming in from it.” 
Their vision is: “…to home what we do. And to make sure that what we do, we do really 
well.” So they want to look after the artists they represent, increase their profile, and to 
manage their clients. They try to remain flexible to be able to adjust things to make it 
function and work.  
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Since the Photographers’ Gallery is a public institution they have a very varied audience, as 
the manager explains: “…the gallery generally is trying to be a lot of things to a lot of 
different audiences. […] So we are always trying to find new stimulating ways to, at least to 
show anybody that they can collect art.” They have a client group of collectors; with this 
group they try to build long-term relationships. They try to engage the audience that has a 
slight interest or wants to buy their first artwork. For all the visitors that walk in at Print Sales 
they want to offer the opportunity to feel welcome and to feel encouraged to gain information 
on collecting photography. Prints Sales represents approximately 35 artists, and they offer 
special editions related to the exhibitions of the public gallery. They try to grow the careers of 
their artists. Print Sales has a very unique position in that they really function as a 
commercial gallery. Their position allows them to be an accessible platform for objective 
information on the photography market and to connect with clients who want to support a 
public institution. They try to strengthen this distinguishing position by adding new artists to 
their offering that have not been on the market yet. Due to this unique position they also 
experience a down side, as many visitors do not really understand what they do.  

Case 3: House of Photography 

The House of Photography is a museum that wants to show photography since its existence in 
the 19th century until now; herewith they do not only focus on artistic photography, they want 
to show all aspects of the medium (www.deichterhallen.de). Therefore having editions fits 
within this overall strategy, as collecting photography, having it at home, is part of the 
medium as well. Furthermore they find it important that all activities in their offer are of high 
quality; for editions this is safeguarded as they are always related to the exhibitions and as a 
result have the reputation of the artists they show in their exhibitions. So it fits within their 
overall mission. The House of Photography has not developed editions yet into a central part 
of the museum; it is more some kind of add-on. In the future they have to decide what they 
want with the editions, and set a strategy. The curator acknowledges this when he answers a 
question in the interview if the editions are successful now: “No, it is not successful. It could 
be more successful. But we have to think about what it ((the editions)) means for us. I think 
that we need more work to bring it out, to bring the understanding what it means to have this 
((the editions)).” For example, now editions is organized by the curator, who selects the 
editions, and organizes the exhibitions of the museum. And the bookshop owner sells them in 
his shop, while he runs the bookshop and their clients. If they want to expand the activities of 
editions, they might need someone who is responsible for editions fulltime. The curator 
explains: “Because we have a lot of very interesting images, a lot of very nice editions. We 
have done in the last ten years, there is a good gallery of this, but this is something where we 
have to think more about how can we develop selling these images.”  

The audience goal is to create an offer of editions attractive for the visitors of the museum 
and the non-collectors. They have not created a community around the editions to build long-
term relationships. A product goal is to offer the possibility to buy editions at the museum, 
this offer is related to the exhibitions. They select images of which they think they will sell.. 
They are more accessible than a normal commercial gallery, and they offer artworks at lower 
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prices. Additionally, the editions take advantage from the reputation of the museum. Overall 
the objective with editions is to generate incomes to support the museum. 

Comparisons and differences in strategies 

If we compare all three strategies, it is evident that all emphasize that they are organizations 
that want to show all aspects of photography to the public. Their missions encompass not 
only exhibiting photographic art works: showing the medium and what you can do with it is 
also part of their mission. The development of a sales gallery within the museum supports 
this mission: as they all agree that collecting is an important part of photography, the sales 
gallery is part of a broader strategic framework. So as described in the literature review, all 
three organizations are aware that they create a set of activities that fit together and match 
with the organizations’ mission (Kotler & Kotler, 2000).  

Moreover all three museums are aware that they have their artistic mission, and that they 
have to find a balance between the mission and the market. As the literature review 
mentioned, museums nowadays have to face declining subsidies and have to develop 
activities to generate own incomes. The sales gallery seems to be a consequence of this, as all 
three organizations are looking for opportunities and activities to generate income and it is 
becoming part of the core business of the organization. So all three organizations are cultural 
entrepreneurial with this activity. For example, Foam Editions explains they have to be 
cultural entrepreneurial and find opportunities and develop activities to strengthen FOAM 
itself. At the Photographers’ Gallery, Print Sales has developed as a central part of the 
organization to generate incomes. The House of Photography endorses this, as they have the 
editions to increase their own incomes. Although, a difference appears in how cultural 
entrepreneurial they are with this activity. The Photographers’ Gallery and FOAM are really 
aware of the opportunities they have with the sales gallery and try to develop these; at the 
House of Photography it remains as a sort of add-on and the museum is not trying to develop 
this at the moment. Continuing, at Foam Editions and Print Sales, they have a strategy to 
remain flexible to be able to adjust the concept of the sales gallery to the changing 
environment, contrasting to the House of Photography were they have not considered this at 
all for this activity. 

The audience goals at FOAM and the Photographers’ Gallery are similar, both want to reach 
a varied public with this activity, from the expert to the museum visitor. As the literature 
mentioned, museums are forced to develop their audiences and focus on social diversity. 
Both museums explain they want to build a community of clients, engage them with private 
activities and build long-term relationships. And they want to be accessible for the museum 
visitor and instruct them on collecting photography. At the House of Photography these 
audience goals have not been developed yet.  

All three museums have in common that they have the competitive goal to be much more 
accessible compared with commercial galleries, because they are located within the museum. 
At FOAM and the Photographers’ Gallery they try to extend that, by being an accessible 
information point on collecting photography. Print Sales is the most advantaged, as they also 
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try to distinguish themselves from commercial galleries by having an offer of artists that have 
not been on the market before. Therefore they are only sold at Print Sales.  

The product goals at FOAM and the Photographers’ Gallery are a combination of an offer 
where there is already a demand for, and an offer where they want to create a demand for. At 
Print Sales they have the most extensive offer with the Gallery Editions of established names, 
and the artists they represent that have a reputation of their own in combination with the new, 
emerging artists that enter the market. At Foam Editions they combine existing demand for 
the editions related to the exhibitions of the museum with creating demand for the editions of 
young, emerging artists. At the House of Photography this is different: they mostly try to 
create an offer where there is already is an existing demand. Unfortunately, they do not 
always have the possibilities to do this, since not all best images are always available; then 
they try to create demand for the less popular images.  

 

5.4 Conclusions 
 

Concluding it is evident that all three museums added the sales gallery to their museums’ 
offering because they believe collecting is an essential part of photography, and it fits within 
their mission. With this activity they try to combine non-profit with commercial activities to 
generate extra incomes for the museum and to offer a more participating experience. They 
distinguish themselves from commercial galleries by being more accessible, and by offering 
photography editions at lower prices. Difference is evident in the development of this activity 
at all three museums. Print Sales is professionalized and functions as a commercial gallery, at 
FOAM it is developed into an important department of the museum, and at the House of 
Photography it is still some kind of add-on of the museum. This becomes apparent in how 
they try to set out the different arts marketing components on the supply side, as Print Sales 
and Foam Editions have considered to synergize the elements of process, people and physical 
environment to create not only a sales service but also an informational service surrounding 
this activity. At the House of Photography this is not (yet) the case.  

All belief adding a sales gallery to the museum stimulates different experiences at the 
museum, of which the most important one is the escapist experience: to stimulate the 
collecting activity of its visitors. The enabling experience also dominates as the sales gallery 
foremost makes it easier to buy photographs. Additionally, they all believe that collecting 
photography can make the visitors feel enlightened, that it can increase their immaterial 
happiness. At Print Sales and the Photographers’ Gallery they try to extend the experience 
even more with an educational experience and an engaging experience, as they try to make 
the people learn more about collecting photography and to make them feel more related with 
the organization and with collecting art. Hence, all three museums explain they do try to 
create an experience that stimulates different domains of the total museum experience in 
which a transformation takes place. Now that we have considered the arts marketing 
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strategies from the supply side for the activity of a sales gallery, in the next chapter it will be 
interesting to examine how the visitors actually perceive the activity of a sales gallery. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

52 
 



 

6 Quantitative Analysis 
 

“Being an art buyer these days is comprehensively and indisputably vulgar.”5 

 

6.1 Introduction 
 

This chapter analyzes the quantitative part of the research to answer the question: How do the 
visitors of photography museums perceive the arts marketing strategy activity of a sales 
gallery within the total museum experience? Our sample consists of two groups: FOAM and 
the House of Photography. At both museums 330 questionnaires were handed out to the 
visitors. Questionnaires containing missing data or invalid responses are discarded. 
Questionnaires from individuals younger than the age of 18 are removed. Hence our sample 
consists of 311 cases for FOAM and 317 cases for the House of Photography, which is a 
response rate of 94% at FOAM and 96% at the House of Photography.  

First we start with the demographic profile of the respondents to analyze whether typical 
characteristics are present among both visitor groups. Then the different questions scored 
using a 5-point Likert scale are examined in three parts in congruence with the sub questions 
described before (chapter 4). In the first part four arts marketing components of the 7 P’s 
framework of the sales gallery are discussed: product, price, place and promotion. Thereupon 
the service elements people, process and physical environment, are examined and what this 
could reveal about the social and physical context of the visitors within the museum. Later on 
the opinions of the visitors on the various experience characteristics are explored. In the end 
relations between the various data items are tested and observed to find out what type of 
visitors are most interested in the sales gallery and to validate the data. 

 

6.2 Socio – demographic profile 
 

First we look at age distribution for both visitor groups at the two museums. After creating a 
clustered boxplot, one outlier was found in the Hamburg group, one female with the age of 
88. After removing this case from the results, our sample consists of 311 cases for FOAM 
and 316 cases for the House of Photography. Using the Kolmogorov-Smirnov test of 
normality, and as inspection of figure below shows, that age was not normally distributed, it 
was not divided equally and symmetrically around the central tendency, p < 0.05 (fig. 13). 
This can be explained, as FOAM has a general audience that mostly consists of people at the 
age between 20 and 40. Similarly, at the House of Photography the exhibition on show while 
the questionnaires were handed out attracts mostly younger people. This is visible in both 

5 (Saatchi, 2011, section Charles Saatchi: the hideousness of the artworld, paragraph 1). 
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histograms, as the age groups between 20 and 40 are overrepresented. In congruence, a t-test 
shows that there is no significant difference in age between the two groups t(625) = .52, p = 
.60.  

 
13 – CONTINUOUS AGE DISTRIBUTION SHOWING NORMALITY CURVE, own elaboration 
 
As far as education goes, the graph below shows that most visitors have a university degree: 
55,3% in Amsterdam and 65,2% in Hamburg, 41,5% has a higher education degree in 
Amsterdam and 26,3% in Hamburg (fig. 14). In Amsterdam 3,2% has a secondary school 
degree as has 7,6% in Hamburg, and a negligible amount possesses a primary school 
diploma. This corresponds to the international overrepresentation of the higher educated 
segment within art museum audiences (Ganzeboom & Haanstra, 1989). In congruence 
education was not significantly different between both groups t (607) = .73, p = .47. 
 

 
14 – CATEGORIZED EDUCATION LEVEL, own elaboration 
 
When we look at citizenship, at FOAM 82% is Dutch and 18% has a different nationality, at 
the House of Photography 88% is German, while 12% is non-German (fig. 15). There is no 
significant difference between groups objectified, t (609) = 1.88, p > .05. Suggesting that 
both museums attract a comparable audience of international and national visitors. 
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15 – CITIZENSHIP DISTRIBUTION, own elaboration 
 
Comparing gender distribution within the groups, a significant difference is objectified 
between the group of FOAM and the House of Photography, as t (625) = 2.11, p = 0.04. As 
the pie charts below explain, at FOAM both genders were almost equally represented with 
160 male cases and 151 female cases, which is a difference of 2% (fig. 16). Whereas at the 
House of Photography male cases were 136 and female cases 180, hence female dominates 
with a difference of 14%. Cultural activities are more visited by women, especially art 
museums, which could explain the difference at the House of Photography (DiMaggio, 
Useem & Brown, 1978; Ranshuysen, 1999). Nevertheless it remains unclear why this female 
dominance is not observable at FOAM.  

 
16 – GENDER DISTRIBUTION, own elaboration 
 
When we look at the question whether the respondent has visited the museum before in the 
last 12 months, we see that there is no significant difference between both museums, t (625) = 
1.49, p = .14. As the pie chart shows at FOAM, 44% has visited the museum before in the last 
12 months, while 56% has not (fig. 17). At the House of Photography this was 50% against 
50%. Though, inspecting the group that has visited the museum before in the last 12 months, 
the frequency of recurrent visits to a museum is significantly different between both 
museums, t (202) = 3.12, p < 0.001. The bar charts and the table with valid percent below 
show that the frequency of returning has an outspread distribution for both cases (fig. 18 & 
fig. 19).  
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17 – LAST VISIT WITHIN 12 MONTHS DISTRIBUTION, own elaboration 
 

 
18 – MUSEUM VISITS TABLE, own elaboration 

 
19 – MUSEUM VISITS DISTRIBUTION, own elaboration 

Lastly, it was assessed whether pre-existing knowledge about the existence of a sales gallery 
within the museum differed for both visitor groups. A significant difference is present in 
which FOAM visitors have more pre-existing knowledge about the sales gallery compared to 
House of Photography visitors, namely t (603) = 5.48, p < .001. The pie charts show that at 
FOAM, a 42% already knew about Foam Editions, contrasting to only a 22% at the House of 
Photography (fig. 20). Therefore, it may be implied that FOAM reaches its audience more 
effective on this activity. 

56 
 



 

  
20 – KNOWLEDGE ON SALES GALLERY DISTRIBUTION, own elaboration 
 

6.3 Opinion of the visitors 
 

We continue to look at the separate questions of the questionnaire. The intention is to find out 
what the opinion of the visitors is on the activity of a sales gallery within both museums. 
Therefore the questionnaire is divided in three parts. The first part comprises statements on 
the arts marketing components product, price, place and promotion. The second part is about 
the service arts marketing components: people, physical environment and process. And the 
last part considers the four domains of the total museum experience and the methods to create 
a meaningful experience. We have to keep in mind that all questions are answered on a five-
point Likert-scale, hence the ordinal content of the items are taken into account choosing 
analyzing procedures in SPSS (Field & Miles, 2010). The boxplots and bar charts for every 
question of both visitors groups are shown in the appendix (Appendix E). For every item, the 
mode, median and interquartile range is added, to interpret the scales. Mogey advises to 
interpret these types of scales by the variables’ modes (1999). Yet many occur to have only 
small differences in count; therefore the medians are also taken into consideration. Moreover, 
content related items are analyzed conjointly in the following parts: part II, the service arts 
marketing components and part III, the museum experience components. 

Part I: Arts Marketing Components 

The first part deals with the arts marketing components: product, price, place and promotion 
for the activity of a sales gallery within the museum. The questions can specify which arts 
marketing components can be effective for the performance of this activity. First we look at 
the overall values in the box plot below, which show that most arts marketing components are 
rated with a mode of 3 to 5, indicating a distribution directing from neutral to agreement (fig. 
21). A Chi square test is conducted to compare responses between Hamburg and Amsterdam. 
Similar answering pattern was found for product3, price and place3 (respectively χ2(4) = 
4.30, p = .37, χ2(4) = 7.21, p = .13, χ2(4) = 5.48, p = .24). Hence the visitors of both museums 
have a comparable opinion on the question whether the editions should be related to the 
exhibitions, at both the median and mode is 4, which is a positive response. For pricing, most 
visitors prefer a price range with a maximum of €7.000, - as in Hamburg 65% valued this 
with 4 or 5, and in Amsterdam 72% valued this with 4 or 4. At both museums respondents are 
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neutral on the question whether a sales gallery should be in a prominent location of the 
museum, as the median and mode of both cases has a value of 3. 

 
21 – 4 P’s RELATED FACTORS BOXPLOT, own elaboration 
 
Next we look at the individual questions for both groups, we start with the statements on the 
product. In Amsterdam product1 and product2 both have a median of 4, and an interquartile 
range between 4 and 5, the visitors perceive this as (very) positive factors. So product1, 
offering photography editions, and product2, having a selection of young, new talented 
photographers can be regarded as important components. It seems positive, but less important 
to have an offer related to the exhibitions, as the interquartile for product3 ranges between 3 
and 4. In Hamburg it stands out that people highly agree to an offer of photography editions 
of new, talented and young photographers, as product2 has a median and a mode of 5; the 
interquartile range is concentrated between the values 4 and 5. For product1 and product3 the 
interquartile range spans from 3 to 5, so the opinion on the offer of photography editions 
itself, and on being related to the exhibitions is positive, but slightly more dispersed. So we 
can conclude that in both museums visitors find the offering of editions of young, new 
emerging artists as the most positive statement.  
 
Now we will look at the location components. We already discussed place3, which had a 
neutral response at both museums. At FOAM,  place 1, having their own exhibition room, 
has a neutral response, as the mode has a value of 3. Place2, to be located within the museum 
has more preference among the visitors, as its median and mode are 4, and more than 50% 
populates between 3 and 5. Hamburg is less positive, as both place1 and place2 have a 
median of 3 and a midspread evenly distributed around the neutral value, so these factors do 
not stand out. Lastly, inspecting promotional activities, in Hamburg the mode and median 
again are at value 3. At FOAM the boxplot indicates a more unequal distribution and 
concentrating more between 2.5 and 4. This tendency indicates that having independent 
promotional activities might not be the most important arts marketing factor of a sales 
gallery. 

Now that we have analyzed the opinion on the 4P’s and indicated the relevant factors for the 
visitors: the offering of the editions in general; the relation of the editions to the exhibition; 
the offering of editions of young, new, talented artists; and the low price range. And a neutral 
opinion on if the sales gallery should be in a prominent location of the museum. We will 
continue in our second part discussing the components related to services. 
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Part II: Service Components 

Service components are people, physical environment and process. These elements can tell us 
about the visitors’ social and physical contexts within the museum. All three elements are 
interrelated; therefore it is important to inspect the overall opinion of these elements 
conjointly. In the figure below all service items are averaged on the 5-point Likert scale per 
visitor for both groups (fig. 22). As the medians are 3.33 and 3.5, and the modes 3.67 and 
3.83, the majority of responds seems to be distributed between the values of 3 and 4. Hence it 
appears that the respondents perceive the service elements as positive if those were organized 
by the sales gallery.  
 

   
22 – AVERAGE RESPONSE SERVICE RELATED FACTORS, own elaboration 
 
We will continue by examining the various service elements per question. In the next figure, 
the boxplot for all Likert-scale items for each case is shown (fig. 23). Chi square tests to 
compare responses between Hamburg and Amsterdam revealed that there was no significant 
difference in responding to the questions people2, environment1, process1 and processpeople 
(respectively, χ2(4) = 6.87, p = .14, χ2(4) = 7.53, p = .11, χ2(4) = 5.78, p = .22, χ2(4) = 3.24, p 
= .54). These results indicate that both visitor groups responded similar to the statement about 
interaction with other visitors about collecting photography, with a median of 3 and a mode 
of 4, the respondents tend to be around neutral and positive (people2). On the physical 
environment where people could relax and on the process to come more often to buy 
photography the opinion is positive as de median and mode are 4 (environment 1, process1). 
The last statement on talking about collecting photography has a neutral to positive response, 
as the median is 3 and the mode is 3 or 4 in both cases (processpeople).  
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23 – SERVICE RELATED FACTORS BOXPLOT, own elaboration 
 
At FOAM, an overall similar response is observed located between 3 and 4, except for 
environment2; this has a response more towards disagreement in comparison with the other 
items, as 75% valued this with 1, 2 or 3. Likewise, at the House of Photography all responses 
are mainly concentrated around value 3 and 4, with some extensions in interquartile range 
towards 2 or 5. Thereby the similarity of responses between these variables at both visitor 
groups confirms that the elements of people, process and physical environment are 
interconnected. It is noticeable that both groups have a median and a mode of 3 and an 
interquartile range starting at 2 for the item environment2. This indicates a tendency between 
disagreement and agreement, and shows that visitors do not find it quite that important if the 
physical environment of the sales gallery matches with the rest of the museum for the 
visitors. As described above, results on environment1 show that the visitors find a relaxing 
environment more important, as this has a median and mode of 4 at both museums. So, 
considering the physical contexts of the visitors, creating a relaxing physical environment at a 
sales gallery seems to be important. 
 
Furthermore, social context components are inspected by means of: the people and the 
process. At FOAM overall a neutral attitude is observed, in which we do see a slight 
difference between contact with an expert and talking about photography in general or with 
other visitors. The item people1, regarding talking with an expert, has a median of 4, while 
people2 and processpeople have a median of 3. The box plot demonstrates that in Hamburg 
the component to have contact with an expert on collecting photography (as represented by 
item people1) appears to be more desirable than the other components of the service 
provided, as it is the only variable of the service elements with an interquartile range between 
3 and 5 in Hamburg. Therefore, contact with an expert seems to be of a superior importance 
at both museums compared to interacting with other visitors in the social context. 
 
Part III: The Total Museum Experience 

As mentioned in the literature review, every activity a museum wishes to perform adds 
something to the total museum experience. To find out what the visitors think a sales gallery 
would add to their experience this last part considers items related to the four domains of the 
total museum experience, and the characteristics that comprise a meaningful experience.  
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24 – AVERAGE RESPONSE TOTAL MUSEUM EXPERIENCE RELATED FACTORS, own elaboration 
 
First we have to take into consideration that all questions regarding the museum experience 
are part of the total museum experience, which is holistic, which could lead to visitors having 
difficulties in dividing different aspects of the experience and on how they would value this. 
For that reason we will start again with an average of all 9 measures for both groups, to 
obtain an impression on respondents’ overall position whether a sales gallery adds something 
to the total museum experience. In the figure above this average is shown on a 5-point Likert 
scale (fig. 24). The median is 3.67 and the mode is 3.89 at both groups, which indicates an 
average measure close to 4. This demonstrates an overall response of agreement among the 
respondents that a sales gallery could offer an extension to the total museum experience. Chi 
square tests comparing Hamburg and Amsterdam demonstrates that there is no significant 
difference in responses at educational, aesthetic, entertaining and engaging (χ2(4) = 6.22, p = 
.18, χ2(4) = 6.01, p = .20, χ2(4) = 7.37, p = .12, χ2(4) = 1.13, p = .89). There seems to be 
congruence between both groups regarding on what a sales gallery adds to the total museum 
experience. The response is positive on if it could add an engaging and an entertaining 
experience as at both museums the mode and median is valued with 4 on these statements. 
For educational and aesthetic the interquartile range is between 3 and 4, indicating a neutral 
to positive response from the visitors.    

Subsequently we will examine the individual items, to be able to answer which characteristics 
are added to the total museum experience of the visitors with a sales gallery in their 
perception. As the boxplot below shows, all values are distributed between 3 and 5, which is 
an overall response from neutral to positive (fig. 25).  
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25 – TOTAL MUSEUM EXPERIENCE RELATED FACTORS BOXPLOT, own elaboration 
 
At FOAM three items arrest attention, firstly the enabling experience. The median and mode 
for this item is 4, but if we take a closer look, it appears that 76% of the respondents valued it 
with 4 or 5. This indicates that respondents perceive the sales gallery as a successful addition 
for the museum. It stands out that the respondents highly agree on the inspiring item, as 74% 
has valued this with 4 and 5. So at FOAM, the sales gallery could foremost be an enabling 
and enlightening experience. Considering the four domains of a total museum experience, the 
aesthetic experience is the only item valued with a mode of 3. It demonstrates that the visitors 
are not convinced that the sales gallery can provide them an additional aesthetic experience. 
All values are on the high end, so it seems that the visitors consider all four domains may be 
stimulated with a sales gallery.  
 
At the House of Photography four items stand out. We start with the first item: enabling. This 
question considers the enabling experience. Respondents highly agree that the sales gallery 
could be an offering of an extra service, as 79% valued the first item with a 4 and 5. Two 
other items that are noticeable are inspiring and happiness, which can be categorized as 
enlightening experiences. Respondents highly agree with these items, as for both the median 
is 4, and the mode 5. If we look closer, 79% valued the question on inspiring with 4 or 5; for 
the happiness question this was 65%. Similar to FOAM, at the House of Photography both 
enabling and enlightening experiences stand out. Finally, the answers on the total museum 
experience are noticeable in Hamburg; this question anticipates on the expansion of the 
visitors’ experience by of the sales gallery. Most of the respondents highly agree on this, as 
63% valued this item with 4 or 5. Unfortunately, this question does not make clear on which 
domain it expands the museum experience. In Hamburg the four domains do not show any 
clear differences, all are directing the higher end of the values. But when we look at the 
medians of the four questions considering the domains, one small difference is observable: 
the educational and escapist items have a median of 3, and the aesthetic and entertaining 
items have a median of 4. This indicates a slightly different attitude towards participation: 
passive participation seems to have a small preference at the House of Photography. 
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6.4 Demographic differences 
 

Now that we have analyzed the demographic characteristics and the questions separately, we 
continue by inspecting whether demographic characteristics cause different response patterns 
to the various questions. We start with a Chi square test to compare non-citizenship and 
citizenship. In Hamburg the answering patterns between these two groups are significantly 
different for aesthetic, educational and processpeople (χ2(4) = 19.93, p = .01, χ2(4) = 13.49, p 
= .01, χ2(4) = 12.30, p = .02). As the bar chart shows below, it demonstrates that in Hamburg 
the non-citizen visitors are more positive that the sales gallery can add an educational 
experience than the citizens, who are more neutral (fig. 26). On the other hand, for the 
aesthetic experience non-citizens are more neutral as the value 3 dominates in the responses; 
while for citizens value 4 and 5 dominate. This might be explained because tourists (non-
citizens) might only come for the main exhibition. At the item processpeople, it occurs that 
non-citizens are neutral (3) on having a place to come more frequent to talk about collecting 
photography, whereas citizens are more positive with a mode of 4. This might be caused by 
an inability of non-citizens to visit more frequently. 

   
26 – EDUCATIONAL, AESTHETIC AND PROCESSPEOPLE FREQUENCY BAR CHARTS BY 
CITIZENSHIP, GROUP HAMBURG, own elaboration  
 
In Amsterdam, a Chi square test comparing citizenship and non-citizenship also reveals a 
significant difference in respondents for processpeople, (χ2(4) = 12.81, p = .01). Other items 
that are significantly different between citizens and non-citizens are process1, entertaining 
and product3 (χ2(4) = 12.38, p = .02, χ2(4) = 9.83, p = .04 χ2(4) = 16.31, p < .01). The bar 
chart below visualizes that the non-citizens are more positive on the processpeople item than 
the citizens who are more neutral, contrasting to the respondents in Hamburg (fig. 27). This is 
a conspicuous observation, as non-citizens probably need to travel more to the museum, they 
might not be that interested to come more frequent. Additionally, answering profiles of 
product3 demonstrates that non-citizen respondents find it more important that the editions 
for sale are related to the exhibitions than citizens. This might be because their main interest 
is for the main exhibition. Citizens agree more that the addition of a sales gallery can provide 
an entertaining experience (entertaining). And finally, the item on coming back more 
frequently to buy photographs (process1) has a mode of 4 for citizens, while non-citizens 
value this with a mode of 3. This might be for the same reason as explained for Hamburg for 
the item of processpeople: that non-citizens might not be able to visit more frequently. 

63 
 



 

 

  

  
27 - PROCESSPEOPLE, PRODUCT1, ENTERTAINING AND PROCESS1 FREQUENCY BAR CHARTS 
BY CITIZENSHIP, GROUP AMSTERDAM, own elaboration 
 
Moving on from citizenship to gender, Chi square tests comparing males and females in 
Amsterdam reveal no significant differences in patterns of respondents. However, in 
Hamburg gender differences are present for inspiring, aesthetic, entertaining and total 
museum experience, (respectively χ2(4) = 15.94, p = .00, χ2(4) = 10.28, p = .04, χ2(4) = 10.23, 
p = .04, χ2(4) = 10.59, p = .03). As we observe in the bar charts below, females tend to value 
these items more positive than men (fig. 28).  
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28 – INSPIRING, AESTHETIC, ENTERTAINING AND TOTAL MUSEUM EXPERIENCE FREQUENCY 
BAR CHARTS BY GENDER, GROUP HAMBURG, own elaboration 
 
The next Chi square test compares the answering patterns of the respondents that already 
knew about the sales gallery of the museum and the respondents that did not. In Hamburg, 
visitors with pre-existing knowledge have a significant different response to the items 
aesthetic and engaging, than the visitors without pre-existing knowledge, as χ2(4) = 2.58, p = 
.03, χ2(4) = 7.36, p = .01. As the bar chart demonstrates, the respondents that did not know 
about the sales gallery tend to be rather positive for the aesthetic experience (fig. 29). While 
respondents that did know the sales gallery are more directed to disagree on the addition of an 
aesthetic experience with this activity, as 20% valued it with 2. The same pattern is observed 
concerning the engaging experience, in which people that do not know the sales gallery again 
valued this item more positive in comparison with the people that already were familiar with 
the sales gallery (fig. 29). This indicates a decline in expectations once they are familiar with 
the sales gallery. 

  
29 – AESTHETIC AND ENGAGING3 FREQUENCY BAR CHARTS BY KNOWLEDGE, GROUP 
HAMBURG, own elaboration 
 
In Amsterdam difference in respondent patterns appears for process1 and promotion, χ2(4) = 
9.83, p = .04, χ2(4) = 12.02, p = .02. The respondents that already knew about the sales 
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gallery agree more on the item that it should be a place where they could come more 
frequently to buy photography editions in comparison with the respondents that did not know 
the existence of the sales gallery (fig. 30). This indicates that they would like to come back 
for the sales gallery. The people that did not know the sales gallery have valued the 
independent promotional activities mostly with neutral; the people that already were familiar 
with it valued it with slightly different as the table charts demonstrates (fig. 30). This 
indicates that the respondents that already know the sales gallery probably think promotion is 
not that necessary to gain a wider reach, as 13 % valued this with a 1. 
 

  
30 – PROCESS1 AND PROMOTION FREQUENCY BAR CHARTS BY KNOWLEDGE, GROUP 
AMSTERDAM, own elaboration 
 
The last categorical item we compare with Chi square tests is the one given whether 
respondents visited the museum before in the last 12 months. Both in Hamburg and 
Amsterdam a difference in patterns of responses appears for the item people1, in Hamburg 
χ2(4) = 14.01, p = .01 and in Amsterdam χ2(4) = 15.48, p = .00. As the bar charts below 
demonstrate, in Hamburg respondents that visited before within the last year valued the 
offering of an expert for 33% with 4, and the values 3 and 5 are 20% (fig. 31). While the 
respondents that did not visit value an expert for 32% with 5, and 25% with 4, and for 32% 
with 3. So people that do not visit frequently value an expert more positively than people that 
do visit the museum more than once a year. Less frequent visitors might appreciate expert 
advice, because they have less experience themselves with collecting photography. In 
Amsterdam a different pattern is visible, as the figure below shows that both types of visitors 
valued the expert generally with 4 (fig. 31). While people that do visit the museum more 
often value this item for 22% with 5, people that did not visited the museum in the last 12 
months tend to be more neutral about the presence of an expert. So this is an opposite 
response, for which we have no explanation.  
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31 – PEOPLE1 FREQUENCY BAR CHARTS BY LAST VISIT WITHIN 12 MONTHS, GROUP HAMBURG 
AND AMSTERDAM, own elaboration 
 
Conducting Chi square tests for education is not possible, as this variable is categorical 
instead of dichotomous ordinal (Field & Miles, 2010). To get insight in the possible influence 
of education on the opinion of a sales gallery, we have created a variable that is the average 
of product1 and enabling1. Both variables are questions concerning the addition of the 
activity of a sales gallery to the museum, product1 questions if the sales gallery should offer 
the possibility to buy photography editions, enabling1 questions if the sales gallery could 
offer a successful additional experience to the total museum experience. Both items are 
significantly correlated, as rs = .38, p < .01. The result of the average respondents on both 
questions is demonstrated in the bar chart below (fig. 32). Indirectly this shows the overall 
opinion on the addition of a sales gallery to the total museum experience. As we have 
mentioned before, education is not significantly different between both groups; therefore we 
can use the educational information for both groups together. In the line diagram below, 
response pattern for every education level is visible (fig. 33). It demonstrates that higher 
education and university seem to have an equally response, as the lines have an almost equal 
path. For higher education and university the response is concentrated in a clear peak around 
4 - 4.5, indicating a positive opinion on the sales gallery. Respondents who have secondary 
school education and primary school education seem to have a different pattern. Primary 
school is mostly centered surrounding neutral. Secondary education has the highest response 
rate with a value of 5, following by 3 and then 2, yet a lot of variation can be observed within 
the group. It could be that higher educated people have more interest in the sales gallery, as 
they have higher incomes, the clear peak for both education levels demonstrates this. 
Secondary school has a high interest as well, as it is valued by 5, however no clear opinion 
can be gathered from this pattern of responses as the distribution is remarkably varied.  
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32 - AVERAGE RESPONSE SALES GALLERY RELATED FACTORS, own elaboration 
 

 
33 - AVERAGE RESPONSE SALES GALLERY RELATED FACTORS BY EDUCATION, own elaboration 
 
Finally, some highly related questions are checked as control questions, to validate responses 
(Field & Miles, 2010). The theme in question 1: the enabling to buy photography at the 
museum, reoccurs in question 15 in different wording: the addition of the sales gallery, and is 
therefore useful as a control question. As mentioned before, correlation is already tested. 
With a marginal homogeneity test it is tested whether the variation within both variables is 
equally distributed. The test produces a significance value of p = 0.29, implying that 
responses to both questions tend to be alike, which reassures that the results are interpretable. 
The same is done with question 10 and 14, which are both question on talking about 
photography. Testing the hypothesis that the distribution of different values is similar, the 
homogeneity test confirms this, which increases the overall validation of responses of the 
questionnaire (p = 0.08). 

 

6.5 Conclusions 
 

In this chapter we have tried to examine the opinion of the visitors on the activity of a sales 
gallery within the museum by asking different socio demographic characters and their 
opinion on different elements of this activity concerning the components of the 7 P’s 
framework and the characteristics of the total museum experience. Overall we collected 
respondents from two museums: FOAM and the House of Photography. Both groups are 
comparable in age, citizenship, education and their former visit to the museum in the last 12 
months. The knowledge on the sales gallery is very different, as at FOAM 42% already knew 
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about the sales gallery, while at the House of Photography this was only 22%. Indicating that 
the reach at the House of Photography to their audience on this activity is inferior compared 
to FOAM. It is remarkable that in Hamburg the respondents consist of more females, and 
they overall respond more positive to Likert items concerning the total museum experience. 
We have no explanation for this difference in gender between both groups. Furthermore it is 
evident from the results that respondents with higher and university education have the same 
positive answering pattern on the opinion of the addition of a sales gallery. For secondary 
school and primary school educated people the answering pattern is more varied; therefore 
we could not extract a clear opinion from the results for these last two groups.  

Both in Hamburg and in Amsterdam the responses are very positive on the question whether 
the museum should offer editions for sale, specifying that the offer of editions should be of 
young, new, talented artists. Additionally, a positive response on the question whether the 
offer should be related to the exhibitions is visible at both places, yet the young, new talented 
factor seems to be of more importance. In Amsterdam the results show that the non-citizens 
find the factor of the relation of the editions to the exhibitions more important than the 
citizens; this could be explained as non-citizens might be more focused on the main 
exhibition on show in the museum. Continuing, at both museums they responded very 
positively on the question whether the price should be lower than € 7.000, -. Both are neutral 
on the location of the sales gallery within the main route of the museum and whether the 
museum should have independent promotional activities.   

The overall response to the service elements was positive at both groups. Both groups have a 
positive opinion on the factor that it should be a relaxing environment, and that they could 
come more frequently to buy photographs. A neutral response is visible on the statement that 
the sales gallery should have the same look of the museum as a whole. Both find expert 
advice more important than the possibility to interact about collecting photography, the last 
having a neutral response. In Hamburg it stands out that the respondents are more positive on 
having an expert at the sales gallery compared to Amsterdam. The people that already knew 
about the sales gallery in Amsterdam value the possibility to come more frequently to buy 
photographs more positive than the people who did not know about the sales gallery, 
suggesting that people once they have experience with the sales gallery they want to come 
back. A remarkable result is that citizens and non-citizen respond differently in Hamburg and 
in Amsterdam on the question if the sales gallery should be a place where they could come 
more frequent to talk about photography. As in Amsterdam the non-citizens value this more 
positive, compared to the citizens, and in Hamburg this is the other way around. There is also 
a different response visible for expert advice by the people that did, or did not visit the 
museum in the last 12 months. In Hamburg the people that did not visit frequently value an 
expert more positively than people that did visit the museum more than once a year, in 
Amsterdam there is a contrasting result. 

Looking at the total museum experience, at both museums the respondents are overall neutral 
to positive on the different characteristics this experience could have. In Hamburg the people 
that already knew about the sales gallery valued the aesthetic and the engaging experience 
less positive than the people who did not know about it. This demonstrates that people have 
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lower expectations of this activity once they have experience with the sales gallery, which 
could be a concerning result for the museum. At both museums the enabling of the extra 
service of buying photographs at the museum and creating an inspiring experience with the 
sales gallery are positively valued. In Hamburg they also responded positively on the 
possibility of increasing immaterial happiness. The respondents of both groups do belief the 
sales gallery adds something to the total museum experience. So, as the results of this chapter 
demonstrate, overall the respondents had a positive opinion on the sales gallery in both cases. 
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7 Conclusions 
 

“The place that attracts the most visitors, does not necessarily has to be the best.”6 

 

This thesis has attempted to explore the activity of a sales gallery within photography 
museums. This activity is part of the overall museum experience the museum offers. In the 
research this activity has been approached from the arts marketing perspective. This 
discipline is based upon the framework of supply and demand, hence two research sub 
questions were designed to evaluate this activity from both perspectives. The different 
methods used in this research to examine both perspectives have allowed us to draw several 
conclusions so far.  

First, the supply side of this activity is examined to answer the question: What are the arts 
marketing strategies considering the total museum experience of photography museums to 
add this activity of a sales gallery to the museum? At the three museums researched, different 
results regarding the arts marketing strategies appeared in performing this activity. Noticeable 
are the differences in development of this activity that appeared in researching the 7 P’s 
framework. At the Photographers’ Gallery they professionalized this activity, so nowadays it 
is performing as a central part of the organization. The arts marketing components are all 
synergized at Print Sales to create a well-rounded offer of photography editions for all 
different audiences they have. They organize exhibitions all year round to engage the visitors 
with the artists they represent and they are an information platform on collecting photography 
for different types of audiences that want to learn about collecting. Fulltime staff is always 
approachable at the sales gallery to inform visitors. At FOAM, likewise they have their own 
sales gallery within the museum with editions for sale, where staff is always present. 
However, they only offer special editions, and do not represent artists themselves. They try to 
synergize all service elements to be an accessible information platform on collecting 
photography, they even extended this offer with collecting courses. At the House of 
Photography this activity is performed differently. They do offer editions for sale related to 
the exhibitions. Nevertheless, they have not organized surrounding services of a sales gallery. 
The editions are displayed (most of the time) on a wall in the exhibition space, while there is 
no staff present at this place to provide information on the editions. People have to go the 
bookshop for extra information. No activities are organized around collecting photography 
itself, and they have not taken into consideration how to adjust the different marketing 
components to make sure this service reaches their audience.  

All three museums performed the activity of a sales gallery to generate more incomes for the 
organization as a whole. It fits within their artistic missions, as they all believe that collecting 
photography is an essential part of the medium. The development of this activity 

6 (De plek die het meeste publiek trekt, hoeft niet per se de beste te zijn.) (Broekhuis, in 

Lamoree, 2013, section Foam trendy en energiek, paragraph 4) 
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demonstrates that museums nowadays are forced to develop a more extended offer and to be 
cultural entrepreneurial in combining non-profit with commercial activities. Moreover, all 
believe that adding a sales gallery to the museums’ activities stimulates different experiences 
at the museum, of which the most important ones are the escapist experience, by which 
visitors can actively participate and become collectors; and the enabling experience, to make 
it easier for them to buy photographs. Additionally, all believe that having photography at 
home could be an enlightening experience. Moreover at Foam Editions and Print Sales they 
actively try to stimulate the educational and engaging experiences, to increase knowledge 
among visitors on collecting photography and to involve them with collecting and the 
museum. These experiences are provided to transform these people into collectors, so that 
they also can have an escapist experience at the museum. Hence, this development of a sales 
gallery is an example of creating an offer that extends the visitors’ experience at the 
educational and escapist domain, and it is tried to be transforming by educating, enabling, 
enlightening and engaging the visitors.  

A visitor research among the House of Photography and FOAM was performed to answers 
the next research question: How do the visitors of photography museums perceive the arts 
marketing strategy activity of a sales gallery within the total museum experience? This 
research demonstrates that the overall opinion on having a sales gallery within the museum is 
positive. Respondents mostly agree that this could be a successful addition to the total 
museum experience. They prefer an offer of young, talented and emerging photographers, 
and are positive about the offer of editions related to the exhibition and in a lower price 
segment. A more neutral response is evident on if the sales gallery should be in a prominent 
location and if it should have its own promotional activities. Considering the service elements 
they prefer consulting an expert on collecting photography rather than interacting with other 
visitors on buying photographs, and they found a relaxing environment important. 

The results demonstrate that the visitors agree that the service of a sales gallery can extend 
the range of experiences at the museum, as overall the items on the experience at the sales 
gallery are valued neutral to positive. The highest valued experiences are the enabling 
experience, that it is easier for the visitors to collect photographs; and the enlightening 
experience, that it can be inspiring and increase immaterial happiness. Remarkable is the 
result that people that already know about the sales gallery in Hamburg valued the aesthetic 
and engaging experience lower than the respondents that did not know the sales gallery. This 
is a concerning result as it demonstrates these visitors have a more negative response on what 
kind of experience the sales gallery could offer ones they know about this activity.   

When we compare the results of the visitors’ research in Hamburg and Amsterdam with the 
results of the interviews at the museums, some noticeable comparisons are evident. First of 
all, it is evident that, compared with Amsterdam, in Hamburg few people already know that 
the House of Photography offers editions for sale. This is in congruence with how the House 
of Photography has organized the marketing components of this activity. The editions are not 
always visible, and there are no promotional activities for this service. Furthermore, no 
contact person is present at the editions to provide face-to-face information on the offer to the 
visitors. This could explain why visitors are not aware it exists. Both museums find it 
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important to provide editions at the lower price segment, as they believe that the visitors of 
the museum are not interested in expensive artworks with prices comparable to artworks at 
commercial galleries. As the survey results demonstrate, the visitors agreed to this. In 
Hamburg the respondents value the service of an expert higher than in Amsterdam. While in 
Amsterdam the sales gallery has an expert present in the gallery, and it offers collecting 
courses. This demonstrates that it could be useful for the House of Photography to add this 
personal and educational aspect to the sales gallery offerings. Most importantly, the responses 
on the surveys indicate that visitor have a positive opinion on the sales gallery, and the 
services surrounding this activity. So compared with the interview it is evident that restricting 
the offering of the sales gallery only to editions does not work. Both at FOAM and at the 
Photographers’ Gallery it was emphasized that the surrounding services of educating, 
organizing events, engaging the audience with collecting is necessary to create an audience 
that actually buys editions. In Hamburg these surrounding services are not developed yet, and 
this explains why this sales gallery does not function successfully.  

In conclusion, comparing all results it is straightforward that the activity of a sales gallery can 
be an effective arts marketing strategy within the total museum experience. It can be a 
successful addition to the total museum offerings, as visitors perceive this as a positive 
activity. And this activity could function as a new strategy to generate incomes to support the 
museum. Nonetheless, just offering editions for sale as an add-on to the museum is not an 
effective strategy. The sales gallery has to be developed as a well-rounded service of which 
all marketing components need to be synergized to prevent that visitors do not understand the 
concept. Additionally, these components need to be adjusted to create different experiences, 
for example educational experiences and engaging experiences in order to get the visitors 
involved with collecting photography. So the arts marketing tools of supply and demand 
discussed in the literature review provide a useful framework to set the strategy for the 
activity of a sales gallery at a museum. If preferences of the audience are taken into 
consideration, for example in offering editions of young, new, talented photographers in a 
lower price segment. And these wishes and needs of the audience are matched with the goals 
and objectives that the museum wants to achieve with the sales gallery. Like offering services 
to increase the knowledge and engagement of the visitors to get them to participate actively 
in collecting photography, and eventually buy photographs at the museum to increase 
incomes. Then the sales gallery can be a successful addition to the overall museums’ 
operations. So the activity needs to be organized around the customer and the objectives the 
organization has set for the sales gallery.  

Limitations and further research 

First of all due to restrictions by the Photographers’ Gallery we were not allowed to do a 
visitor research at this museum; therefore the research is imbalanced which made it 
impossible to compare the qualitative results for this museum with quantitative results. 
Therefore only the demand and supply perspectives could be compared for FOAM and the 
House of Photography to answer the main research question. In addition, a more extensive 
analysis would have been possible if marketing plans and annual reports of the organizations 
were included in the research. Nevertheless, the museums were not able or willing to present 
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these documents for the research. Another limitation is that we are unable to judge whether 
the interviewees revealed the complete marketing strategies on this topic of their 
organization, as it could be that for competitive reasons they do not want this to become 
public. We have tried to diminish this by offering a confidentiality agreement; conversely no 
organization found it necessary to conclude an agreement. Subsequently, due to the small 
sample size, the data limits the ability for our conclusions to be representive on this topic for 
photography museums and museum audiences in general.  

Furthermore, each of the research sub questions is broad enough to be a research in itself. 
More demographic characteristics could have been examined in the questionnaire and more 
item-related factors exist within the arts marketing strategies for a sales gallery than we have 
proposed in our research. Additionally, our survey is restricted to museum visitors; therefore 
it does not investigate the opinion of photography collectors, since they may not go to 
museums and do visit commercial galleries. And the use of different methods to research the 
audience, like focus groups, could have improved the results on how the visitors perceive the 
activity of a sales gallery. However due to time and travel constraints this was not possible. 

In conclusion, as the phenomenon of a sales gallery has not been researched before, many 
opportunities for further research lie before us. The effectiveness of the activity of a sales 
gallery as an arts marketing strategy could be further investigated with multiple and different 
methods on both supply and demand perspectives. This could provide new and relevant 
information on this activity, especially on different elements that are effective and elements 
of this activity that are not. Examples are interviews among visitors, investigation of the 
budgets and profits of the sales galleries and research over a longer period at one museum 
that could provide insight on the developments of this activity in time. In addition, research 
among other museums that perform this activity could extend the knowledge on the existing 
sales galleries within photography museums.  

An interesting topic that rises from these kinds of galleries is the role of the artist. Can and do 
they benefit from these sales or is this only beneficial for the museums? As the commercial 
gallery evidently has commercial goals, it is for their own interest to invest in the career of 
the artists. For the museums researched this is not really the case, only at the Photographers’ 
Gallery a concern for the careers of the artists represented was mentioned. Equally this can be 
done on the consequences for the commercial galleries in the industry. Does this activity 
create a bridge between the museum and the commercial gallery, can galleries benefit from 
this activity as it attracts new audiences that are stimulated to become collectors? Or does this 
result in a new form of competition for them? Only through further research the development 
of this arts marketing activity within museums and the influences on the other players in this 
industry can be explained. 
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32 Average response sales gallery related factors, own elaboration   68 

33 Average response sales gallery related factors by education, own elaboration 68 
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List of interviewed organizations with dates and places 
 

FOAM 

• 24th October 2013, 16:00h  

FOAM, Keizersgracht 609, Amsterdam, the Netherlands 

Interview with:  Marloes Krijnen, director FOAM 

   Floor Haverkamp, manager Foam Editions 

Language:  Dutch 

 

The Photographers’ Gallery 

• 2th January 2014, 15:00h 

The Photographers’ Gallery, 16 - 18 Ramillies St, London, United Kingdom 

Interview with:  Gemma Barnett, Print Sales manager 

Language:  English 

 

House of Photography 

• 19th February 2014, 15:00h 

House of Photography, Deichtorhallen, Deichtorstraße 1-2, Hamburg, Germany 

Interview with:  Ingo Taubhorn, curator House of Photography 

Language:  English 
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• 19th February 2014, 16:15h 

House of Photography, Deichtorhallen, Deichtorstraße 1-2, Hamburg, Germany 

Interview with:  Michael Klein-Reitzenstein, director photobook store House of 
Photography 

Language:  English 

Note: This was a very short interview, since the interviewee was still working at the 
photobook store, I only had the possibility to ask him some short questions while he was 
working. 
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Appendices 
 

A Interview guide 

 
Questions 

Introduction 

- What is your function at the museum? 
- And what do you do for the Editions? 

 

First part: marketing components of Editions 

- Since when does Editions exist at the museum? 
- How did you come up with the idea of Editions? 

 
- What are exactly the activities of Editions, what service do you offer with Editions? 

Thesis Cultural Economics and Entrepreneurship 

Interview Guide for FOAM, the Photographers’ Gallery and the House of Photography 

Erasmus University, Rotterdam, the Netherlands 

Main question of the qualitative part of the research: 

What are the arts marketing strategies considering the total museum experience of 
photography museums to add this activity of a sales gallery to the museum?  

- The interviewer: Micheline Snijders, student at the Erasmus University, 
Rotterdam. Master thesis research for the Master ‘Cultural Economics and 
Entrepreneurship’. 

- The topics of the interview will be: 
o Editions department of the photography museum; 
o the marketing components and strategy of Editions; 
o motivations to add this activity to the museum; 
o what this strives to add to ‘the total museum experience’ for the visitor. 

- Interview will last approximately 1 hour and will be recorded to handle what is 
said carefully. 

- It will only be used for my research and will be completely confidential. 

(Note: the notes between the questions are theories and definitions from the literature 
review of the research, these can be explained more extensive during the interview by 
the interviewer.) 

 

 

87 
 



 

- How do you select the photographers, the editions and the photographs for you offer 
at Editions? 

- What is your focus while selecting? 
 

- How are the prices determined for the editions? 
- What is the price range you use? 

 
- Who is your target group with Editions? 

 
- Where is Editions located within the museum? Do they have their own room? 

 
- How did you design the physical environment of Editions?  

 
- How do people know about Editions, what are the promotion activities? 

 
- When a visitor walks in the museum and is looking at the editions, how will the 

process go when he or she wants to buy something? 
 

- Is there someone of the staff to reach with information on the Editions? How does the 
human interaction goes? 

- How do you construct client relations with the buyers at Editions? 
 

- The questions before where mainly about several marketing components, like product, 
place, promotion. How do you try to synergize all these elements for Editions? 
 

Second part: the total museum experience 

- What kind of experience do you try to create with Editions? 
 

- Do you try to create an offer with Editions where there already exists demand for, or 
do you try to create a demand? 
 

- What goals do you have with Editions? 
 

- Editions is more or less a service that you offer, what kind of service do you want to 
create with Editions for the visitors? 

Note:  

For the research I approach the museum from the viewpoint of ‘the total museum 
experience’, this means that the whole museum visit can be seen as one experience, and that 
all parts of that visit add something to this experience, such as the restaurant, the shop and so 
on. The visitor judges this as one complete experience. 
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There are different levels in the way people undergo an experience, these can be divided in 
active participation or passive participation, and by being absorbed by it, like watching 
television or by being immersed by it, like playing in a movie. 

There has been made a distinction in four kinds of experiences: 

o An educational experience: you learn something, you participate active, but 
absorb something, like studying for an exam. 

o An aesthetic experience: you participate passive, but you are immersed by it, 
like watching an artwork in a museum. 

o An escapist experience: you participate active, and you are immersed by it, 
like playing in a musical. 

o An entertaining experience: you act passive, and you absorb something, like 
watching a movie. 
 

- How does Editions create a possibility for the visitor to participate in a new way at 
the museum? 
 

- How does Editions add something to ‘the total museum experience’ for the visitor that 
is already offered? 

Note:  

Another theory takes the total museum experience to a new level. This theory is about giving 
meaning to an experience. This happens when the visitor does not only just experiences 
something, it also transforms or changes the visitor. For example, after seeing the editions at 
the House of Photography, a visitor can be so inspired, that it wants to buy one, and after this 
he or she becomes a photography collector.  

This ‘transformation’ can be done in different ways: by offering an extra service; by 
increasing the knowledge of the visitor; by increasing social and cultural responsibility of the 
visitor; and by the realization of immaterial happiness of the visitor. 

- To what extent can Editions give a specific meaning to the experience of the visitor? 
Or how do you try to add meaning to the experience? 

Note: 

At a museum visit, the visitor has a personal context, he or she only experiences something 
individually; a social context, he or she has interaction with other visitors and/ or staff; and a 
physical context, he or she is actually within a physical space.  

- How do you try to influence or stimulate those three contexts at Editions? 
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Third part: the strategy of Editions now and in the future 

- How does the strategy of Editions fit within the total strategy of the House of 
Photography? 

- When do you consider Editions as successful? 
- At the moment, what are the challenges for Editions? 
- Who is the competitor for Editions? 

 
- Do you believe that the House of Photography distinguishes itself from other 

museums with the Editions? And how does it distinguish itself? 
 

- How is Editions functioning last years? 
- What parts of the Editions would you like to extend or develop more in the future? 
- Do you think the House of Photography is a progressive museum because of the 

Editions? 
- How do you see Editions in 10 years from now? 

 

Thank you for your cooperation! 
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B Coding scheme of the interviews 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Part II: Total Museum 
Experience 

1 Total Museum Experience 

A Educational 

B Aesthetic 

C Escapist 

D Entertaining 

2 Meaningful Experience 

A Enabling 

B Enlightening 

C Engaging 

D Educational 

 

Part III: Arts Marketing 
Strategies 

1 Mission 

A Cultural Entrepreneurship 

2 Strategy 

A Supply 

Audience Goals 

Product Goals 

Organizational/ Competitive 
Goals 

B Market & Demand 

Artists 

Competitive Environment 

Visitors 

3 SWOT Analyses 

A Strengths 

B Weaknesses 

C Opportunities 

D Threats 

 

 

 

Part I: Marketing 
Components 

1 Product 

A Extended experience 

B Offer 

C Offer selection 

2 Price 

A Financial objectives 

B Marketing objectives 

C Market position 

D Nature of the market 

E Price competition 

3 Place 

4 Promotion 

5 Service 

A People 

B Physical Environment 

C Process 

6 Synergy 
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C Questionnaires FOAM and the House of Photography  
English version handed out at FOAM: 
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Dutch version handed out at FOAM: 
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English version handed out at the House of Photography: 
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German version handed out at the House of Photography:

95 
 



 
 D

 
Ex

te
ns

iv
e 

co
di

ng
 s

ch
em

e 
of

 th
e 

in
te

rv
ie

w
s 

 Pa
rt

 I:
 

M
ar

ke
tin

g 
C

om
po

ne
nt

s 

H
ou

se
 o

f P
ho

to
gr

ap
hy

 
FO

A
M

 
T

he
 P

ho
to

gr
ap

he
rs

’ G
al

le
ry

 

1 
Pr

od
uc

t 
 

 
 

A
 E

xt
en

de
d 

ex
pe

ri
en

ce
 

Th
e 

H
ou

se
 o

f P
ho

to
gr

ap
hy

 o
ffe

rs
 sp

ec
ia

l p
ho

to
gr

ap
hy

 e
di

tio
ns

 th
at

 
ar

e 
fo

r s
al

e 
co

nn
ec

te
d 

to
 e

ve
ry

 e
xh

ib
iti

on
 th

ey
 h

av
e.

 S
o 

th
is

 fa
lls

 in
 

th
e 

ca
te

go
ry

 o
f t

he
 e

xt
en

de
d 

ex
pe

rie
nc

e 
th

e 
m

us
eu

m
 h

as
 to

 o
ffe

r. 
 

“W
e 

try
 to

 d
o 

fo
r e

ac
h 

ex
hi

bi
tio

n 
to

 m
ak

e 
an

 e
di

tio
n…

” 

Th
e 

up
pe

r f
lo

or
 o

f F
O

A
M

 is
 F

oa
m

 E
di

tio
ns

, F
oa

m
 E

di
tio

ns
 

is
 a

 d
ep

ar
tm

en
t o

f F
O

A
M

 w
er

e 
sp

ec
ia

l p
ho

to
gr

ap
hy

 e
di

tio
ns

 
ar

e 
fo

r s
al

e.
 A

dd
iti

on
al

ly
 F

oa
m

 E
di

tio
ns

 p
ro

vi
de

s c
ou

rs
es

 o
n 

co
lle

ct
in

g 
ph

ot
og

ra
ph

y.
 S

o 
it 

is
 a

n 
ex

te
ns

io
n 

to
 th

e 
co

re
 

ac
tiv

ity
 o

f t
he

 m
us

eu
m

. 

“D
us

 a
ls 

ee
n 

so
or

t v
an

 e
er

st
e 

pl
ek

 o
m

 g
ra

tis
, m

is
sc

hi
en

 w
el

, 
vr

ijb
lij

ve
nd

 in
fo

rm
at

ie
 te

 v
er

kr
ijg

en
 o

ve
r v

er
za

m
el

en
 v

an
 

fo
to

gr
af

ie
.”

   
 

Th
e 

Pr
in

t S
al

es
 d

ep
ar

tm
en

t i
s a

n 
en

te
rp

ris
e 

w
ith

in
 th

e 
m

us
eu

m
. I

t f
un

ct
io

ns
 a

s a
 c

om
m

er
ci

al
 g

al
le

ry
, i

t o
rg

an
iz

es
 5

 
to

 6
 e

xh
ib

iti
on

s e
ve

ry
 y

ea
r a

nd
 it

 re
pr

es
en

ts
 a

pp
ro

xi
m

at
el

y 
35

 a
rti

st
s. 

Th
ey

 a
re

 a
n 

ex
te

ns
io

n 
to

 th
e 

co
re

 b
us

in
es

s o
f t

he
 

pu
bl

ic
 g

al
le

ry
 a

nd
 o

ffe
r t

he
 p

os
si

bi
lit

y 
to

 b
uy

 a
rtw

or
ks

 a
t t

he
 

m
us

eu
m

. 

“B
ec

au
se

 w
e 

ar
e 

a 
ch

ar
ity

, t
he

 P
rin

t S
al

es
, t

he
 b

oo
ks

ho
p 

an
d 

th
e 

ca
fé

 h
er

e 
ha

ve
 a

 re
al

ly
 d

is
tin

ct
 im

po
rta

nt
 in

 o
rd

er
 to

 
ge

ne
ra

te
 p

ro
fit

 th
at

 c
an

 ro
ll 

ba
ck

 in
to

 th
e 

pu
bl

ic
 g

al
le

ry
 a

nd
 

th
e 

pu
bl

ic
 p

ro
gr

am
.”

 

B
 O

ff
er

 
Ev

er
y 

ex
hi

bi
tio

n 
th

ey
 m

ak
e 

a 
sp

ec
ia

l e
di

tio
n 

th
at

 w
ill

 b
e 

fo
r s

al
e.

 
So

 th
e 

of
fe

r o
f e

di
tio

ns
 th

e 
m

us
eu

m
 p

ro
vi

de
s i

s a
 c

ol
le

ct
io

n 
of

 
sp

ec
ia

l e
di

tio
ns

 o
f p

re
vi

ou
s a

nd
 c

ur
re

nt
 e

xh
ib

iti
on

s. 
 

“B
ut

 h
er

e 
it 

al
w

ay
s f

its
 to

ge
th

er
 w

ith
 th

e 
ex

hi
bi

tio
n,

 th
is

 is
 I 

th
in

k,
 

th
is

 is
 fo

r u
s v

er
y 

im
po

rta
nt

.”
 

Fo
am

 E
di

tio
ns

 o
ffe

rs
 p

ho
to

 b
oo

ks
 in

 li
m

ite
d 

ed
iti

on
, p

ho
to

 
bo

ok
s t

ha
t a

re
 si

gn
ed

 b
y 

th
e 

ar
tis

t o
r t

ha
t c

on
ta

in
 a

 sp
ec

ia
l 

ed
iti

on
 p

rin
t a

nd
 sp

ec
ia

l p
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 c
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ra
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 c
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 d
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 p
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f p
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 g
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 b
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ot
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G
al

le
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n 
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rti
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e 
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 b
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 g
en

er
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en
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 c
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ot

og
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e 
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ed

 p
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to
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w
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ng
 to

 b
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ne
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e 
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w
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 p
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e 
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t t
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 b
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la
te

d 
to

 th
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ex
hi

bi
tio
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e 
m

us
eu

m
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rg
an

iz
es
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di

tio
ns
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 o
ff
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di
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nt
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pe

s o
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di
tio

ns
, t
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t t
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e 

ed
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s t
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t a

re
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om
 e

st
ab
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og

ra
ph

er
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f o
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G

al
le

ry
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di
tio
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s e
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in
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ve
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 se
le

ct
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n 
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ff
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re

 o
f c

on
te

m
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ry
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rti

st
s, 
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 fr
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st
at
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. S

o 
th

e 
ed

iti
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s t
he

y 
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fe
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re
 v

er
y 

de
pe
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t o
n 
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ex
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bi
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e 
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ot
og

ra
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r e
st

at
e 

th
ey
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re
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ith
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 th
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th
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ex
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bi
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o 
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ea
te
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 sp

ec
ia

l e
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tio
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 c
oo

pe
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r t
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al
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rie
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ep
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eu
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 p
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m
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 p
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ev
er
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im
es

 th
e 

pr
od

uc
tio

n 
co

st
s a
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 c
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d 
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f P
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de
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an
d 
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m
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e 
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e 

an
d 
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e 

th
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ow

ev
er
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s 
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s p
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e 

th
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r t

he
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al
le

rie
s b
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w
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ch
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 c
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o 

no
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se
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ar
tie

s w
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o 

se
ll 
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is 
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 d
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e 
H
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gr
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r o
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 c
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th
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 p
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 b
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 b
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 b
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 d
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 d
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 m
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 b
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 p
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t o
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ra
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 p
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, t
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 m
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at
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 C
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 c
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 d
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 c
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 d
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t d
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w
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 p
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 d
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 d
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f d
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t c
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r b
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t d
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r p
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 d
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 D
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 c
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l p
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 c
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 c
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 c
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t w
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 c
ar

ee
rs

.”
 

“S
om

et
im

es
, b

ut
 ra

re
ly

, i
t g

en
er

al
ly

 w
or

ks
 th

at
, i

f t
he

 p
ub

lic
 

ga
lle

ry
 h

as
 a

 c
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 d
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 p
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 p
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e 
kn

ow
 w

e 
ca

n 
br

in
g 

to
 

th
e 

ge
ne

ra
l p
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 b
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 c
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 d
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 c
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 o
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ds
 fo

r t
he

ir 
ar

tis
ts

, 
th

at
 th

e 
pr

ic
es

 b
ec

om
e 

co
m

pa
ra

bl
e 

w
ith

 th
e 

pr
ic

es
 fo

r 
es

ta
bl

is
he

d 
ar

tis
ts

 in
 o

th
er
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aj

or
 c

om
m

er
ci

al
 g

al
le

rie
s. 

Fo
r 

th
ei

r e
sta

bl
ish

ed
 n

am
es

 th
ey

 lo
ok

 a
t t

he
 p

ric
es

 fo
r t

he
ir 

w
or

ks
 

in
 th

e 
au

ct
io

n 
m

ar
ke

t. 
Th

e 
pr

ic
es

 fo
r t

he
 G

al
le

ry
 E

di
tio

ns
 a

re
 

de
ci

de
d 

in
 c

on
su

lta
tio

n 
w

ith
 th

e 
ar

tis
t w

ho
 d

on
at

es
 th

e 
pr

in
t. 

“…
 w

e 
try

 o
ur

 h
ar

de
st

 to
 ju

dg
e 

w
ha

t t
he

 m
ar

ke
t v

al
ue

 is
, a

nd
 

w
or

k 
w

ith
 th

at
. A

nd
 w

e 
lo

ok
 a

t t
he

 se
co

nd
ar

y 
m

ar
ke

t f
or

 
th

os
e 

ar
tis

ts,
 if

 th
ey

 h
av

e 
on

e,
 so

 th
e 

au
ct

io
n 

m
ar

ke
t.”

 

3 
Pl

ac
e 

Th
e 

ed
iti

on
s a

re
 o

n 
sh

ow
 o

n 
a 

w
al

l a
t t

he
 e

nt
ra

nc
e 

ha
ll 

in
 th

e 
ex

hi
bi

tio
n 

ro
om

. O
n 

th
e 

w
al

l a
re

 in
fo

rm
at

io
n 

bo
ar

ds
 th

at
 in

di
ca

te
 

th
at

 th
es

e 
ar

tw
or

ks
 a

re
 fo

r s
al

e 
an

d 
do

 n
ot

 b
el

on
g 

to
 th

e 
ex

hi
bi

tio
n.

 
Th

ey
 n

or
m

al
ly

 h
an

g 
al

l t
he

 e
di

tio
ns

 th
ey

 h
av

e,
 a

lso
 th

e 
ol

de
r o

ne
s. 

H
ow

ev
er

 th
is

 w
al

l i
s n

ot
 p

er
m

an
en

tly
 p

re
se

nt
 in

 th
e 

m
us

eu
m

. D
ue

 
to

 d
iff

er
en

t e
xh

ib
iti

on
s a

nd
 li

m
ite

d 
w

al
l s

pa
ce

, s
om

et
im

es
 th

e 
ed

iti
on

s w
al

l i
s r

em
ov

ed
. D

ur
in

g 
Ch

ris
tm

as
 ti

m
e 

th
ey

 m
ak

e 
su

re
 

th
at

 th
e 

w
al

l i
s t

he
re

, s
in

ce
 th

ey
 b

el
ie

ve
 th

at
 p

eo
pl

e 
co

ul
d 

bu
y 

th
e 

ed
iti

on
s a

s a
 p

re
se

nt
. T

he
y 

fin
d 

it 
pr

ob
le

m
 th

at
 it

 is
 im

po
ss

ib
le

 to
 

pu
t a

 p
er

m
an

en
t w

al
l w

ith
 th

e 
ed

iti
on

s i
n 

th
e 

m
us

eu
m

.  

Th
ey

 c
on

si
de

re
d 

to
 p

ut
 th

e 
ed

iti
on

s i
n 

th
e 

bo
ok

st
or

e,
 b

ut
 th

ey
 

be
lie

ve
 th

at
 th

e 
ed

iti
on

s l
oo

k 
m

or
e 

im
po

rta
nt

 w
he

n 
th

ey
 a

re
 v

is
ib

le
 

in
 th

e 
ex

hi
bi

tio
n 

ro
om

. A
dd

iti
on

al
ly

 th
at

 is
 im

po
ss

ib
le

 d
ue

 to
 th

e 
lim

ite
d 

sp
ac

e.
 In

 th
e 

bo
ok

sto
re

 th
er

e 
is 

on
e 

w
al

l w
he

re
 e

di
tio

ns
 a

re
 

sh
ow

n 
th

at
 y

ou
 c

an
 b

uy
 to

ge
th

er
 w

ith
 li

m
ite

d 
ed

iti
on

 p
ho

to
gr

ap
hy

 
bo

ok
s a

nd
 so

m
et

im
es

 th
ey

 p
ut

 a
n 

ar
tw

or
k 

of
 th

e 
ex

hi
bi

tio
n 

th
er

e.
 

Th
at

 le
av

es
 n

o 
sp

ac
e 

fo
r t

he
 H

ou
se

 o
f P

ho
to

gr
ap

hy
 e

di
tio

ns
. 

B
ot

h 
th

e 
ph

ot
ob

oo
k 

st
or

e 
ow

ne
r a

nd
 th

e 
cu

ra
to

r c
on

sid
er

 it
 a

s a
 

go
od

 id
ea

 to
 h

av
e 

an
 sp

ec
ia

l r
oo

m
 fo

r t
he

 e
di

tio
ns

. B
ut

 th
e 

ar
ch

ite
ct

ur
e 

of
 th

e 
m

us
eu

m
 m

ak
es

 th
at

 d
iff

ic
ul

t. 
Es

pe
ci

al
ly

 w
ith

 
th

e 
ol

de
r e

di
tio

ns
 th

at
 h

av
e 

no
 li

nk
 w

ith
 th

e 
cu

rre
nt

 e
xh

ib
iti

on
. A

nd
 

it 
co

ul
d 

ha
ve

 th
e 

ad
va

nt
ag

e 
th

at
 th

e 
vi

si
to

rs
 se

e 
th

e 
sa

m
e 

im
ag

es
 

ev
er

y 
tim

e 
an

d 
sta

rt 
to

 li
ke

 th
em

 a
nd

 m
ay

be
 b

uy
 th

em
 in

 th
e 

fu
tu

re
.  

“S
o 

w
e 

de
ci

de
d 

to
 sh

ow
 th

em
 o

n 
a 

sp
ec

ia
l w

al
l i

n 
th

e 
en

tra
nc

e 
of

 
th

e 
m

us
eu

m
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“B
ut

 I 
th

in
k 

it 
is

 im
po

rta
nt

 th
at

 th
ey

 h
av

e 
on

e 
fix

ed
 p

la
ce

 w
he

re
 w

e 

Fo
am

 E
di

tio
ns

 is
 lo

ca
te

d 
on

 th
e 

to
p 

flo
or

 o
f t

he
 m

us
eu

m
, i

t 
is

 lo
ca

te
d 

th
er

e 
be

ca
us

e 
th

is
 fl

oo
r w
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 st

ill
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ac
an

t, 
an

d 
it 

is 
su

ita
bl

e 
fo

r g
al

le
ry

 e
xh
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iti

on
s. 

B
ec

au
se

 it
 is

 o
n 

th
e 

to
p 

flo
or

, p
eo

pl
e 

ha
ve

 to
 k

no
w

 th
at

 it
 is

 th
er

e 
an

d 
th

en
 g

o 
up

sta
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. T
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re
 si

gn
s i

n 
th

e 
m

us
eu

m
 th

at
 p

oi
nt

 to
 F

oa
m

 
Ed

iti
on

s. 
Fi

rs
t t

he
y 

w
er

e 
af

ra
id

 th
at

 n
ob

od
y 

w
ou

ld
 fi

nd
 it

, 
th

at
 it

 w
ou

ld
 to

 h
id

de
n.

 B
ut

 th
ey

 e
xp

er
ie

nc
e 

th
at

 n
ot

 a
ll 

vi
si

to
rs

 g
o 

up
, a

pp
ro

xi
m

at
el

y 
10

0 
a 

da
y,

 a
nd

 th
at

 th
is
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 a

n 
au

di
en

ce
 o

f c
ur

io
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 o
r i

nt
er

es
te

d 
pe

op
le

, s
o 

th
at

 it
 w
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B

ef
or

e 
th

ey
 w
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e 

lo
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te
d 
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 c
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ng
ed

 fr
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 lo
ca

tio
ns

, 
th

e 
m

an
ag

er
 st

at
es

 th
at

 a
 p

er
m

an
en

t l
oc

at
io

n 
is

 im
po

rta
nt

, 
be

ca
us

e 
th

en
 p

eo
pl

e 
kn

ow
 h

ow
 to

 fi
nd

 it
. 

“d
at

 w
as

 g
ew

oo
n 

ec
ht

 d
e 

pl
ek

 w
aa

r w
e 

no
g 

ve
el

 v
ie

rk
an

te
 

m
et

er
s h

ad
de

n 
om

, j
a,

 te
 la

te
n 

zi
en

 h
è,

 w
at

 v
oo

r s
oo

rt 
ga

le
rie

-a
ch

tig
e 

ru
im

te
 w

e 
he

bb
en
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d 
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e 
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m

en
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 m
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eu
m
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t t
o 
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e 

bo
ok

sh
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. T
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 d
ire

ct
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n 
de

ci
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d 
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 a
ll 

en
te

rp
ris

es
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n 
th

e 
gr

ou
nd

 fl
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r a
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 in
 th

e 
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se
m

en
t. 

Pr
in

t S
al

es
 d

oe
s n

ot
 

fin
d 

th
is

 lo
ca

tio
n 

id
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l. 
Th

is
 is

 m
ai

nl
y 

be
ca

us
e 

th
ey

 h
av

e 
th

e 
id

ea
 th

at
 m

an
y 

pe
op

le
 c

an
no

t f
in

d 
it 

an
d 

th
ey
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nd

 th
e 

pl
ac

e 
ve

ry
 c

om
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om
is

ed
. B

ec
au

se
 th

e 
sp

ac
e 

gi
ve

n 
is

 q
ui

te
 sm

al
l, 

th
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 c
an

no
t o

rg
an

iz
e 

ve
ry

 b
ig

 so
lo

 e
xh

ib
iti

on
s f

or
 th

ei
r 

ar
tis

ts
. F

ur
th

er
m

or
e 

th
ey

 w
ou

ld
 li

ke
 to

 h
av

e 
a 

se
pa

ra
tio

n 
in

 
th

e 
ga

lle
ry

 sp
ac

e,
 so

 th
ey

 c
ou

ld
 ta

ke
 im

po
rta

nt
 b

uy
er

s i
nt

o 
a 

m
or

e 
pr

iv
at

e 
sp

ac
e,

 b
ut

 th
e 

lo
ca

tio
n 

do
es

 n
ot

 a
llo

w
 fo

r t
ha

t. 
So

 th
ey

 h
av

e 
to

 m
an

ag
e 

w
ith

 th
e 

sp
ac

e 
gi

ve
n.

 It
 is

 
em

ph
as

iz
ed

 th
at

 a
 p

er
m

an
en

t l
oc
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io

n 
is

 im
po

rta
nt

 fo
r t

he
m

 
an

d 
th

at
 th

e 
lo

ca
tio

n 
al

lo
w

s  
to

 o
rg

an
iz

e 
ex

hi
bi

tio
ns

, i
n 

hi
st

or
y 

th
is

 w
as

 n
ot

 a
lw

ay
s t

he
 c

as
e,

 a
nd

 th
at

 re
al

ly
 d

id
 n

ot
 

w
or

k.
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o 

it 
w
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 d
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is
io

n 
m

ad
e 

by
 th

e 
di

re
ct

or
s, 

th
at

 th
ey

 w
ou

ld
 

co
nt

ai
n 

th
e 

en
te

rp
ris

es
 o

n 
th

e 
gr

ou
nd

 fl
oo

r a
nd

 in
 th

e 
ba

se
m

en
t. 

Th
e 

ac
tu

al
 la

y-
ou

t i
s n

ot
 o

ur
 c

ho
ic

e,
 it

 w
as

 th
e 

sp
ac

e 
w

e 
w

er
e 

gi
ve

n.
” 
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ca
n 

sh
ow

 th
e 

ex
hi

bi
tio

ns
.”

  

“B
ec

au
se

 w
he

n 
it 

is 
sh

ow
n 

in
 th

e 
ex

hi
bi

tio
n 

ha
ll 

it 
m

ak
es

 a
ll 

th
e 

ed
iti

on
s l

oo
k 

a 
lit

tle
 b

it 
m

or
e 

im
po

rta
nt

, t
he

n 
w

he
n 

it 
is

 sh
ow

n 
in

 
th

e 
bo

ok
st

or
e.

” 

“…
in

 th
is

 a
rc

hi
te

ct
ur

e,
 th

at
 y

ou
 h

av
e 

no
t a

 d
oo

r t
ha

t y
ou

 c
an

 o
pe

n.
 

O
r i

f y
ou
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y,

 it
 is

 n
ow

 c
lo

se
d,

 y
ou

 c
an

no
t c

lo
se
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e 

do
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. H
er

e 
it 

is
 

ab
so

lu
te

 a
n 

op
en

 sp
ac

e.
” 
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Th
e 

ed
iti
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s a
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e 
on

 th
e 

w
eb
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te
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f t

he
 H

ou
se
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f 

Ph
ot

og
ra
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y,

 a
nd

 o
nl

in
e 

th
er

e 
is

 th
e 

po
ss

ib
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 to

 c
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k 
on

 a
 d

ig
ita

l 
fly

er
 w

ith
 a

ll 
th

e 
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e 

ed
iti

on
s. 

A
n 

e-
m

ai
l a

cc
ou

nt
 fo

r t
he

 
ed

iti
on

s i
s s

ho
w

n 
on

 th
e 

w
eb

si
te

: e
di

tio
ns

@
de

ic
ht

or
ha

lle
n.

 T
he

y 
al

so
 h

av
e 

a 
fly

er
, w

hi
ch

 th
ey

 n
or

m
al

ly
 h

av
e 

in
 th

e 
bo

ok
st

or
e 

an
d 

at
 

th
e 

in
fo

rm
at

io
n 

de
sk

. I
t i

s a
lso

 m
en

tio
ne

d 
in

 th
e 

D
ei

ch
to

rh
al

le
n 

ne
w

sl
et

te
r a

nd
 b

lo
g.

 H
ow

ev
er

, i
t a

pp
ea

rs
 th

at
 th

ey
 p

ut
 n

ot
 th

at
 

m
an

y 
at

te
nt

io
n 

in
 p

ro
m

ot
in

g 
th

e 
ed

iti
on

s a
s b

ot
h 

in
te

rv
ie

w
ee

s a
re

 
no

t c
om

pl
et

el
y 

su
re

 w
ha

t t
he

y 
do

 a
s p

ro
m

ot
io

na
l a

ct
iv

iti
es

. B
ot

h 
em

ph
as

iz
e 

th
at

 it
 c

ou
ld

 b
e 

us
ef

ul
 to

 h
av

e 
m

or
e 

pr
om

ot
io

na
l 

ac
tiv

iti
es

 to
 g

ai
n 

a 
w

id
er

 re
ac

h 
at

 th
e 

vi
si

to
rs

 fo
r t

he
 e

di
tio

ns
. 

B
ec

au
se

 th
e 

or
ga

ni
za

tio
n 

of
 th

e 
Ed

iti
on

s i
s d

iv
id

ed
, i

t c
ou

ld
 b

e 
th

at
 

no
bo

dy
 is

 re
sp

on
sib

le
 fo

r t
he

 p
ro

m
ot

io
na

l a
ct

iv
iti

es
. 

“W
e 

ha
ve

 it
 o

n 
ou

r w
eb

si
te

, o
n 

ou
r n

ew
sl

et
te

r, 
w

he
n 

w
e 

m
ak

e 
ne

w
 

ed
iti

on
s, 

I t
hi

nk
 th

ey
 p

ut
 it

 o
n 

ou
r D

ei
ch

to
rh

al
le

n 
bl

og
.”

  

“I
 th

in
k 

I h
av

e 
to

 a
sk

 a
ga

in
 o

ur
 c

ol
le

ge
s w

ha
t h

ap
pe

ne
d 

w
ith

 o
ur

 
sp

ec
ia

l f
ly

er
.”
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…

I t
hi

nk
 th

ey
 p

ut
 it

 o
n 

ou
r D

ei
ch

to
rh

al
le

n 
bl

og
.”

  

“Y
ou

 h
av

e 
to

 m
ak

e 
sp

ec
ia

l a
dv

er
tis

in
g,

 th
en

 y
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 h
av

e 
to

 ta
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, t
he

n 
yo

u 
ha

ve
 to

 m
ak

e 
a 

se
nd

in
g 

to
 th

e 
cu

sto
m

er
s a

nd
 so

 o
n,

 th
is

 is
 a

 
fu

llt
im

e 
jo

b,
 b

ut
 w

e 
ha

ve
 n

ot
, b

ut
 it

 c
ou

ld
. I

 th
in

k 
if 

w
e 

do
 th

is 
m

or
e 

pr
of

es
si

on
al

 in
 th

is
 ti

m
e,

 I 
th

in
k 

w
e 

ne
ed

 so
m

e 
pe

rs
on

.”
 

Fo
am

 E
di

tio
ns

 h
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 a
 fe

w
 p

ro
m

ot
io

na
l a

ct
iv

iti
es

, t
he

y 
ha

ve
 

th
ei

r o
w

n 
fly

er
, a

 w
eb

 sh
op

 o
n 

th
e 

FO
A

M
 w

eb
si

te
 a

nd
 

so
m

et
im

es
 th

ey
 h

av
e 

th
ei

r o
w

n 
ad

ve
rti

se
m

en
t i

n 
FO

A
M

 
M

ag
az

in
e.

 S
om

et
im

es
 th

ey
 a

re
 in

 li
sti

ng
s, 

an
d 

fo
r t

he
 

co
lle

ct
in

g 
co

ur
se

 th
ey

 h
ad

 a
 sp

ec
ia

l o
ffe

r a
dv

er
tis

em
en

t i
n 

tw
o 

D
ut

ch
 n

ew
sp

ap
er

s. 
Th

ei
r p

ro
m

ot
io

n 
ac

tiv
iti

es
 a

re
 

m
ai

nl
y 

to
ge

th
er

 w
ith

 th
e 

FO
A

M
 p

ro
m

ot
io

ns
. T

he
y 

do
 n

ot
 

ha
ve

 a
n 

in
de

pe
nd

en
t n

ew
sl

et
te

r, 
Fa

ce
bo

ok
 o

r o
th

er
 m

ed
ia

 
ch

an
ne

l, 
it 

is 
al

l p
ar

t o
f t

he
 p

ro
m

ot
io

n 
of

 th
e 

m
us

eu
m

 a
s a

 
w

ho
le

. 

“F
oa

m
 E

di
tio

ns
 h

ee
ft 

oo
k 

ge
en

 e
ig

en
 n

ie
uw

sb
rie

f, 
of

 g
ee

n 
ei

ge
n 

Fa
ce

bo
ok

, o
f g

ee
n 

ei
ge

n 
w

eb
si

te
, h

et
 is

 d
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r a
lle

m
aa

l 
on

de
rd

ee
l v

an
.”

   
 

Th
e 

Ph
ot
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ra
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er

s’
 G

al
le

ry
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 d

iff
er

en
t p

re
ss

 a
ng

le
s a

nd
 

so
ci

al
 m

ed
ia

 n
et

w
or
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 w

he
re
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re
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 is
 g

en
er

at
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 fo
r t

he
 

ex
hi

bi
tio

ns
 o

f P
rin

t S
al

es
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rg
an

iz
es

 a
lo
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de
 th

e 
ot

he
r 
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tiv

iti
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 o
f t

he
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eu

m
. E
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m

pl
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 th
e 

w
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si
te

, T
w

itt
er

, 
Fa

ce
bo

ok
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nd
 a
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er
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em

en
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n 
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e 
un

de
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un
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A
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iti
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ly
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 m
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ne
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pe
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t p
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m
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n 
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e 
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us
eu
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rt 
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 p
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ev

er
 th
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 p
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e 
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e 
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A
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to
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r p
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ex

pe
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at
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ve
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oo
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s d
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r t
he

 m
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eu
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le
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et
te

r 
to

 d
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H
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e 
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th
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th
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 p
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m
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l 
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ie
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 d
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k 
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, 
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 p
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te
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 c
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 c
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el
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 p

re
ss

 a
ng

le
s, 
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r e
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s f
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 d
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 c
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 b
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ey
 c
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w
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 b
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 c
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e 
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w
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ra
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r t
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ho
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e 
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e 

ex
tra

 se
rv

ic
e 

th
at

 it
 is

 p
os

si
bl

e 
to

 b
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t o
f t

hi
s s

er
vi

ce
 y

et
. I

t 
fu

nc
tio

ns
 m
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 b
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w
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in
gs

 th
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m
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 se
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 p
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di
tio
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t t
he

 m
us

eu
m
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W

ith
 th
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 se
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e 
th
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t c
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y 
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 b
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a 
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m
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l c
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e 
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ff 
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d 
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lw
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t p
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W
ith
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e 

pe
op
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 p

hy
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s, 
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 c
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r 
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, b
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 p
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s 
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at
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m
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e 
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s t
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go
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le
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-

R
ei
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en
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ei

n 
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e 

bo
ok

st
or
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an
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lls
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. T
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 te
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 o
f t
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H
ou

se
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f P
ho
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t c
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he
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ns
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in
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 M
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 th
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 c
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 b
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 c
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H

e 
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t c
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rs
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 c
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rta
nt

. B
ut

 d
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d 
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s p
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e.
 F

ur
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m
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to
rs

 a
sk

 a
bo

ut
 e
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 b
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 c
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t d
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w
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u 
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e 
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 c
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 c
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, b
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s b
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l c
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, p
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 c
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he
 g
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ut
 I 
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e 
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rs
t b

uy
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e 
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 th
en

 m
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ts 
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 b
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 m
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e 
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 c
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w
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r t
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m
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 d
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e 
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lu
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 w
al
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d 
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 p
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ar
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e 
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Th
at
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 th

e 
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on
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 so
m

eo
ne
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 a

lw
ay

s p
re

se
nt

 
th

er
e.

 B
ec

au
se
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m
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, p
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e 
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rra
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e 
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 c
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, d
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 d
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 d
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 m
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t d
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 c
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r c
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 m
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s f
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w
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 b
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 c
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s p
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t c
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 c
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in

g,
 a

nd
 e

sp
ec

ia
lly

 in
 th
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ra
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 m
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f p
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 c
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” 
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e 

in
fo

rm
at

io
n 

th
an

 th
ey

 w
ou

ld
 n

or
m

al
ly

 d
o 

Fo
am

 E
di

tio
ns

 is
 lo

ca
te

d 
in

 th
e 

at
tic

 o
f t

he
 b

ui
ld

in
g,

 it
 

th
er

ef
or

e 
lo

ok
s d

iff
er

en
t t

ha
n 

th
e 

re
st

 o
f t

he
 m

us
eu

m
. 

H
ow

ev
er

, t
he

 a
es

th
et

ic
s i

ns
id

e 
ar

e 
de

sig
ne

d 
th

e 
sa

m
e 

w
ay

 a
s 

th
e 

re
st

 o
f t

he
 m

us
eu

m
, a

s p
ar

t o
f t

he
 m

us
eu

m
 a

s a
 w

ho
le

. 
Th

e 
sp

ac
e 

is 
de

si
gn

ed
 to

 c
re

at
e 

a 
pl

ac
e 

of
 p

ea
ce

 a
nd

 

Th
e 

Pr
in

t S
al

es
 st

af
f d

ec
id

ed
 o

ve
r t

he
 p

hy
si

ca
l e

nv
iro

nm
en

t 
of

 th
e 

lo
ca

tio
n.

 T
he

y 
ch

oo
se

 to
 g

iv
e 

a 
di

ffe
re

nt
 la

y 
ou

t t
ha

n 
th

e 
re

st
 o

f t
he

 g
al

le
ry

. T
he

y 
try

 to
 c

re
at

e 
an

 in
tim

at
e,

 su
bd

ue
d 

an
d 

qu
ie

t e
nv

iro
nm

en
t. 
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1 

 



 

at
 w

or
ks

 in
 th

e 
ex

hi
bi

tio
n.

 

“Y
ou

 h
av

e 
to

 m
ak

e 
a 

cl
ea

r c
ut

 b
et

w
ee

n 
w

ha
t i

s e
xh

ib
iti

on
 a

nd
 w

ha
t 

yo
u 

ca
n 

bu
y.

” 
 

“Y
ou

 h
av

e 
to

 b
rin

g 
m

or
e 

in
fo

rm
at

io
n 

to
 th

is
 p

rin
t t

he
n 

if 
yo

u 
m

ak
e 

a 
no

rm
al

 e
xh

ib
iti

on
.”

  

“E
sp

ec
ia

lly
 w

he
n 

yo
u 

ha
ve

 n
ot

, w
he

n 
it 

is
 n

ot
 to

ge
th

er
 w

ith
 th

e 
ex

hi
bi

tio
n,

 m
ay

be
 o

ne
 y

ea
r l

at
er

 […
]O

ka
y 

yo
u 

ca
n 

se
e 

th
is

 a
rti

st
 is

 
ve

ry
 im

po
rta

nt
 a

nd
 th

is
 b

el
on

gs
 to

 th
is 

se
rie

s a
nd

 y
ou

 h
av

e 
se

en
 

th
is

 se
rie

s h
er

e 
in

 th
is 

ex
hi

bi
tio

n 
an

d 
so

 o
n.

” 

qu
ie

tn
es

s: 
re

la
xi

ng
 m

us
ic

 is
 tu

rn
ed

 o
n,

 it
 h

as
 n

ic
e 

lig
ht

en
in

g,
 

fre
sh

 fl
ow

er
s, 

ch
ai

rs
, a

 lo
ng

 ta
bl

e 
w

ith
 p

ho
to

gr
ap

hy
 b

oo
ks

, 
an

d 
pe

op
le

 c
an

 g
et

 a
 g

la
ss

 o
f w

at
er

. T
he

y 
w

an
t t

o 
m

ak
e 

pe
op

le
 fe

el
 re

la
xe

d 
an

d 
ap

pr
oa

ch
ab

le
 h

er
e.

 T
he

 e
di

tio
ns

 a
re

 
ha

ng
ed

 o
n 

th
e 

w
al

ls,
 th

ey
 u

se
d 

to
 b

e 
in

 st
or

ag
e 

bi
ns

, b
ut

 th
e 

cu
rre

nt
 m

an
ag

er
 c

ha
ng

ed
 th

at
 a

nd
 h

an
ge

d 
th

em
 o

n 
th

e 
w

al
ls,

 
be

ca
us

e 
no

w
 it

 lo
ok

s m
or

e 
lik

e 
yo

u 
w

ou
ld

 h
av

e 
it 

on
 y

ou
r 

w
al

l a
t h

om
e.

 F
ur

th
er

m
or

e 
sh

e 
ha

s p
ut

 si
gn

s w
ith

 e
ve

ry
 

ed
iti

on
 w

ith
 in

fo
rm

at
io

n 
on

 th
e 

ar
tis

t, 
th

e 
tit

le
, t

he
 p

ric
e 

an
d 

th
e 

m
at

er
ia

l. 
Th

is
 is

 to
 m

ak
e 

cl
ea

r t
he

 w
or

ks
 a

re
 fo

r s
al

e.
 

A
nd

 th
e 

si
gn

s i
n 

th
e 

m
us

eu
m

 th
at

 p
oi

nt
 th

e 
di

re
ct

io
ns

 to
 th

e 
Fo

am
 E

di
tio

ns
 fl

oo
r h

av
e 

th
e 

ad
di

tio
na

l t
ex

t o
f ‘

Pr
in

t S
al

es
 

R
oo

m
’ t

hi
s i

s a
lso

 to
 m

ak
e 

su
re

 it
 is

 fo
r s

al
e 

an
d 

to
 in

fo
rm

 
th

e 
vi

si
to

r. 

“M
aa

r o
ok

 e
en

 st
uk

je
 e

rv
ar

in
g 

al
s r

us
t, 

w
an

t e
r s

ta
at

 e
en

 
m

uz
ie

kj
e 

aa
n,

 e
r i

s m
oo

ie
 v

er
lic

ht
in

g,
 e

r s
ta

an
 st

oe
le

n,
 e

n 
je

 
ka

n 
aa

n 
ee

n 
la

ng
e 

ta
fe

l z
itt

en
 o

m
 b

oe
ke

n 
do

or
he

en
 te

 
bl

ad
er

en
.”

   
 

“M
aa

r i
k 

he
b 

da
t d

e 
la

at
st

e 
tij

d 
m

ee
r m

et
 li

js
te

n 
ge

da
an

, 
om

da
t i

k 
da

t k
on

 re
ge

le
n 

m
et

 d
e 

lij
st

en
m

ak
er

. E
n 

om
da

t h
et

 
er

 d
an

 to
ch

 u
it 

zi
et

 z
oa

ls 
je

 h
et

 b
ij 

je
ze

lf 
th

ui
s z

ou
 o

ph
an

ge
n.

 
D

us
 v

er
ko

op
 d

ac
ht

 ik
 d

at
 is

 g
ew

oo
n 

be
te

r.”
   

 

“…
w

e 
w

an
te

d 
to

 c
om

pl
et

el
y 

di
ffe

re
nt

ia
te

 it
 fr

om
 th

e 
fe

el
in

g 
of

 th
e 

re
st

 o
f t

he
 g

al
le

ry
. [

…
]  

w
e 

pu
t t

ha
t s

lig
ht

ly
, w

e 
w

an
te

d 
so

m
et

hi
ng

 m
uc

h 
m

or
e 

in
tim

at
e,

 m
uc

h 
qu

ie
te

r.”
 

“M
ak

e 
it 

ac
ce

ss
ib

le
, m

ak
e 

it 
w

el
co

m
in

g,
 a

nd
 h

op
ef

ul
ly

 th
at

 
w

ou
ld

 a
pp

ea
l t

o 
an

yo
ne

 

C
 P

ro
ce

ss
 

Th
er

e 
ar

e 
tw

o 
m

ai
n 

w
ay

s t
o 

bu
y 

an
 e

di
tio

n 
at

 th
e 

H
ou

se
 o

f 
Ph

ot
og

ra
ph

y:
 w

ith
 M

ic
ha

el
 K

le
in

-R
ei

tz
en

st
ei

n 
in

 th
e 

ph
ot

o 
bo

ok
st

or
e,

 o
r p

eo
pl

e 
ca

n 
co

nt
ac

t h
im

 b
y 

m
ai

l o
r o

n 
th

e 
ph

on
e 

an
d 

th
e 

sa
le

 w
ill

 b
e 

ar
ra

ng
ed

. 

“B
ut

 th
es

e 
pe

op
le

 w
ho

 a
re

 b
uy

in
g 

ar
t, 

I t
hi

nk
 th

ey
 o

fte
n,

 I 
of

te
n 

ge
t 

e-
m

ai
ls.

 A
nd

 n
ot

 so
 o

fte
n 

th
at

 p
eo

pl
e 

co
m

e 
he

re
 in

 th
e 

bo
ok

st
or

e 
an

d 
sa

y 
ok

ay
 I 

w
an

t t
o 

bu
y 

th
is

 E
di

tio
n.

” 

W
he

n 
pe

op
le

 w
al

k 
in

 a
t F

oa
m

 E
di

tio
ns

 th
ey

 n
or

m
al

ly
 w

al
k 

ar
ou

nd
, s

ee
 th

e 
ed

iti
on

s. 
Th

en
 p

eo
pl

e 
as

k 
qu

es
tio

ns
 to

 th
e 

st
af

f t
he

re
. I

f t
he

y 
bu

y 
a 

w
or

k 
th

ey
 h

av
e 

co
nt

ac
t w

ith
 th

e 
st

af
f o

f e
di

tio
ns

, a
nd

 th
ey

 p
ay

 th
er

e 
an

d 
re

ce
iv

e 
an

 in
vo

ic
e.

 
N

or
m

al
ly

 th
e 

w
or

k 
st

ill
 h

as
 to

 b
e 

pr
od

uc
ed

, s
o 

w
he

n 
th

e 
w

or
k 

is
 re

ad
y 

th
e 

cl
ie

nt
 c

an
 c

om
e 

an
d 

pi
ck

 it
 u

p 
la

te
r a

t 
Fo

am
 E

di
tio

ns
 a

nd
 th

ey
 w

ill
 re

ce
iv

e 
th

e 
ce

rti
fic

at
e.

 
A

dd
iti

on
al

ly
 p

eo
pl

e 
ca

n 
or

de
r t

he
 w

or
k 

on
lin

e 
by

 th
e 

w
eb

 
sh

op
, a

nd
 th

en
 th

ey
 c

an
 p

ic
k 

up
 th

e 
w

or
k 

la
te

r, 
or

 re
ce

iv
e 

it 
by

 m
ai

l. 
 

“I
k 

he
b 

m
ee

st
al

 d
in

ge
n 

ni
et

 o
p 

vo
or

ra
ad

, d
us

 a
ls 

ze
 k

op
en

 
da

n 
m

aa
k 

ik
 e

en
 fa

ct
uu

r e
n 

ge
ef

 ik
 h

et
 c

er
tif

ic
aa

t e
rb

ij,
 o

f 
da

t k
om

t l
at

er
, d

at
 li

gt
 e

r e
en

 b
ee

tje
 a

an
.”

   
 

“D
us

 ik
 d

en
k 

én
 e

en
 p

ro
du

ct
 m

aa
r o

ok
 d

e 
se

rv
ic

e 
va

n 
ee

n 
br

ug
 sl

aa
n 

tu
ss

en
 d

e 
ve

rz
am

el
aa

r e
n 

ee
n 

ga
le

rie
. D

us
 d

at
 z

e 
bi

jv
oo

rb
ee

ld
 b

ij 
ee

n 
ga

le
rie

 d
at

 so
or

t v
ra

ge
n 

m
is

sc
hi

en
 n

og
 

ni
et

 d
ur

ve
n 

((t
e 

st
el

le
n)

). 
O

f z
e 

w
et

en
 g

ew
oo

n 
ni

et
 w

at
 z

e 
da

ar
, w

at
 z

e 
m

oe
te

n 
do

en
 a

ls 
ze

 b
ij 

ee
n 

ga
le

rie
 

bi
nn

en
ko

m
en

. D
us

 a
ls 

ee
n 

so
or

t v
an

 e
er

st
e 

pl
ek

 o
m

 g
ra

tis
, 

m
is

sc
hi

en
 w

el
, v

rij
bl

ijv
en

d 
in

fo
rm

at
ie

 te
 v

er
kr

ijg
en

 o
ve

r 
ve

rz
am

el
en

 v
an

 fo
to

gr
af

ie
. D

at
 is

 d
en

k 
ik

 e
ig

en
lij

k 
w

el
 d

e 

Th
ey

 e
xp

er
ie

nc
e 

th
at

 in
te

re
st

ed
 p

eo
pl

e 
m

os
t o

f t
he

 ti
m

e 
di

d 
so

m
e 

re
se

ar
ch

 b
ef

or
e 

an
d 

ap
pr

oa
ch

 th
em

, i
n 

th
e 

ga
lle

ry
 o

r 
th

ey
 c

al
l t

he
m

. T
he

n 
th

ey
 g

iv
e 

pa
ra

m
et

er
s w

ha
t t

he
y 

ar
e 

lo
ok

in
g 

fo
r. 

Th
e 

st
af

f t
rie

s t
o 

an
tic

ip
at

e 
on

 th
at

 b
y 

sh
ow

in
g 

di
ffe

re
nt

 p
or

tfo
lio

s o
f w

ha
t t

he
y 

ha
ve

 to
 o

ffe
r. 

Fu
rth

er
m

or
e 

B
ar

ne
tt 

ex
pl

ai
ns

 th
at

 th
ey

 a
re

 th
er

e 
to

 g
iv

e 
ad

vi
ce

 a
nd

 
pr

ov
id

e 
in

fo
rm

at
io

n 
on

 th
e 

ph
ot

og
ra

ph
y 

m
ar

ke
t a

s a
 w

ho
le

, 
th

ey
 w

an
t t

o 
gi

ve
 th

ei
r v

is
ito

rs
 re

al
ly

 o
bj

ec
tiv

e 
in

fo
rm

at
io

n 
if 

th
ey

 a
sk

 fo
r t

ha
t. 

 “W
ha

t w
e 

do
 is

 g
iv

e 
pe

op
le

 a
s m

uc
h 

in
fo

rm
at

io
n 

as
 p

os
si

bl
e,

 
so

 th
at

 th
ey

 c
an

 m
ak

e 
th

ei
r o

w
n 

ch
oi

ce
s.”
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2 

 



 

se
rv

ic
e.

” 
   

6 
Sy

ne
rg

y 
Th

e 
H

ou
se

 o
f P

ho
to

gr
ap

hy
 tr

ie
s t

o 
sy

ne
rg

iz
e 

w
ha

t t
he

y 
do

, o
ve

ra
ll 

th
ey

 w
an

t t
o 

of
fe

r d
iff

er
en

t a
ct

iv
iti

es
 o

f h
ig

h 
qu

al
ity

 th
at

 a
ll 

ha
ve

 
so

m
et

hi
ng

 to
 d

o 
w

ith
 th

e 
m

ed
iu

m
 p

ho
to

gr
ap

hy
. T

he
y 

do
 n

ot
 w

an
t 

to
 li

m
it 

th
at

 to
 o

nl
y 

do
 e

xh
ib

iti
on

s, 
th

ey
 w

an
t t

o 
ex

te
nd

 th
at

Th
is

 
co

nt
in

ue
s i

n 
w

ha
t K

le
in

-R
ei

tz
en

st
ei

n 
sa

ys
 a

bo
ut

 th
e 

di
ffe

re
nt

 
se

rv
ic

es
 th

ey
 o

ff
er

, e
ve

ry
th

in
g 

is
 o

rg
an

iz
ed

 to
 b

e 
of

 h
ig

h 
qu

al
ity

. 
N

ev
er

th
el

es
s t

he
 m

ar
ke

tin
g 

co
m

po
ne

nt
s o

f t
he

 e
di

tio
ns

 a
re

 n
ot

 
de

ve
lo

pe
d 

ye
t i

nt
o 

a 
sy

ne
rg

iz
ed

 a
ct

iv
ity

, a
lth

ou
gh

 th
ey

 a
re

 a
w

ar
e 

th
at

 th
at

 m
ig

ht
 b

e 
ne

ce
ss

ar
y 

to
 b

e 
m

or
e 

su
cc

es
sf

ul
.  

“…
w

ho
 h

av
e 

go
od

 p
ho

to
 e

xh
ib

iti
on

s a
nd

 a
 g

oo
d 

sh
op

 a
nd

 g
oo

d 
le

ct
ur

es
 a

nd
 th

in
gs

 li
ke

 th
is.

 […
] Y

es
, I

 th
in

k 
it 

is
 im

po
rta

nt
 to

 
ha

ve
 th

is
 h

er
e,

 a
nd

 g
oo

d 
le

ct
ur

es
, a

nd
 g

oo
d 

ed
uc

at
io

na
l w

or
k 

w
ha

t 
w

e 
do

 to
o 

fo
r a

 m
us

eu
m

.”
 

“T
ha

t y
ou

 sa
y 

lo
ok

 h
er

e,
 th

is
 is

 th
e 

m
ed

ia
, a

nd
 w

ha
t c

an
 y

ou
 d

o 
w

ith
 th

e 
m

ed
ia

. S
o 

w
he

n 
I s

ho
w

 e
xh

ib
iti

on
s, 

fo
r m

e 
it 

is
 a

bs
ol

ut
el

y 
im

po
rta

nt
 n

ot
 to

 sh
ow

 th
e 

su
bj

ec
ts

, f
or

 m
e 

it 
is

 im
po

rta
nt

 to
 sh

ow
 

th
e 

ob
je

ct
s o

f p
ho

to
gr

ap
hy

. [
…

] A
nd

 th
is

 is
 so

m
et

hi
ng

 th
at

 is
 v

er
y 

im
po

rta
nt

 fo
r m

e,
 a

nd
 if

 p
eo

pl
e 

re
co

gn
iz

e 
th

is
 a

nd
 a

sk
 th

is,
 th

en
 I 

am
 v

er
y 

ha
pp

y 
th

at
 th

ey
 d

o 
th

is.
” 

“I
 th

in
k 

if 
yo

u 
w

an
t t

o 
bu

y 
so

m
e 

of
 th

e 
ed

iti
on

s, 
yo

u 
ne

ed
 a

 sp
ec

ia
l 

pr
ev

ie
w

, s
pe

ci
al

 p
eo

pl
e,

 a
nd

 fo
r t

he
 re

st
 o

f t
he

 e
xh

ib
iti

on
, t

he
 

w
ho

le
 v

is
ito

rs
 c

ou
ld

 se
e 

an
d 

th
en

 it
 h

ap
pe

ne
d 

so
m

et
im

es
. I

 th
in

k 
it 

do
es

 n
ot

 h
ap

pe
n 

if 
yo

u 
pu

t o
nl

y 
th

e 
pi

ct
ur

e 
on

 th
e 

w
al

l.”
 

It 
is

 c
le

ar
 th

at
 th

ey
 tr

y 
to

 sy
ne

rg
iz

e 
th

e 
el

em
en

ts
 o

f t
he

 
ph

ys
ic

al
 e

nv
iro

nm
en

t, 
th

e 
pr

oc
es

s, 
th

e 
pe

op
le

, t
he

 p
ro

du
ct

 
an

d 
pr

ic
e.

 E
ve

ry
th

in
g 

is
 a

dj
us

te
d 

to
 o

ffe
r t

he
 se

rv
ic

e 
of

 
ga

in
in

g 
in

fo
rm

at
io

n 
on

 c
ol

le
ct

in
g 

ph
ot

og
ra

ph
y 

at
 a

 lo
w

 
en

try
 le

ve
l, 

an
d 

to
 m

ak
e 

it 
po

ss
ib

le
 fo

r v
is

ito
rs

 to
 b

uy
 

ph
ot

og
ra

ph
y 

ed
iti

on
s a

t t
he

 m
us

eu
m

 a
t a

 lo
w

 e
nt

ry
 p

ric
e 

le
ve

l. 
H

ow
ev

er
 th

ey
 a

re
 re

st
ric

te
d 

to
 th

ei
r l

oc
at

io
n 

an
d 

pr
om

ot
io

n 
to

 th
e 

ac
tiv

iti
es

 o
f t

he
 m

us
eu

m
 a

s a
 w

ho
le

. I
t i

s a
 

pa
rt 

of
 e

ve
ry

th
in

g 
FO

A
M

 d
oe

s. 

“W
ij 

m
ar

ke
te

n 
he

t h
el

e 
m

us
eu
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ke

te
n 

ni
et

 
Fo

am
 E

di
tio

ns
 a

lle
en

. H
et

 z
or

gt
 d
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r d
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 d
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t l
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f p
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 c
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 p
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 p
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 m
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 d
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 c
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s p
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 c
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 p
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re
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ra
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 o
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 c
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t c
ol

le
ct

in
g,

 a
nd

 to
 b

eg
in

 w
ith

 
co

lle
ct

in
g 

ar
tw

or
k.

 B
ec

au
se

 it
 re

al
ly

 is
 a

 d
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e 

ph
ot

og
ra

ph
y 

w
or

ld
, w

he
re

 th
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 m
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 d
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at
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 c
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 c
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t a
ct

iv
e,

 to
 b

uy
 

ed
iti

on
s a

nd
 c

on
se

qu
en

tly
 to

 b
e 

im
m

er
se

d 
by

 th
e 

ex
pe

rie
nc

e 
of

 
be

in
g 

a 
co

lle
ct

or
 o

f a
rt,

 a
nd

 e
xp

er
ie

nc
e 

th
e 

ar
tw

or
k 

at
 h

om
e.

 

“B
ut

 it
 w

ou
ld

 b
e 

gr
ea

t t
o 

ha
ve

 e
di

tio
ns

 in
 th

e 
m

us
eu

m
 y

ou
 k

no
w

, 
be

ca
us

e 
a 

lo
t o

f p
eo

pl
e 

se
e 

th
e 

ex
hi

bi
tio

n 
an

d 
m

ay
be

 th
ey

 c
an

 li
ve

 
th

e 
ex

pe
rie

nc
e 

of
 th

e 
ex

hi
bi

tio
n 

a 
lit

tle
 b

it 
at

 h
om

e.
 […

] …
 th

at
 

yo
u 

ex
pe

rie
nc

e 
ar

t a
t h

om
e 

th
at

 it
 g

et
s f

ur
th

er
 th

en
 th

e 
m

us
eu

m
.”

 

Fo
am

 E
di

tio
ns

 tr
ie

s t
o 

sti
m

ul
at

e 
th

e 
es

ca
pi

st 
ex

pe
rie

nc
e 

w
ith

 
th

is
 a

ct
iv

ity
 th

at
 p

eo
pl

e 
re

al
iz

e 
yo

u 
ca

nn
ot

 o
nl

y 
w

at
ch

 a
rt,

 
bu

t y
ou

 c
an

 a
ct

ua
lly

 b
uy

 it
 a

nd
 ta

ke
 it

 h
om

e 
w

ith
 y

ou
. F

oa
m

 
Ed

iti
on

s o
ffe

rs
 th

e 
po

ss
ib

ili
ty

 fo
r t

he
 v

is
ito

r t
o 

pa
rti

ci
pa

te
 

ac
tiv

el
y 

an
d 

be
 im

m
er

se
d 

by
 th

e 
ex

pe
rie

nc
e 

by
 a

ct
ua

lly
 

bu
yi

ng
 a

rtw
or

ks
, a

nd
 a

ct
 a

s a
 c

ol
le

ct
or

 o
f a

rt.
 

“J
a,

 ik
 d

en
k 

oo
k 

ee
n 

stu
kj

e,
 te

n 
ee

rs
te

 z
ie

n 
da

t h
et

 g
ew

oo
n 

te
 

ko
op

 is
, d

us
 e

ch
t g

ew
oo

n 
pu

ur
 v

oo
r d

e 
ve

rk
oo

p.
 […

] E
n 

he
t 

is
 o

ok
 e

en
 st

uk
je

 b
ew

us
t m

ak
en

, b
ew

us
t w

or
de

n 
va

n,
 d

at
 je

 
fo

to
gr

af
ie

 k
an

 k
op

en
, e

n 
da

t h
et

 g
ee

n 
po

st
er

 is
.”

   
 

Pr
in

t S
al

es
 tr

ie
s t

o 
of

fe
r t

he
 o

pp
or

tu
ni

ty
 fo

r t
he

ir 
vi

si
to

rs
 to

 
st

ar
t c

ol
le

ct
in

g.
 B

ec
au

se
 it

 is
 lo

ca
te

d 
w

ith
in

 a
 p

ub
lic

 
in

sti
tu

tio
n 

m
an

y 
pe

op
le

 w
al

k 
in

 th
at

 n
or

m
al

ly
 w

ou
ld

 n
ot

 
ha

ve
 g

on
e 

to
 a

 c
om

m
er

ci
al

 g
al

le
ry

 sp
ac

e.
 T

he
y 

w
an

t t
o 

cr
ea

te
 a

n 
ex

pe
rie

nc
e 

w
ith

 P
rin

t S
al

es
, w

he
re

in
 p

eo
pl

e 
fe

el
 

em
po

w
er

ed
 to

 c
on

sid
er

 b
uy

in
g 

ph
ot

og
ra

ph
y 

an
d 

ha
ve

 it
 a

t 
ho

m
e.

 

“A
nd

 I 
th

in
k 

w
ha

t i
t o

ffe
rs

 is
 th

e 
op

po
rtu

ni
ty

 to
 e

ng
ag

e 
at

 a
 

co
lle

ct
in

g 
le

ve
l w

he
th

er
 y

ou
 a

re
 in

 a
 p

os
iti

on
 to

 b
uy

 o
r n

ot
. 

To
 fe

el
 e

m
po

w
er

ed
, a

nd
 to

 fe
el

 a
 se

ns
e 

of
 h

ow
 it

 is
 to

 b
e 

an
 

ar
t c

ol
le

ct
or

. A
nd

 th
at

 it
 g

iv
es

 th
em

 th
e 

op
po

rtu
ni

ty
 to

 
co

ns
id

er
 it

, w
he

th
er

 th
ey

 c
an

 o
r w

he
th

er
 th

ey
 c

an
no

t. 
A

nd
 10

4 
 



 

ju
st

 n
ot

 to
 fe

el
 a

sh
am

ed
 o

f a
ny

 fi
na

nc
ia

l r
es

tri
ct

io
ns

 th
at

 th
ey

 
m

ay
 h

av
e.

” 

D
 E

nt
er

ta
in

in
g 

A
s t

he
 e

di
tio

ns
 a

re
 sh

ow
n 

in
 th

e 
ex

hi
bi

tio
n 

ha
ll,

 a
nd

 n
ob

od
y 

is
 

di
re

ct
ly

 p
re

se
nt

 th
e 

au
di

en
ce

 c
an

 e
as

ily
 h

av
e 

an
 e

nt
er

ta
in

in
g 

ex
pe

rie
nc

e 
by

 a
ct

in
g 

pa
ss

iv
e,

 a
nd

 a
bs

or
b 

th
e 

en
vi

ro
nm

en
t. 

H
ow

ev
er

 th
is

 is
 p

os
si

bl
e 

fo
r t

he
 w

ho
le

 m
us

eu
m

 e
xp

er
ie

nc
e.

 T
hi

s 
en

te
rta

in
in

g 
do

m
ai

n 
co

ul
d 

be
 a

pp
ro

ac
he

d 
be

tte
r f

ro
m

 a
 h

ol
is

tic
 

vi
ew

 to
 th

e 
w

ho
le

 e
xp

er
ie

nc
e 

of
 th

e 
in

st
itu

tio
n,

 a
s i

t i
s p

re
se

nt
, b

ut
 

ed
iti

on
s i

s n
ot

 tr
yi

ng
 to

 st
im

ul
at

e 
th

is
 d

om
ai

n.
 

Fo
am

 E
di

tio
ns

 tr
ie

s t
o 

cr
ea

te
 a

n 
en

vi
ro

nm
en

t w
he

re
by

 
pe

op
le

 c
an

 ju
st

 si
t a

nd
 re

la
x.

 S
o 

pe
op

le
 c

an
 a

ct
 p

as
siv

el
y,

 
an

d 
ju

st 
si

t t
he

re
 a

nd
 re

la
x,

 a
bs

or
b 

th
e 

at
m

os
ph

er
e,

 it
 c

an
 

of
fe

r a
n 

en
te

rta
in

in
g 

ex
pe

rie
nc

e 
fo

r t
he

 v
is

ito
rs

. B
ut

 p
eo

pl
e 

ar
e 

st
im

ul
at

ed
 m

or
e 

ev
id

en
t i

n 
th

e 
ot

he
r d

om
ai

ns
 o

f t
he

 
ex

pe
rie

nc
e.

 

“M
aa

r o
ok

 e
en

 st
uk

je
 e

rv
ar

in
g 

al
s r

us
t, 

w
an

t e
r s

ta
at

 e
en

 
m

uz
ie

kj
e 

aa
n,

 e
r i

s m
oo

ie
 v

er
lic

ht
in

g,
 e

r s
ta

an
 st

oe
le

n,
 e

n 
je

 
ka

n 
aa

n 
ee

n 
la

ng
e 

ta
fe

l z
itt

en
 o

m
 b

oe
ke

n 
do

or
he

en
 te

 
bl

ad
er

en
. D

us
 h

et
 is

 o
ok

 g
ew

oo
n 

na
as

t h
et

 v
er

ko
op

 d
in

g 
oo

k 
ee

n 
st

uk
je

 e
xt

ra
 v

er
di

ep
in

g.
” 

   
 

A
t P

rin
t S

al
es

 th
e 

sta
ff 

ac
ts

 in
 a

 p
as

si
ve

 w
ay

, s
o 

th
e 

vi
si

to
rs

 
ha

ve
 to

 a
pp

ro
ac

h 
th

em
 to

 le
ar

n 
m

or
e 

on
 c

ol
le

ct
in

g.
 H

ow
ev

er
, 

pe
op

le
 m

ay
 w

al
k 

in
 a

nd
 e

xp
er

ie
nc

e 
th

e 
Pr

in
t S

al
es

 a
s 

en
te

rta
in

in
g,

 th
ey

 c
an

 a
ct

 p
as

siv
el

y 
an

d 
ab

so
rb

 w
ha

t i
s g

oi
ng

 
on

 th
er

e.
 T

he
re

 a
re

 n
o 

ob
lig

at
io

ns
 a

t P
rin

t S
al

es
. T

hi
s 

en
te

rta
in

in
g 

do
m

ai
n 

co
ul

d 
be

 a
pp

ro
ac

he
d 

be
tte

r f
ro

m
 a

 
ho

lis
tic

 v
ie

w
 to

 th
e 

w
ho

le
 e

xp
er

ie
nc

e 
of

 th
e 

in
sti

tu
tio

n,
 a

s i
t 

is
 p

re
se

nt
, b

ut
 P

rin
t S

al
es

 tr
ie

s t
o 

st
im

ul
at

e 
th

e 
ot

he
r d

om
ai

ns
 

of
 th

e 
to

ta
l m

us
eu

m
 e

xp
er

ie
nc

e.
 

“W
e 

al
lo

w
 th

em
 to

 fe
el

 a
s h

ap
py

 a
s p

os
si

bl
e,

 to
 a

sk
 

qu
es

tio
ns

, t
o 

lo
ok

 in
to

 th
e 

po
rtf

ol
io

 w
he

th
er

 th
ey

 a
re

 g
oi

ng
 to

 
bu

y 
or

 n
ot

. W
e 

w
ill

 m
ak

e 
cl

ea
r t

ha
t t

he
y,

 y
ou

 k
no

w
, t

he
re

 is
 

no
 o

bl
ig

at
io

n.
 S

o 
I t

hi
nk

 th
at

 th
e 

in
iti

al
 e

xp
er

ie
nc

e 
is

 ju
st

 to
 

fe
el

 c
om

fo
rta

bl
e.

” 

2 
M

ea
ni

ng
fu

l 
E

xp
er

ie
nc

e 
 

 
 

A
 E

na
bl

in
g 

Ed
iti

on
s m

ak
es

 it
 p

os
sib

le
 a

t t
he

 H
ou

se
 o

f P
ho

to
gr

ap
hy

 to
 b

uy
 

ed
iti

on
s a

t t
he

 m
us

eu
m

. T
hi

s i
s a

n 
ex

tra
 se

rv
ic

e 
th

at
 m

ak
es

 it
 e

as
ie

r 
to

 b
uy

 a
rt,

 b
ec

au
se

 th
ey

 d
o 

no
t h

av
e 

to
 g

o 
to

 a
 c

om
m

er
ci

al
 g

al
le

ry
. 

Th
e 

m
us

eu
m

 c
an

 o
ffe

r t
he

m
 a

t c
he

ap
 p

ric
es

 b
ec

au
se

 th
ey

 a
re

 g
ift

s 
fro

m
 th

e 
ar

tis
ts,

 a
nd

 it
 a

ut
om

at
ic

al
ly

 h
as

 th
e 

re
pu

ta
tio

n 
of

 th
e 

m
us

eu
m

. A
nd

 th
is

 c
an

 e
xp

an
d 

th
e 

ex
pe

rie
nc

e 
of

 th
e 

ex
hi

bi
tio

n 
to

 
th

e 
ho

m
e 

of
 th

e 
vi

sit
or

s. 
  

“B
ut

 it
 w

ou
ld

 b
e 

gr
ea

t t
o 

ha
ve

 e
di

tio
ns

 in
 th

e 
m

us
eu

m
 y

ou
 k

no
w

, 
be

ca
us

e 
a 

lo
t o

f p
eo

pl
e 

se
e 

th
e 

ex
hi

bi
tio

n 
an

d 
m

ay
be

 th
ey

 c
an

 li
ve

 
th

e 
ex

pe
rie

nc
e 

of
 th

e 
ex

hi
bi

tio
n 

a 
lit

tle
 b

it 
at

 h
om

e.
 A

nd
 th

is
 m

ea
ns

 
fo

r t
he

m
 th

at
 it

 is
 c

he
ap

er
 th

an
 in

 th
e 

ga
lle

ry
 a

nd
 it

 h
as

 th
e 

re
pu

ta
tio

n 
of

 th
e 

m
us

eu
m

.”
 

W
ith

 F
oa

m
 E

di
tio

ns
, t

he
 m

us
eu

m
 d

ef
in

ite
ly

 tr
ie

s t
o 

of
fe

r t
he

 
ex

tra
 se

rv
ic

e 
to

 m
ak

e 
it 

ea
si

er
 to

 b
uy

 a
rt 

fo
r i

ts
 v

is
ito

rs
. 

Lo
ca

te
d 

w
ith

in
 th

e 
m

us
eu

m
, a

 sp
ec

ia
l r

oo
m

 is
 d

es
ig

ne
d 

to
 

fu
nc

tio
n 

as
 a

 sa
le

s g
al

le
ry

, t
hi

s p
la

ce
 is

 a
cc

es
si

bl
e 

fo
r a

ll 
th

e 
vi

si
to

rs
 a

nd
 a

n 
of

fe
r i

s c
re

at
ed

 o
f a

rtw
or

ks
 th

at
 a

re
 fo

r s
al

e.
 

A
 p

er
so

n 
is

 a
lw

ay
s p

re
se

nt
 to

 a
sk

 q
ue

st
io

ns
 o

n 
th

e 
pr

oc
es

s 
of

 b
uy

in
g 

ar
t. 

So
 F

O
A

M
 a

dd
ed

 th
e 

en
ab

lin
g 

fa
ct

or
 th

e 
to

ta
l 

m
us

eu
m

 e
xp

er
ie

nc
e.

 

“N
ou

 ja
, v

oo
r d

e 
ha

nd
 li

gg
en

d 
is

 d
en

k 
ik

 d
at

 z
e 

de
 v

ol
ge

nd
e 

ke
er

 w
el

 b
ed

en
ke

n 
va

n 
‘O

h,
 ik

 g
a 

ge
w

oo
n 

vr
ag

en
 o

f j
e 

zo
’n

 
w

er
k 

oo
k 

ka
n 

ko
pe

n 
in

 e
en

 m
us

eu
m

.”
   

 

W
ith

 P
rin

t S
al

es
, t

he
 P

ho
to

gr
ap

he
rs

’ G
al

le
ry

 w
an

ts
 to

 o
ffe

r 
th

e 
ex

tra
 se

rv
ic

e 
of

 le
ar

ni
ng

 a
bo

ut
 c

ol
le

ct
in

g 
ph

ot
og

ra
ph

y 
an

d 
to

 b
e 

ab
le

 to
 c

ol
le

ct
 p

ho
to

gr
ap

hy
. T

he
 sp

ac
e 

of
 P

rin
t 

Sa
le

s w
or

ks
 a

s a
 c

om
m

er
ci

al
 g

al
le

ry
 a

nd
 th

er
ef

or
e 

pr
ov

id
es

 
th

e 
po

ss
ib

ili
ty

 to
 e

xp
er

ie
nc

e 
ho

w
 a

 c
om

m
er

ci
al

 g
al

le
ry

 
w

or
ks

. 

“A
nd

 so
, I

 th
in

k 
a 

lo
t o

f p
eo

pl
e 

th
at

 c
om

e 
in

 h
er

e 
w

ou
ld

 
ne

ve
r, 

ne
ve

r h
av

e 
ot

he
rw

is
e 

ha
d 

th
at

 e
xp

er
ie

nc
e 

of
 w

al
ki

ng
 

in
to

 a
 c

om
m

er
ci

al
 g

al
le

ry
, a

nd
 w

e 
ar

e 
in

 fa
ct

  w
or

ki
ng

 in
 

ex
ac

tly
 th

e 
sa

m
e 

w
ay

 a
s a

 c
om

m
er

ci
al

 g
al

le
ry

.”
 

B
 

E
nl

ig
ht

en
in

g 
Th

e 
cu

ra
to

r e
xp

la
in

s t
ha

t h
e 

th
in

ks
 th

at
 p

eo
pl

e 
bu

y 
ed

iti
on

s 
be

ca
us

e 
th

ey
 li

ke
 it

, t
he

 li
ke

 to
 h

av
e 

th
e 

pi
ct

ur
e 

at
 th

ei
r w

al
l a

t 
ho

m
e,

 th
at

 th
at

 in
cr

ea
se

s t
he

ir 
ha

pp
in

es
s. 

B
ut

 h
e 

ex
pl

ai
ns

 th
at

 th
ei

r 
ed

iti
on

s p
ro

gr
am

 is
 n

ot
 su

cc
es

sf
ul

 in
 o

ffe
rin

g 
im

ag
es

 th
at

 p
eo

pl
e 

lik
e,

 m
os

t o
f t

he
 ti

m
e 

pe
op

le
 a

re
 d

is
ap

po
in

te
d 

by
 th

e 
of

fe
r o

f t
he

 
ed

iti
on

s. 
So

 h
e 

ex
pl

ai
ns

, t
ha

t t
hi

s w
or

ks
 b

et
te

r f
or

 p
os

te
rs

, a
nd

 n
ot

 
fo

r o
rig

in
al

 a
rtw

or
ks

. 

“I
 th

in
k 

pe
op

le
 b

uy
 e

di
tio

ns
 b

ec
au

se
 th

ey
 th

in
k 

I l
ik

e 
th

is 
im

ag
e,

 it
 

is
 a

n 
ar

tw
or

k 
bu

t i
t d

oe
s n

ot
 c

os
ts

 so
 m

uc
h,

 b
ut

 it
 is

 n
ot

 a
n 

FO
A

M
 is

 tr
yi

ng
 to

 in
sp

ire
 th

e 
vi

sit
or

s w
ith

 F
oa

m
 E

di
tio

ns
 to

 
st

ar
t c

ol
le

ct
in

g 
ph

ot
og

ra
ph

y.
 T

he
y 

or
ga

ni
ze

 a
ct

iv
iti

es
 a

nd
 

w
or

k 
to

ge
th

er
 w

ith
 o

th
er

 o
rg

an
iz

at
io

ns
 to

 st
im

ul
at

e 
aw

ar
en

es
s  

w
ith

in
 th

ei
r a

ud
ie

nc
e.

  S
o 

th
ey

 tr
y 

to
 st

im
ul

at
e 

ac
tiv

e 
pa

rti
ci

pa
tio

n 
of

 th
ei

r a
ud

ie
nc

e,
 to

 fe
el

 in
vo

lv
ed

 w
ith

 
ph

ot
og

ra
ph

y,
 a

nd
 th

at
 th

ey
 st

ar
t b

uy
in

g 
ar

t, 
be

ca
us

e 
th

ey
 

be
lie

ve
 it

 a
dd

s s
om

et
hi

ng
 to

 th
ei

r l
ife

, t
ha

t i
t i

nc
re

as
es

 th
ei

r 
im

m
at

er
ia

l h
ap

pi
ne

ss
. 

“W
ee

t j
e,

 d
at

 so
or

t d
in

ge
n,

 d
at

 is
 w

el
 e

ch
t e

en
 o

nd
er

de
el

, d
at

 
is

 w
el

 e
ch

t b
et

ek
en

is 
en

 b
el

ev
in

g 
na

ar
 a

an
le

id
in

g 
va

n 
zo

’n
 

Pr
in

t S
al

es
 w

an
ts

 to
 o

ffe
r t

he
 o

pp
or

tu
ni

ty
 fo

r p
eo

pl
e 

to
 h

av
e 

ph
ot

og
ra

ph
y 

at
 h

om
e.

 T
he

y 
ar

e 
co

nv
in

ce
d 

th
at

 h
av

in
g 

a 
w

or
k 

at
 h

om
e 

th
at

 y
ou

 c
an

 g
lo

rif
y 

ev
er

y 
da

y,
 c

an
 b

e 
re

al
ly

 
re

w
ar

di
ng

. E
sp

ec
ia

lly
 in

 th
es

e 
un

sta
bl

e 
fin

an
ci

al
 ti

m
es

, t
he

y 
ca

nn
ot

 g
ua

ra
nt

ee
 th

at
 th

e 
pr

ic
es

 g
o 

up
, b

ut
 m

os
t o

f t
he

 ti
m

e 
th

er
e 

pr
ic

es
 a

re
 st

ab
le

, s
o 

th
ey

 c
an

 b
e 

st
ab

le
 in

ve
st

m
en

ts 
th

at
 

ca
n 

in
cr

ea
se

 h
ap

pi
ne

ss
. 

“A
nd

 th
at

 c
an

 b
e 

re
al

ly
 re

w
ar

di
ng

, b
ec

au
se

 y
ou

 g
et

 to
 e

nj
oy

 
it 

an
d 

yo
u 

fe
el

 li
ke

 y
ou

 h
av

e 
m

ad
e 

a 
sa

ve
 in

ve
st

m
en

t.”
 

10
5 

 



 

in
ve

st
m

en
t.”

 

“I
t d

oe
s n

ot
 w

or
k 

in
 th

is
 w

ay
, b

ec
au

se
 so

m
et

im
es

 y
ou

 u
nd

er
st

an
d 

w
hy

 a
 p

ic
tu

re
 in

 a
n 

ex
hi

bi
tio

n 
is

 a
 v

er
y 

im
po

rta
nt

 p
rin

t, 
be

ca
us

e 
a 

lo
t o

f p
eo

pl
e 

lik
e 

it,
 b

ut
 it

 is
 n

ot
 p

os
sib

le
 fr

om
 th

is 
pr

in
t t

o 
m

ak
e 

an
 

ed
iti

on
. S

o,
 th

e 
w

ay
 fr

om
 th

e 
in

ne
r c

irc
le

 o
f t

he
 e

xh
ib

iti
on

 to
 th

e 
sp

ec
ia

l r
oo

m
 w

he
re

 y
ou

 c
an

 se
e 

th
e 

pi
ct

ur
e,

 d
is

ap
po

in
tm

en
ts 

ha
pp

en
, a

 lo
t o

f d
is

ap
po

in
tm

en
ts

 ‘I
 th

in
k 

it 
is 

be
tte

r t
o 

bu
y 

a 
ca

ta
lo

gu
e.

’. 
W

he
n 

yo
u 

se
e 

w
ha

t w
e 

ar
e 

do
in

g 
a 

lo
t, 

is
 sp

ec
ia

l 
po

st
er

s o
f v

er
y 

im
po

rta
nt

 w
or

ks
, b

ut
 th

is 
co

st
s o

nl
y 

€1
0,

 - 
eu

ro
s, 

bu
t t

hi
s i

s m
er

ch
an

di
zi

ng
.”

 

Fo
am

 E
di

tio
ns

.”
   

 

“…
da

t i
s c

ul
tu

ur
 e

n 
fo

to
gr

af
ie

. G
ew

oo
n 

da
t d

at
 b

el
an

gr
ijk

 is
 

en
 d

at
 je

 d
aa

r g
ew

oo
n 

ee
n 

st
ap

je
 e

xt
ra

 v
oo

r m
oe

t z
et

te
n,

 d
at

 
ho

or
t e

r o
ok

 w
el

 b
ij.

” 
   

C
 E

ng
ag

in
g 

A
s t

he
 b

oo
ks

ho
p 

ow
ne

r e
xp

la
in

s, 
th

ey
 h

av
e 

a 
cl

ie
nt

 g
ro

up
s t

ha
t a

re
 

m
or

e 
in

vo
lv

ed
 w

ith
 th

e 
m

us
eu

m
, l

ik
e 

th
e 

Fr
ie

nd
s o

f t
he

 H
ou

se
 o

f 
Ph

ot
og

ra
ph

y,
 a

nd
 re

gu
la

r c
us

to
m

er
s f

or
 th

e 
bo

ok
sh

op
. H

e 
ke

ep
s 

co
nt

ac
ts

 w
ith

 th
em

, a
nd

 fi
nd

s p
er

so
na

l c
on

ta
ct

 im
po

rta
nt

. 
Fu

rth
er

m
or

e 
th

e 
cu

ra
to

r e
xp

la
in

s t
ha

t t
he

y 
w

ou
ld

 b
e 

m
os

t 
su

cc
es

sf
ul

 if
 th

ey
 d

ev
el

op
ed

 m
or

e 
sp

ec
ia

l e
ve

nt
s f

or
 c

lie
nt

 g
ro

up
s, 

th
at

 th
ey

 w
ou

ld
 m

e 
m

or
e 

in
vo

lv
ed

, h
av

e 
m

or
e 

en
ga

gi
ng

 
ex

pe
rie

nc
es

. 

“I
 th

in
k 

if 
yo

u 
w

an
t t

o 
bu

y 
so

m
e 

of
 th

e 
ed

iti
on

s, 
yo

u 
ne

ed
 a

 sp
ec

ia
l 

pr
ev

ie
w

, s
pe

ci
al

 p
eo

pl
e,

 a
nd

 fo
r t

he
 re

st
 o

f t
he

 e
xh

ib
iti

on
, t

he
 

w
ho

le
 v

is
ito

rs
 c

ou
ld

 se
e 

an
d 

th
en

 it
 h

ap
pe

ne
d 

so
m

et
im

es
. I

 th
in

k 
it 

do
es

 n
ot

 h
ap

pe
n 

if 
yo

u 
pu

t o
nl

y 
th

e 
pi

ct
ur

e 
on

 th
e 

w
al

l. 
I t

hi
nk

 y
ou

 
ne

ed
 th

e 
co

nv
er

sa
tio

n.
..”

 

“A
nd

 th
es

e 
ar

e 
th

e 
co

lle
ct

or
s a

nd
 th

is
 is

 v
er

y 
go

od
 w

he
n 

yo
u 

ha
ve

 
pe

rs
on

al
 c

on
ta

ct
.”

 

W
ha

t a
pp

ea
rs

 fr
om

 th
e 

in
te

rv
ie

w
 is

 th
at

 F
O

A
M

 tr
ie

s t
o 

en
ga

ge
 th

e 
vi

sit
or

s m
or

e 
w

ith
 p

ho
to

gr
ap

hy
 a

nd
 w

ith
 th

e 
or

ga
ni

za
tio

n 
FO

A
M

 w
ith

 th
is

 e
xt

ra
 se

rv
ic

e 
of

 F
oa

m
 

Ed
iti

on
s. 

Th
e 

m
is

si
on

 o
f F

O
A

M
 is

 d
es

cr
ib

ed
 a

s ‘
A

ll 
ab

ou
t 

ph
ot

og
ra

ph
y’

, t
he

re
fo

re
 th

ey
 tr

y 
to

 e
ng

ag
e 

th
e 

pe
op

le
 w

ith
 

th
ei

r o
ffe

r m
or

e 
w

ith
 p

ho
to

gr
ap

hy
. A

nd
 th

ey
 e

xp
la

in
 th

at
 

pe
op

le
 a

re
 m

ot
iv

at
ed

 to
 e

ng
ag

e 
w

ith
 F

oa
m

 E
di

tio
ns

 to
 

be
co

m
e 

pa
rt 

of
 th

e 
ph

ot
og

ra
ph

y 
w

or
ld

, t
o 

fe
el

 in
cl

ud
ed

. 
Fo

am
 E

di
tio

ns
 a

nt
ic

ip
at

es
 o

n 
th

is
 b

y 
or

ga
ni

zi
ng

 c
ou

rs
es

 a
nd

 
ev

en
ts

 w
he

re
 p

eo
pl

e 
w

ith
 th

e 
sa

m
e 

in
te

re
st

 c
an

 m
ee

t a
nd

 
en

ga
ge

 w
ith

 b
ot

h 
FO

A
M

 a
nd

 th
e 

ph
ot

og
ra

ph
y 

w
or

ld
. 

“M
aa

r g
ew

oo
n 

om
da

t z
e 

he
t l

eu
k 

vi
nd

en
 o

m
 e

r o
nd

er
de

el
 

va
n 

ui
t t

e 
m

ak
en

 v
an

 d
ie

 h
el

e 
w

er
el

d.
 D

at
 z

e 
da

ar
om

 
bi

jv
oo

rb
ee

ld
 o

ok
 d

e 
cu

rs
us

 v
ol

ge
n.

 […
] D

us
 ju

ist
 o

ok
 

on
de

rd
ee

l z
ijn

 v
an

 z
o’

n 
gr

oe
p 

is
 d

en
k 

ik
 o

ok
 w

el
 w

at
 

m
en

se
n 

le
uk

 v
in

de
n.

 G
ew

oo
n 

fo
to

gr
af

ie
-li

ef
he

bb
er

s i
n 

he
t 

al
ge

m
ee

n 
ze

g 
m

aa
r. 

[…
] G

ew
oo

n 
ne

t a
ct

ie
ve

re
 d

ee
ln

am
e 

w
an

t i
em

an
d,

 z
o 

ie
m

an
d,

 v
oe

lt 
zi

ch
 d

an
 o

ok
 n

og
 m

ee
r 

be
tro

kk
en

 b
ij 

FO
A

M
.”

   
 

Pr
in

t S
al

es
 tr

ie
s t

o 
en

ga
ge

 p
eo

pl
e 

w
ith

 c
ol

le
ct

in
g.

 A
nd

 th
ey

 
ar

e 
lo

ok
in

g 
fo

r o
pp

or
tu

ni
tie

s t
o 

gi
ve

 p
eo

pl
e 

th
e 

ex
pe

rie
nc

e 
to

 
fe

el
 in

cl
ud

ed
 a

nd
 to

 fe
el

 m
or

e 
in

vo
lv

ed
 w

ith
 th

e 
Ph

ot
og

ra
ph

er
s’

 G
al

le
ry

. T
he

y 
or

ga
ni

ze
 e

ve
nt

s f
or

 th
es

e 
cl

ie
nt

s t
ha

t g
iv

e 
th

em
 a

n 
ex

pe
rie

nc
e 

by
 w

hi
ch

 th
ey

 fe
el

 
in

cl
ud

ed
. 

“…
w

an
te

d 
to

 e
ng

ag
e 

an
d 

ne
ed

ed
 m

or
e 

ex
pe

rie
nc

e,
 a

 m
or

e 
im

m
er

si
ve

 e
xp

er
ie

nc
e 

in
 th

e 
ga

lle
ry

. A
nd

 w
e 

ga
ve

 th
em

 a
 

w
ay

 o
f m

ee
tin

g 
so

m
e 

of
 th

e 
ot

he
r p

eo
pl

e 
in

 th
e 

ga
lle

ry
, o

ur
 

co
lle

ag
ue

s, 
ot

he
r c

ol
le

ct
or

s, 
th

e 
di

re
ct

or
, a

nd
 ju

st 
ha

vi
ng

 a
 

so
rt 

of
 a

n 
in

tim
at

e 
ex

pe
rie

nc
e 

at
 th

e 
ga

lle
ry

 re
al

ly
 e

xc
ite

s 
th

em
, a

nd
 it

 m
ak

es
 th

em
 fe

el
 in

cl
ud

ed
.”

 

“A
nd

 I 
th

in
k 

w
ha

t i
t o

ffe
rs

 is
 th

e 
op

po
rtu

ni
ty

 to
 e

ng
ag

e 
at

 a
 

co
lle

ct
in

g 
le

ve
l w

he
th

er
 y

ou
 a

re
 in

 a
 p

os
iti

on
 to

 b
uy

 o
r n

ot
 .”

 

“W
e 

ha
ve

 h
ad

 se
ve

ra
l p

eo
pl

e 
an

d 
w

e 
ar

e 
try

in
g 

to
 e

ng
ag

e 
th

em
 a

t a
ll 

di
ffe

re
nt

 a
sp

ec
ts 

of
 th

e 
ga

lle
ry

. A
nd

 if
 w

e 
kn

ow
 

th
at

 th
ey

 a
re

 e
xc

ite
d 

an
d 

th
ey

 w
an

t t
o 

en
ga

ge
 a

nd
 th

ey
 n

ee
d 

a 
so

rt 
of

 w
ay

 in
, w

e 
he

re
 in

 P
rin

t S
al

es
, w

e 
fin

d 
di

ffe
re

nt
 

op
po

rtu
ni

tie
s f

or
 th

em
.”

 

D
 E

du
ca

tio
na

l 
Th

is
 is

 a
lre

ad
y 

ex
pl

ai
ne

d 
in

 th
e 

ed
uc

at
io

na
l d

om
ai

n 
of

 th
e 

to
ta

l 
m

us
eu

m
 e

xp
er

ie
nc

e.
 

Th
is

 is
 a

lre
ad

y 
ex

pl
ai

ne
d 

in
 th

e 
ed

uc
at

io
na

l d
om

ai
n 

of
 th

e 
to

ta
l m

us
eu

m
 e

xp
er

ie
nc

e.
. 

Th
is

 is
 a

lre
ad

y 
ex

pl
ai

ne
d 

in
 th

e 
ed

uc
at

io
na

l d
om

ai
n 

of
 th

e 
to

ta
l m

us
eu

m
 e

xp
er

ie
nc

e.
 

    

10
6 

 



 E 
In

di
vi

du
al

 L
ik

er
t –

 s
ca

le
 it

em
s 

  
 

1 
- I

TE
M

 R
EL

A
TE

D
 T

O
 P

R
O

D
U

C
T:

 P
H

O
TO

G
R

A
PH

Y
 E

D
IT

IO
N

S,
 o

w
n 

el
ab

or
at

io
n 

 
2 

- I
TE

M
 R

EL
A

TE
D

 T
O

 P
R

O
D

U
C

T:
 Y

O
U

N
G

, N
EW

 T
A

LE
N

T,
 o

w
n 

el
ab

or
at

io
n 

  
 

3 
– 

IT
EM

 R
EL

A
TE

D
 T

O
 P

R
O

D
U

C
T:

 R
EL

A
TE

D
 T

O
 E

X
H

IB
IT

IO
N

S,
 o

w
n 

el
ab

or
at

io
n 

 
4 

- I
TE

M
 R

EL
A

TE
D

 T
O

 P
R

IC
E:

 B
EL

O
W

 €
7.

00
0,

-, 
ow

n 
el

ab
or

at
io

n 

10
7 

 



 

 
 

5-
 IT

EM
 R

EL
A

TE
D

 T
O

 P
LA

C
E:

 S
EP

A
R

A
TE

 R
O

O
M

, o
w

n 
el

ab
or

at
io

n 
 

 
6 

- I
TE

M
 R

EL
A

TE
D

 T
O

 P
LA

C
E:

 W
IT

H
IN

 T
H

E 
M

U
SE

U
M

, o
w

n 
el

ab
or

at
io

n 

 
 

 7 
– 

IT
EM

 R
EL

A
TE

D
 T

O
 P

LA
C

E:
 P

R
O

M
IN

EN
T 

LO
C

A
TI

O
N

, o
w

n 
el

ab
or

at
io

n 
 

8 
- I

TE
M

 R
EL

A
TE

D
 T

O
 P

R
O

M
O

TI
O

N
: I

N
D

EP
EN

D
EN

T 
PR

O
M

O
TI

O
N

, o
w

n 
el

ab
or

at
io

n 

10
8 

 



 

 
 

9 
- I

TE
M

 R
EL

A
TE

D
 T

O
 P

EO
PL

E:
 E

X
PE

R
T 

A
D

V
IC

E,
 o

w
n 

el
ab

or
at

io
n 

 
 

10
 - 

IT
EM

 R
EL

A
TE

D
 T

O
 P

EO
PL

E:
 IN

TE
R

A
C

T 
O

TH
ER

 V
IS

IT
O

R
S,

 o
w

n 
el

ab
or

at
io

n 

 
 

11
 –

 IT
EM

 R
EL

A
TE

D
 T

O
 P

H
Y

SI
C

A
L 

EN
V

IR
O

N
M

EN
T:

 C
O

M
FO

R
TA

B
LE

, o
w

n 
el

ab
or

at
io

n 
12

 –
 IT

EM
 R

EL
A

TE
D

 T
O

 P
H

Y
SI

C
A

L 
EN

V
IR

O
N

M
EN

T:
 P

ER
M

A
N

EN
T 

LO
C

A
TI

O
N

, o
w

n 
el

ab
or

at
io

n 

10
9 

 



 

 
 

13
 - 

IT
EM

 R
EL

A
TE

D
 T

O
 P

R
O

C
ES

S:
 B

U
Y

 P
H

O
TO

G
R

A
PH

Y
, o

w
n 

el
ab

or
at

io
n 

 
14

 - 
IT

EM
 R

EL
A

TE
D

 T
O

 P
R

O
C

ES
S:

 T
A

LK
 A

B
O

U
T 

B
U

Y
IN

G
 P

H
O

TO
G

R
A

PH
Y

, o
w

n 
el

ab
or

at
io

n 

 
 

15
 –

 IT
EM

 R
EL

A
TE

D
 T

O
 E

N
A

B
LI

N
G

:  
A

D
D

IT
IO

N
A

L 
EX

PE
R

IE
N

C
E,

 o
w

n 
el

ab
or

at
io

n 
16

 –
 IT

EM
 R

EL
A

TE
D

 T
O

 E
N

A
B

LI
N

G
: N

EW
 E

X
PE

R
IE

N
C

E 
W

IT
H

 P
H

O
TO

G
R

A
PH

Y
, o

w
n 

el
ab

or
at

io
n 

11
0 

 



 

 
 

17
 - 

IT
EM

 R
EL

A
TE

D
 T

O
 E

D
U

C
A

TI
O

N
A

L,
 o

w
n 

el
ab

or
at

io
n 

 
 

 
 

18
 - 

IT
EM

 R
EL

A
TE

D
 T

O
 A

ES
TH

ET
IC

, o
w

n 
el

ab
or

at
io

n 

 
 

19
 –

 IT
EM

 R
EL

A
TE

D
 T

O
 E

SC
A

PI
ST

, o
w

n 
el

ab
or

at
io

n 
 

 
 

20
 –

 IT
EM

 R
EL

A
TE

D
 T

O
 E

N
TE

R
TA

IN
IN

G
, o

w
n 

el
ab

or
at

io
n 

11
1 

 



 

 
 

21
 - 

IT
EM

 R
EL

A
TE

D
 T

O
 E

N
LI

G
H

TE
N

IN
G

: I
N

SP
IR

IN
G

, o
w

n 
el

ab
or

at
io

n 
 

 
 2

2 
- I

TE
M

 R
EL

A
TE

D
 T

O
 E

N
LI

G
H

TE
N

IN
G

: I
N

C
R

EA
SE

 H
A

PP
IN

ES
S,

 o
w

n 
el

ab
or

at
io

n 

 

23
 –

 IT
EM

 R
EL

A
TE

D
 T

O
 E

N
G

A
G

IN
G

: M
O

R
E 

SO
C

IA
LL

Y
 A

N
D

 C
U

LT
U

R
A

LL
Y

 IN
V

O
LV

ED
, o

w
n 

el
ab

or
at

io
n  

11
2 

 


	Micheline Snijders 280514
	Abstract
	Acknowledgements
	Table of Contents
	1 Introduction
	2 The Museum
	2.1 Museums from a cultural economic perspective
	2.2 The photography museum
	2.3 Recent developments and challenges for museums
	2.4 Conclusions

	3 Arts Marketing
	3.1 Arts marketing strategy
	3.2 Supply strategies
	Service marketing
	Experience marketing

	3.3 Demand research
	3.4 Conclusions

	4 Objectives and Methodology
	4.1 Research approach
	4.2 Research questions
	4.3 Research strategy, design and methods
	4.4 Qualitative part
	4.5 Quantitative part
	4.6 Validity and credibility
	4.7 Possible challenges and solutions

	5 Qualitative Analysis
	5.1 Arts marketing components
	5.2 Characteristics of the total museum experience
	5.3 Arts marketing strategies
	5.4 Conclusions

	6 Quantitative Analysis
	6.1 Introduction
	6.2 Socio – demographic profile
	6.3 Opinion of the visitors
	6.4 Demographic differences
	6.5 Conclusions

	7 Conclusions
	8 Index of Figures
	9 References
	List of interviewed organizations with dates and places

	Appendices
	A Interview guide
	B Coding scheme of the interviews
	C Questionnaires FOAM and the House of Photography


	Pages from Micheline Snijders 280514

